Thurles Greyhound Stadium Sales : Saturday 31st January 2009.

TRIAL 1 RESULT:1 3 5 TIME: 30.22 DISTANCES 3 15
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

2 1 Freedom Noelle| 1.87 | Faw Ald 3000 [1900 |N

4 3 Lady Jaro 1.94 Evaw Rnon 900 |Y

5 5 Bit View Billy |1.99 | Slaw Rnon No Bid | N

TRIAL 2 RESULT : 4 6 2 TIME: 30.21 DISTANCES: 8 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

9 2 Angelo Duchess 1.96 | StdTp Rnon | 1000 600 N

1 |4 Freedom State | 1.82 | Faw Ald 2500 [ 1600 | N

12 |6 Black Crash 1.83 Evaw Outp 1000 |Y

TRIAL 3 RESULT:1 3 § TIME : 30.58 DISTANCES: 8 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

16 |1 Brady Girl 1.98 | Faw Ald 850 Y

17 |3 Isnt it Time 2.11 Slaw Fd 450 Y

20 |5 Magical Tania [ 1.96 |Faw Fd No Bid | N

TRIAL 4 RESULT: 6 4 2 TIME: 30.35 DISTANCES: 1.5 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

21 |2 Fieldbrook Lad | 1.98 | Slaw Blkd 1 350 Y

22 |4 Roo Lleyton 1.92 Faw Rnon 1250 |Y

23 |6 Boozed Holly [1.79 |Faw Ald 2000 |[1000 |N
TRIAL RESULT :5 3 1 TIME: 31.18 DISTANCES: 9 7
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

24 |1 Newby Jeff 2.00 |Faw Blkd 1 No Bid | N

25 |3 Coolamber Jude 2.03 Evaw Blkd 1 No Bid | N

26 |5 Gortkelly Chloe| 2.00 | Faw Blkd 1 250 Y

TRIAL 6 RESULT: 6 2 4 TIME: 30.37 DISTANCES:4.5 4.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

27 |2 Rackethall Tedd 2.02 Faw A 2nd 2000 | 1300 |N

28 |4 Charming Hawk| 2.12 | Slaw Fd 400 |Y




130 |6 |BoozedLulu [2.02 |Evaw Rnon | | 700 |Y
TRIAL 7 RESULT:1 3 § TIME: 30.42 DISTANCES: 4 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
31 |1 Roo Barr 1.98 Evaw Finwl 1100 |Y
32 |3 Dance Glenda | 1.90 Faw Outp 1000 350 |N
33 |5 As | Said 203 |LdBs Fd 650 |Y
TRIAL 8 RESULT:2 6 4 TIME: 31.02 DISTANCES : 6 11
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
34 |2 Sadie Blue 1.91 Ld 1 Styd 200 |Y
35 |4 Envy My Baby [1.98 |Blkd 1 Rnon No Bid | N
36 |6 Minnies Michita| 1.98 | Blkd 1 Finwl 800 |Y
TRIAL 9 RESULT:5 1 3 TIME: 30.40 DISTANCES: 2 6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
37 |1 Garryglass Graq 1.95 Ld 2 Evch 475 |Y
38 |3 Garryglass Gue{ 2.04 | Slaw Finwl 300 |Y
39 |5 River Pearl 2.12 Slaw Finwl 1250 |Y
TRIAL 10 RESULT: 4 2 6 TIME : 30.60 DISTANCES: 3 16
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
40 |2 Watch Your Mar 1.89 | Qaw Outp 750 |Y
41 |4 Flight Plan 1.85 | Faw Ald 1500 700 | N
42 |6 Ballidrum Alpha| 1.81 Faw Fd No Bid | N
TRIAL 11 RESULT:1 3 5 TIME : 30.64 DISTANCES : 3 §
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
43 |1 Pennys Problem 1.84 |Ld 1 Styd 400 |Y
4 |3 Chaz and Daz | 1.89 | Evaw Finwl No Bid | N
46 |5 Open For Tea |1.98 | Slaw Rnon 200 |Y
TRIAL 12 RESULT :6 2 4 TIME :30.52 DISTANCES 10 9




Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

49 |2 Captain Said Sg 1.93 | Slaw Rnon N

50 |4 Roskeen Gizmo| 1.98 | Blkd Bs Rnon No Bid | N

51 |6 River Pride 2.00 |Bmp 1 Finwl 1300 |Y
TRIAL 13 RESULT:5 1 3 TIME : 30.15 DISTANCES : 10 5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

52 |1 Glasheen Flash| 2.05 | Slaw Rnon 550 |Y

53 |3 Open For Dinne| 2.03 | Crd 1 Rnon No Bid | N

56 |5 Ideal Break 1.99 | Faw Ald 1450 |Y
TRIAL 14 RESULT : 4 6 2 TIME: 30.87 DISTANCES : 1.5 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

55 |2 Open on Monda] 1.96 | Slaw Rnon 200 |Y

57 |4 Connecting Call| 1.90 | Qaw Finwl 300 |Y

59 |6 Pennys Eagles | 1.80 Ld 2 Evch 375 | Y
TRIAL 15 RESULT :3 5 1 TIME : 30.06 DISTANCES : 5 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

60 |1 Mullamore Bella 1.88 Evaw Rnon 825 Y

62 |3 West Coast Eag 1.85 | Faw Rnon 2500 700 | N

63 |5 Bit View Leroy | 1.87 | Evaw Fd 650 |Y
TRIAL 16 RESULT :6 2 4 TIME :30.07 DISTANCES ;6.5 7
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

65 |2 Dans Bluey 1.89 | Faw AL 2nd 450 | Y

66 |4 Crickleow! Misty 1.96 | Slaw Fd 2400 | 1350 |N

67 |6 Catherines Eagl 1.88 | Faw Rnon N
TRIAL 17 RESULT :3 5 1 TIME: 30.52 DISTANCES : 6 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

68 |1 Roskeen Beag | 2.03 | Slaw Fd No Bid | N

69 |3 Ten Days 1.94 Faw Rnon 700 |Y

71 |5 Bricken Mason | 1.97 Evaw Stb3 975 |Y
TRIAL 18 RESULT : 6 4 2 TIME : 30.56 DISTANCES : 3.5 §



Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
72 |2 Pennys Neville | 1.98 | Faw Fd 400 |Y

74 |4 Minnies Stellino| 2.02 Evaw Rnon N

75 |6 Telex Gold 2.00 Evaw Rnon No Bid | N
TRIAL 19 RESULT:1 3 5 TIME : 30.21 DISTANCES : 10 2.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
76 |1 Sandyhill Colee( 1.92 | Evaw Rnon 1000 |Y

7 |3 Lucky Olive 1.96 | Slaw Rnon 150 |Y

78 |5 Southern Sun | 1.94 Evaw Fd 350 |Y
TRIAL 20 RESULT: 4 2 6 TIME : 30.11 DISTANCES : 5 1.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
79 |2 No Pressure 1.83 Faw Fd 800 |Y

84 |4 Obligation 1.87 | Evaw Fnwl 2000 700 | N

85 |6 Chubbys Bargai| 1.85 | Evaw AL 3rd 400 |Y
TRIAL 21 RESULT:3 1 § TIME : 30.67 DISTANCES :1 6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
88 |1 No Gamble 1.96 | Faw Fd 400 |Y

89 |3 Joekies Classic| 1.94 | Faw FnWI 600 300 |N

90 |5 Lucky Sailor 2.03 | Slaw AL 3rd 150 |Y
TRIAL 22 RESULT: 4 2 6 TIME : 29.84 DISTANCES 6.5 5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

91 |2 Pennys Manhatt 1.98 | Evaw Fd 1000 |Y

93 |4 Doggieandgabay 1.88 Faw Rnon 1300 |Y

99 |6 Bigstrongpup | 1.93 | Slaw AL 3rd | 1500 700 | N
TRIAL 23" RESULT:1 5 3 TIME: 30.15 DISTANCES: 5.5 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
97 |1 Pennys Newyork 1.87 Faw Rnon 1500 1200 |Y

100 |3 Entitled todrean 1.87 Fa Fd No Bid | N

101 |5 Westway Pride | 1.91 Evaw W4 450 | Y




TRIAL 24 RESULT : 6 4 2 TIME: 30.53 DISTANCES :1.5 2.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
103 |2 Westway Star | 1.89 |Evaw WD 1 550 |Y
105 | 4 Clear Therainbg 1.87 Evaw Blkd 3 450 |Y
107 |6 Penny Azeri 1.85 Faw Rnon 1000 450 | N

TRIAL 25 RESULT:1 5 3 TIME:30.03 DISTANCES § 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
109 |1 Namedandsham| 1.86 Faw Ald 1600 |Y

111 |3 Tarsna Firebird| 1.99 Evaw Rnon No Bid | N

112 |5 Penny Pinza 1.97 | Slaw Rnon 450 |Y
TRIAL 26 RESULT :6 4 2 TIME: 30.61 DISTANCES Sh 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
13 |2 Get The Boat | 1.78 |Faw W 2 No Bid | N

73 |4 Adamant Kim | 1.84 | Evaw Styd On 200 |Y

80 |6 No Echo 1.98 Slaw Fnwl 750 |Y
TRIAL 27 RESULT:1 3 § TIME : 18.56 DISTANCES § 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

1 1 Cant Complain Faw FnWI 1400 |Y

29 |3 Savin Straws Evaw Rnon 500 |Y

48 |5 Stride on Billy Slaw Fd No Bid | N
TRIAL 28 RESULT :6 2 4 TIME: 18.79 DISTANCES: 1.5 6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
10 |2 Rathcrea Legen Evaw Rnon 650 |Y

64 |4 Cloncunny Prem Evaw Rnon No Bid | N

83 |6 Ardavullane Gir Faw Ald 600 200 | N
TRIAL 29 Solo RESULT TIME: 31.10 DISTANCES :

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

95 |3 Gorgeous Fawn| 1.94 | Solo 800 600 | N




TRIAL 30  Solo RESULT : TIME: 30.29 DISTANCES:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
98 |3 Tore Lady 1.83 | Solo 1000 300 N
TRIAL 31 Solo RESULT : TIME : 30.56 DISTANCES:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

102 4 Brave Lady 1.95 | Solo 500 |Y




