Thurles Greyhound Stadium Sales : Saturday 18t April 2009

TRIAL 1 RESULT:1 3 5 TIME: 29.71 DISTANCES 9 4.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

1 1 Hows Your Frier 1.87 | Faw Ald 2350 |Y

2 3 Bit View Jonny [ 1.92 | Blkd 1 Rnon 400 |Y

3 5 Pretty Rachel | 1.90 Evch Nvsh No Bid | N
TRIAL 2 RESULT :6 4 2 TIME: 29.97 DISTANCES: 1.5 3.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

4 2 Raggside Magic| 2.02 | Slaw Rnon 300 Y

5 4 Bit View Melda | 2.08 |Ld 3 Blkd 4 750 Y

6 6 Moment of Time 1.97 Crd 1 Finwl 1550 |Y
TRIAL 3 RESULT:1 3 § TIME : 30.04 DISTANCES: 2 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

7 1 Boherna Give U| 2.04 Slaw Finwl 1400 |Y

8 3 Dance Sue 1.92 Faw Evch 400 |Y

9 5 Winning Saga |2.10 | Slaw Finwl 500 |Y
TRIAL 4 RESULT: 4 6 2 TIME: 29.80 DISTANCES: 3.5 Nk
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
10 |2 Clear Out 190 |Ld3 Outp 1400 |Y

11 |4 Boherna Blackig 1.89 Qaw Finwl 2500 |Y

12 |6 Bit View Ostrich 2.16 | Slaw Finwl 1200 |Y
TRIAL RESULT 5 1 3 TIME: 29.91 DISTANCES: 3.5 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
14 |1 Schofield Stella| 2.13 | Slaw Rnon 600 Y

15 |3 Roisins Sapphir|{ 1.90 Evaw Fdrn 350 Y

16 |5 Weep Alone 1.94 | Ld 1 Styd 1450 |Y
TRIAL 6 RESULT: 6 2 4 TIME: 29.90 DISTANCES:S5 4.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
17 |2 Debidee Kate |2.14 Slaw Finwl 750 Y

18 |4 Bit View Col 1.88 | Blkd 1 Nvsh No Bid | N




119 |6 | Centenarys Raz| 1.87 | Qaw Ald 1000 |Y |
TRIAL 7 RESULT:5 3 1 TIME: 29.79 DISTANCES: 5.5 5.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
20 |1 Ferdia Razl 1.90 | Evaw Nvsh 250 Y
21 |3 Philips Bond 1.85 Faw Outp N
22 |5 Of The Fiddle |1.97 | Slaw Finwl 2750 |Y
TRIAL 8 RESULT:4 2 6 TIME:29.79 DISTANCES : 10 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
23 |2 Schofield Blue | 1.91 Blkd 1 Rnon 500 Y
24 |4 Good Cruise 1.92 | Qaw Ald 3000 |Y
25 |6 Centenarys Sol¢ 1.88 | Faw Blkd 1 350 Y
TRIAL 9 RESULT: 5 1 3 TIME: 29.66 DISTANCES: 1 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
26 |1 Feet Like Boots| 1.94 Slaw Finwl 2350 |Y
27 |3 Icandobetter 1.88 | Qaw Outp 400 Y
28 |5 Micks Penny 1.80 Faw Ald 1700 |Y
TRIAL 10 RESULT: 2 4 6 TIME : 29.83 DISTANCES: 0.5 12
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
29 |2 Rackethall Trix | 2.00 Evaw Ald 1600 |Y
30 |4 Lake Shore 2.02 | Slaw Finwl 1100 |Y
31 |6 Ferdia Billy 2.30 | MisBk Nvsh No Bid | N
TRIAL 11 RESULT:1 5 3 TIME : 29.58 DISTANCES : 4 §
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
32 |5 Beech Bond 1.87 |Ld 2 Outp 800 Y
33 |1 Dance Pat 1.93 Evaw Finwl 3200 |Y
34 |3 Society Knight | 2.05 | Slaw Nvsh 600 Y
TRIAL 12 RESULT:2 4 6 TIME :29.75 DISTANCES 3.5 4.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
35 |4 Alien King 2.02 | Slaw Finwl 1200 |Y
37 |2 Gliding Cruise | 2.01 Evaw Ald 2400 |Y




138 |6 |OxerBord  |2.03 |Slaw Fdrin NoBid/N |
TRIAL 13 RESULT:3 1 § TIME : 29.93 DISTANCES : 3 3.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
39 |1 Marina Bay 2.01 Blkd 1 Rnon 850 Y
40 |3 Smooth Fawn |1.89 | Qaw Ald 1900 |Y
41 |5 Snake is Back | 2.07 | Slaw Rnon 500 200 N
TRIAL 14 RESULT : 4 6 2 TIME: 29.94 DISTANCES :5 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
42 |2 Doon Blue 1.93 Faw Fdrin 300 Y
43 |4 Clonkelly Ace |2.03 | Slaw Finwl N
45 |6 Dance Marina | 2.07 Slaw Rnon N
TRIAL 15 RESULT:1 3 § TIME : 30.19 DISTANCES : 1 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
46 |1 Stouke Ted 1.98 Faw Ald 900 Y
48 |3 Forestry Walk |[2.19 | Slaw Finwl 750 Y
49 |5 Trooper Square| 2.28 | Slaw Nvsh 300 Y
TRIAL 16 RESULT : 4 6 2 TIME : 29.96 DISTANCES ;3 1.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
50 |2 Classy Plan 1.94 | Slaw Rnon 350 Y
52 |4 Anything Atall | 2.18 | Slaw Finwl 1100 |Y
53 |6 Bawnfune Napol 1.93 Ld 3 Evch 500 Y
TRIAL 17 RESULT :3 5 1 TIME: 29.53 DISTANCES : 10 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
57 |1 Crinkill Lilly 1.89 | Evaw Rnon N
59 |3 Gortkelly Nani | 1.81 Faw Ald 1500 |Y
60 |5 Chuckys Wishes 1.83 | Qaw Outp 200 Y
TRIAL 18 RESULT :6 4 2 TIME : 29.65 DISTANCES : 4 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
61 |2 Colorado Ronan 2.05 | Slaw Rnon 300 Y
62 |4 Crinkill Prince | 1.93 |Ld 2 Outp No Bid | N




163 |6 | Tullycanna Haw| 1.97 |Evaw Finwl  [2500 [1000 |N |
TRIAL 19 RESULT:3 1 § TIME : 29.82 DISTANCES : 4 6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
64 |5 Savin Straws | 1.93 |Ld 1Fd 500 250 N
66 |3 Cayman Cool |1.94 |Std 1 Finwl 800 Y
67 |1 Run Jill Run 1.86 | Qaw Rnon 550 Y
TRIAL 20 RESULT: 2 6 4 TIME : 29.39 DISTANCES : 10 2.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
69 |2 Tober Dot 1.85 | Faw Ald N
70 |4 Dollys Flyer 1.88 | Qaw Outp No Bid | N
73 |6 Ballyhoe Bertie | 1.90 Evaw Rnon 150 Y
TRIAL 21 RESULT:3 1 § TIME : 30.19 DISTANCES :1.5 5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
74 |1 Tober Moss 2.13 Slaw Finwl 800 |Y
76 |3 Tully Lark 1.91 Qaw Ald 500 |Y
78 |5 Bit View Gold | 2.11 Slaw Nvsh 200 |Y
TRIAL 22 RESULT: 4 6 2 TIME : 29.75 DISTANCES 3 5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
79 |2 Perfect Betsy | 1.95 Evaw Fd No Bid | N
80 |4 Highpath Maur | 1.89 | Faw Ald 700 Y
81 |6 Brykar Alison | 1.99 | Slaw Rnon 350 Y
TRIAL 23° RESULT:5 3 1 TIME: 30.29 DISTANCES: 3.5 0.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
82 |1 Head Lark 2.05 | Slaw Rnon No Bid | N
83 |3 Loggin Off 1.96 | Evaw Finwl 200 Y
84 |5 Dazzle me Dan | 1.94 Faw Ald 700 Y
TRIAL 24 RESULT:4 2 6 TIME: 30.22 DISTANCES : 1.5 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
87 |2 Cupids Fancy | 1.94 |Ld3 Evch No Bid | N
89 |4 Chriss Dog 1.91 Qaw Finwl 350 Y




190 |6 | Glengall Gift |1.99 |Slaw Nvsh NoBid/N |
TRIAL 25 RESULT :5 3 1 TIME: 30.22 DISTANCES : 2 9
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
91 |1 Ballinclea Boy | 2.12 | Slaw Nvsh N
92 |3 Gorteen Star 1.82 Ld 3 Evch 500 200 N
93 |5 Prime Eagle 1.91 Evaw Finwl No Bid | N
TRIAL 26 RESULT :6 4 2 TIME: 29.80 DISTANCES : 7 2.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
95 |2 Ballyrazel Bill | 1.96 | Qaw Outp No Bid | N
9 |4 On The State |2.02 | Slaw Rnon No Bid | N
99 |6 Tentore Fields | 2.07 Slaw Finwl 550 Y
TRIAL 27 RESULT:3 1 § TIME : 29.96 DISTANCES 2.5 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
97 |1 Focalatall 2.02 Crd 1 Rnon N
101 |3 Marlfield Jacksi| 2.00 | Ld 1 Styd 1000 |Y
106 | 5 Cleatons Flash | 1.92 Evaw Nvsh N
TRIAL 28 RESULT : 4 2 6 TIME: 29.93 DISTANCES: 3.5 0.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
98 |2 Ballyrazel Lass| 2.12 | Slaw Rnon N
107 | 4 Open Till Six | 1.91 Evaw Finwl 300 Y
109 |6 Hi There Scottig 1.98 Ld 2 Outp 300 Y
TRIAL 29 RESULT:5 3 1 TIME: 29.56 DISTANCES : 11 Dis
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
104 |1 Easily Dazzled | 1.88 Blkd 1 Ko N
11 |3 Merry Savings | 1.92 Blkd 1 Rnon No Bid | N
12 |5 Ballaghboy Crag 1.86 | Faw Ald 1100 |Y
TRIAL 30 RESULT: 2 6 4 TIME: 29.81 DISTANCES: 2.5 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
114 | 2 Kildare Rocket | 1.85 Faw Ald 400 Y
115 |4 Mikesfinalchanc 1.89 Evaw Fdrin 500 Y




(118 |6 | Garraun Maldini 1.97 |SlawRnon  [500 [200 |N |

TRIAL 31 RESULT: 5 3 1 TIME : 29.65 DISTANCES: 1 14
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
119 |1 Cleatons Three | 2.05 Slaw Nvsh No Bid [ N

120 |3 Only Mate 1.85 Faw Evch 350 Y

122 |5 Black Samurai | 1.93 Evaw Finwl 1400 | 550 N

TRIAL 32 RESULT: 4 6 2 TIME: 18.26 DISTANCES: 7.5 6
330 yds

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
36 |6 Gunga Man Evaw Rnon No Bid | N

51 |2 Stouke Thunder Slaw Nvsh No Bid | N

75 |4 Tober Tot Faw Ald N
TRIAL 33 RESULT : 5 2 TIME: 18.64 DISTANCES: 0.5
330 Yards

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
88 |2 Miss McCarthy Qaw Evch 200 |Y
103 |5 Bilboa Hawk Evaw Finwl N
TRIAL 34 RESUL: 3 6 TIME:18.41 DISTANCES:Dis
330 Yards

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
108 | 6 Catherines Angg¢ Faw Lm N

116 |3 Joekies Honcho Qaw Styd No Bid | N




