Heat 1 Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.59 Distances: 5-12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 1 TIO SHADOW Evaw faded No bid

2 3 Donohill Dream Faw Ald 2500 1500 yes

3 5 Nicolas trump Evaw Finwl 500 500 yes
Heat 2 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.46 Distances: 3 - nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 1 Gurrane Mint Faw Evch 650 650 yes
3 Jimmys Choos Shoe Evaw Finwl 450 450 Yes

6 5 Lolas Fortune Ld 2 ran on 650 650 yes
Heat 3 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 30.04 Distances: nk - 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

1 Havana Man 200 200 yes

8 3 Redhot Rebel 500 500 yes

9 5 Demesne elga 200 200 yes
Heat 4 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.79 Distances: 10 - nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
10 1 Steeple Rd Dave Evaw Ranon | 450 450 yes

11 3 Sammy the dasher Slaw nvsh Not put Up for sale

13 5 Tio Chico Slaw Outp. No bid
Heat 5 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.32 Distances: 1.5 - 4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 1 Clonreddan Rose Slaw ran on No bid

15 3 Beef Tea Faw Evch 500 500 yes

16 5 Gurrane Katy Evaw finwl 1400 1400 yes
Heat 6 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.57 Distances: 2 - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 1 Pay Attention Evaw Ran on | 600 600 yes

18 3 Throughthewoods Slaw ran on No bid
19 5 Doonbeg Hondo Faw Ald 400 400 yes
Heat 7 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.77 Distances: 12-10

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
20 1 Cragaknock Lark Faw Ald 600 600 yes

21 3 Choice Pick Slaw nvsh No bid

22 5 Tio Percy Slaw nvsh Not put Up for | sale




Heat 8 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.50 Distances: 5 - 0.50
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 1 Demesne Dubh Evaw Evch 200 200 yes
24 3 Barnagrane Alan Evaw Evch No bid
25 5 Lubagh Blue Faw Ald 2000 1000 yes
Heat 9 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.74 Distances: 2 - 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
26 1 Morse Evaw Outp No bid
27 3 Nicolas King ?Evaw Finwl | 1200 1200 yes
28 5 YaDa Faw Evch 400 400 yes
Heat 10 Result:3-1-5 Time: 30.08 Distances: 2.5 - 2.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
29 1 Dilton Express Evaw Evch No bid
30 3 Clonlaheen robin Evaw finwl No bid
32 5 Hawkeyed Baby Evaw Evch No bid
Heat 11 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.50 Distances: 2 -1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
33 1 Dromoher Megan Evaw Evch No bid
34 3 Stormy Bonny Faw ald 900 900 yes
35 5 Demesne Blossom Evaw Evch 300 300 yes
Heat 12 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.23 Distances: 6 - 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 1 Recent Times Faw Ald 900 900 yes
37 3 Look busy Evaw Evch No bid
38 5 Lubagh Friar Evaw Ran on No bid
Heat 13 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.70 Distances: 1-3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
39 1 Fastaway Bud No bid
40 3 Hilltop Pretty 800 400 no
42 5 Malbay cool 650 650 yes
Heat 14 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.44 Distances: 4 - 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
44 1 Mussles Galore 1000 1000 yes
45 3 Dilton Scholes faw 600 600 yes
46 5 Kilkilahara Lady No bid




Heat 15 Result: 3-1-5 Time:29.34 Distances: 0.75 - 6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
47 1 Undercover rocky Evaw Evch 1200 600 no

48 3 Shanavulin Cindy Faw Evch 1100 650 no

49 5 Bad habit Slaw Outp No bid
Heat 16 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.51 Distances: 8—1.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
50 1 Loughbeag Eoin Faw Ald 1200 1200 yes
51 3 Magnetic sunrise Evaw faded 500 200 no
52 5 Hilltop Magic Slaw Outp No bid
Heat 17 Result: 3-5-1 Time:30.48 Distances: 1 - 0.50
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
55 1 Megans Teddy No bid
56 3 Astra Express No bid
57 5 Leamaneigh Sonna No bid
Heat 18 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.65 Distances: 9 - 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
58 1 Ardant Magpie Faw Ald 2000 700 no

59 3 Eoins pride Evaw Outp Not put Up for sale

61 5 Star Spark Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 19 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.64 Distances:1.5 - 2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
62 1 Loughbeag Eily Evaw Evch No bid

63 3 Dazzle em Jan Evaw Finwl | 300 300 yes

65 5 Yeah Sunrise Faw evch 650 650 yes
Heat 20 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.64 Distances: 1.5 - 2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
66 1 Gready Evaw Evch 800 800 yes

68 3 Hockey Hero Faw Ald 850 850 yes

69 5 Inislosky Thrush Slaw outp Not put Up for sale
Heat 21 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.20 Distances: 1 - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
70 1 Clonbony Surf Evaw Outp No bid

73 3 Steeple Rd Molly Faw ald 1000 650 no

74 5 Banard rover Faw Evch 800 700 no




Heat 22 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.78 Distances: 2.5 - 12
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
72 1 Pro Evolution Evaw Evch 250 250 yes
75 |3 Star Vicky Blk 2™ No bid
78 5 Ardant Henry Ld2 Ranon | Not put Up for sale
Heat 23 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.69 Distances: 7 - dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
79 1 Cragaknock Weer Evaw Evch No bid
80 3 Babe Dash Faw Ald 800 800 yes
81 5 Bettyville Venus Tit Ran on No bid
Heat 24 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.35 Distances: 14 - §
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
82 1 Davys Spitfire Faw Faded Not put Up for | sale
84 3 Gortown Wish Faw finwl Comm.. only
85 5 Meenala Troy Slaw Ran on No bid
Heat 25 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.53 Distances: 3 - 0.50
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
86 1 Carra Queen Evaw Evch 100 100 yes
88 3 Sophies flyer Faw ald 700 300 no
92 5 Bettyville flyer Evaw Evch 1300 350 no
Heat 26 Result:1-5-3 Time: 29.75 Distances: shd - 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
93 1 Meenala Treasure Faw Held on | 200 200 yes
94 3 Davys Missile Slaw Nvsh No bid
95 5 Knocktoo Nelly Evaw Evch 200 200 yes
Heat 27 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.91 Distances: 0.75 - 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
96 1 Steeple Rd Steve Evaw Finwl | Not put Up for | sale
97 3 Melting Ice Blk 1 ranon | Not put Up for | sale
98 5 Evans Bully Faw Evch No bid
Heat 28 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.39 Distances: 8 - 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
99 1 Carmels rocket Faw Faded Not put Up for | sale
100 |3 Carra dubh Slaw Outp No bid
101 |5 Stormy Debbie Faw finwl No bid




Heat 29 Result: 1-3-5 Time:29.12 Distances: 1.5 - 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
102 |1 Son of Hawk Evaw Finwl | 950 950 yes
104 |3 Traffic Cool Faw evch 500 500 yes
105 |5 Vito Buck Evaw Outp Not put Up for sale
Heat 30 Result: 3-1-5 Time:29.66 Distances: 3-3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
106 |1 Oyster Podge Evaw Evch | 200 200 yes
107 |3 Kierans legacy Faw Ald 250 250 yes
108 |5 Cragaknock Bash Stumled Not put Up for | sale
Heat 31 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.02 Distances: 4 - 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
109 |1 Tiermana Johnnie Slaw Ran on No bid
110 |3 Leamaneigh Flash Faw Ald No bid
91 5 Daves Lizzy Slaw ran on No bid
Heat 32 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 17.17 Distances: dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
41 1 Feet of fury Wide 1% No bid
54 3 Dromoher Lucky Faw Ald No bid
64 5 Sarges Amy Blk 1 No bid
Heat 33 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 16.84 Distances: 1-6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
53 1 Lady Excel No bid
89 3 Marguerita 250 200 no
90 5 Traceys Euro No bid




