Heat 1 Result:1-3-5 Time: 30.03 Distances: 1.5-5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 1 Chapelane Dubh 1000 600 no

2 3 Newbridge Crest 350 350 yes

3 5 Barrack Honcho 300 300 yes

Heat 2 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.28 Distances: 2.5 - §

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 1 Vito Honcho 650 650 yes

3 Alexs Delight 400 400 yes

6 5 Bruis Dream 900 900 yes
Heat 3 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.62 Distances: hd - 2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 1 Nicolas fancy No bid

8 3 Gurrane Cash 600 600 yes

10 5 Malbay Becky 200 200 yes
Heat 4 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.13 Distances: 8 - hd

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 1 Nicks Blue Moon 1550 1550 yes

12 3 Newbridge Jill No bid
13 5 Shine with us 200 200 yes
Heat 5 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.42 Distances: 10 - 2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 1 Foxwood Vicky No bid

15 3 Barrack Blues No bid
16 5 Monagea Torres 1300 1300 yes
Heat 6 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.62 Distances: 1.5 - 4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 1 Vito Crash 550 550 yes

18 3 Demesne Suzzie 550 550 yes

19 5 Corrib Beauty 250 250 yes
Heat 7 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.19 Distances: 7 - 7

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
20 1 Headleys Bandit 1800 1800 yes

21 3 Eliahs Gaffer 650 650 yes

22 |5 Coolagorna Train No bid




Heat 8 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.29 Distances: 1 - 6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 1 Tubber Tommy 1700 1700 yes

25 3 Cnoc Dubh 600 600 yes

26 5 Bang on Susie 200 200 yes
Heat 9 Result: 3-1-5  Time: 29.37 Distances: 12 - 0.50

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
28 1 Karalla State 300 300 yes

29 3 Tell Dell 750 750 yes

30 5 Lukesbenny No bid
Heat 10 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.38 Distances: 1.5 - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
32 1 Torpeys Post 950 950 yes

33 3 Nicolas Pumpkin No bid
35 5 Meteora 350 350 yes
Heat 11 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.28 Distances: 5 - 12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 1 Moinin Girl No bid
37 3 Boherbradda Ace 250 250 yes

38 5 Sloppy Giuseppe 1100 1100 yes

Heat 12 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.75 Distances:1 - 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
39 1 Demesne Delta 350 350 yes

41 3 Nicolas rose No bid
42 5 Scarriff Sublime No bid
Heat 13 Result: 3-5-1- Time: 29.51 Distances: 14 - 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
43 1 Hawkeyed Baby No bid

44 3 Golden slipper 550 550 yes

45 5 Send it Dolls No bid
Heat 14 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.32 Distances: 14 - hd

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
46 1 Celeb State No bid

47 3 Gurtnacrehy Plan 700 700 yes

48 5 Bang on Holly Not put Up for | sale




Heat 15 Result: 3-5-1 Time:29.08 Distances: dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
51 1 Nicolas Legend No bid
53 3 Nialls Hero 1300 1300 yes

54 5 Scarriff Story No bid
Heat 16 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.15 Distances: dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
55 1 Send it Abbie No bid
56 3 Ardant Magpie 500 500 yes
58 5 Beagh Dodge 1500 1200 no
Heat 17 Result: 1-3-5 Time:29.15 Distances: 4 - 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
60 1 Sullane ranger 2200 1000 no
61 3 South Wind 600 300 no
63 5 Nicolas Dawn No bid
Heat 18 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.37 Distances: 10 - hd

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
64 1 Ballycohane Bill 400 400 yes

66 3 Send it help No bid
67 5 Aoifes Jewel 550 550 yes
Heat 19 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.45 Distances:1 - 12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
69 1 Watch your man 200 200 yes

72 3 Cleatons Three No bid

73 5 Fort apache 750 750 yes
Heat 20 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.71 Distances: 1 - 10

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
74 1 Sullane Corner 1500 400 no

75 3 Hare Legs 300 300 yes

76 5 Bettyville Flyer Not put Up for sale
Heat 21 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.33 Distances: 3 - 9

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
78 1 Groovy baby 200 200 yes

79 |3 Killaloe star 600 600 yes

81 5 Portdangan hero 1500 700 no




Heat 22 Result: 2 - 4 Time: 30.05 Distances: 10

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
82 2 Cleatons Flash No bid
27 4 Send it Jamie Not put Up for sale
Heat 23 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 16.80 Distances: 1 - 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 1 Rathmartin Bay No bid
34 3 Golden Oak 200 200 yes

52 5 Dromlara Lady No bid
Heat 24 Result: 4 - 2 Time: 16.69 Distances: 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 2 Daves Yaz No bid

80 4 Margarets Pride No bid
Heat 25 Result: Solo Time: 39.65 Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

59 2 Artistic Light 650 650 YES




