Heat 1 Result:4-6-2 Time: 29.28 Distances: dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 2 Stride on Rumble Slaw W4th 300 300 yes

2 4 Liosgarbh rooney Evaw Finwl 1200 1200 yes

3 6 Padraics Season Faw Blk 4 250 250 yes
Heat 2 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.64 Distances: 0.50 - 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 2 Harlequin haley Evaw Finwl 800 800 yes

6 4 Style Award Slaw Finwl 300 300 yes

6 Mither Tap Faw Evch 750 750 yes

Heat 3 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.30 Distances: 2 - 0.50

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
8 2 Warning Call Faw Evch 850 850 yes

9 4 Rathglassin Taxi Evaw Finwl 750 750 yes

10 6 Wrong Answer Slaw Finwl Not put Up for sale
Heat 4 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.17 Distances: 4 - 12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 2 Tromora class Evaw Ld 3 1600 1600 yes

12 4 Chapelane Dubh Faw Evch 850 850 yes

13 6 Guitar Ace Slaw Outp No bid
Heat 5 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.11 Distances: 10 - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 2 Harlequin Tupele Evaw Faded | 400 400 yes

15 4 Kilfinny Laura Faw Finwl 1600 1600 yes

16 6 Step it Fast Slaw Outp 200 200 yes
Heat 6 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.10 Distances: 8 - hd

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 2 Oakfront O Eight Evaw Evch 200 200 yes

18 4 Broadmill rosie Evaw Evch 500 200 no

19 6 Sparta Boy Evaw Finwl | 2000 1200 no
Heat 7 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.27 Distances: 6 - 12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
20 2 Rabbits Turn Evaw Outp No bid

21 4 Stormy duke Faw Ald 1600 800 no

22 6 Ballinulty Rebel Slaw Ran on No bid




Heat 8 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.11 Distances: nk - 7
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 2 Moody Margaret Evaw Outp No bid
26 4 Malbay Logan Evaw Ranon | 800 400 no
25 6 Geneva Jimmy Faw Finwl 400 400 yes
Heat 9 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.23 Distances: 4 - 2.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
28 2 Rockhill Time Faw Evch 450 450 yes
29 4 Isadanfitz Evaw Ld 3 500 500 yes
30 6 Burnpark Diego Evaw Ran on | 600 600 yes
Heat 10 Result: 2-4-6  Time: 29.09 Distances: 8 -1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
31 2 Tromora Lucky Faw Ald 1800 1800 yes
33 4 Cooneen Castle Evaw Evch 350 350 yes
34 6 Sparta Buachaill Slaw Ran on | 200 200 yes
Heat 11 Result: 2-6-4 Time:29.41 Distances: 7 - 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
35 2 Pickupagear Faw Ald 1500 900 no
36 4 Ballinulty rose Evaw Evch No bid
37 6 Class Merry Evaw Ran on | 200 200 yes
Heat 12 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.24 Distances: 6 - 12
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
38 2 Enzo Evaw Faded 350 350 yes
40 4 Geneva Crystal Evaw Outp 150 150 yes
42 6 Rathdromin Laddy Faw Finwl 1500 1500 yes
Heat 13 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.18 Distances: 9 - hd
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
43 2 Clonreddan Rose Faw Ald 750 750 yes
44 4 Headleys Ramble Evaw Faded | 350 350 yes
45 6 Tinross rogue Evaw Ran on No bid
Heat 14 Result: 4-2-6 Time:29.63 Distances:  dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
46 2 Cooneen Kewell Evaw Ft. Not put Up for | sale
47 4 Boyne diva Evaw Ld 3 650 650 yes
48 6 Geneva Seanie Evaw Blk 450 450 yes




Heat 15 Result: 4-6-2 Time:29.01 Distances: 7 - dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
49 2 Rathdromin Pearl Slaw Outp Not put UP FOR | sale

51 4 Kyle Tom Faw Ald 1000 1000 yes

52 6 Dixies One Evaw 300 300 yes
Heat 16 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.32 Distances: 6 - hd
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
53 2 Purse of Plenty Faw Evch 500 500 yes

54 4 Santoi Silver Evaw Finwl 1300 750 no

56 6 Chestnut Rose Slaw finwl No bid
Heat 17 Result: 4-6-2 Time:28.90 Distances: 12 - 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 2 Geneva Jaqui Slaw ran on No bid
58 4 Featherstone Faw Ald 1400 1400 yes
59 6 Whistling Power Evaw Outp 250 250 yes
Heat 18 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.14 Distances: 1 - 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
61 2 Sparta glee Faw Ald 900° 900 yes

62 4 Gurtnacrehy Sam Faw Evch 1500 300 no

63 6 Northwind Girl Evaw ran on | 400 300 no

Heat 19 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.38 Distances:0.50 - 6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
64 2 Lismadine road Faw Evch 600 600 yes

65 4 Bolt Star Evaw Outp 200 200 yes

67 6 Saffron Ace Evaw finwl 800 800 yes

Heat 20 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.19 Distances: 1.5 - 7

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
68 2 Amadeus Rock Faw Finwl 350 350 yes

69 4 Tyrap Mac Evaw Evch 350 350 yes

70 6 Sparta Vidic Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 21 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.03 Distances: 6 - 0.50

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
71 2 Santoi Blackie Evaw Evch | 250 250 yes

73 4 Fastaway Miller Faw Finwl 2000 1800 yes

74 6 Boherbradda Tess Evaw 250 250 yes




Heat 22 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.55 Distances: 4 - 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
75 2 Gurtnacrehy Lad Faw Evch Not put Up for sale
78 4 Rathmullen Billy Evaw Evch 350 350 yes
79 6 Saffron man Evaw Finwl | 200 200 yes
Heat 23 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.19 Distances: 6 - 6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
80 2 Grogeen Hawk Evaw Outp Not put UP for | sale
81 4 Race Man Faw Evch No bid
82 6 Pinot Grigio Faw Finwl 800 700 yes
Heat 24 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.33 Distances: 10 - hd
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
84 2 Tandy Evaw Not put Up for | sale
86 4 Picture me Now Faw 650 650 yes
90 6 Whistling bullet Blk 1 Not put Up for | sale
Heat 25 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 16.31 Distances: 2 -6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 2 Spotlight Rebel 200 200 Yes
50 4 Tan the man No bid
55 6 Tyrap Scolari 600 350 yes
Heat 26 Result: 4 = 2 Time: 16.19 Distances: 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
83 2 Shanacoole eagle Not put Up for sale
87 4 Gurtnacrehy Star No bid
Heat 27 Result: 4 - 2 Time: 16.10 Distances: 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
88 2 Dromlara lady No bid
89 4 Modest Legend 1500 550 no
Heat 28 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N




