Heat 1 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.73 Distances : 5L,6LL

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

1 2 Trumpers Patty 3.55 | Evaw, Blk 1 No Bid | No

3 4 Elegant Master 3.53 | Ldbs Styd €650 | Yes

5 6 Butterbridge Val 3.50 | Qaway,Ranon €450 | Yes
Heat 2 Result: 2-6-4 Time : 29.37 Distances : 6L,3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
6 2 Game Billie 3.42 | Qaway, Ald 1,500 600 No

7 4 Gowlane Stunner 342 | Qaw,Blk 1 No Bid | No

12 6 Sportsmans Queen 346 | Evaw, Blk 1 400 No

Heat 3 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.51 Distances: 2L, 2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
10 2 Game Razl 3.50 | Chlbs, Styd €700 | Yes

13 4 Castlelyons Greg 3.49 | Evan, Ranon €600 | Yes

18 6 Jet Kewell 3.39 | Qaway,Ranon €600 | Yes

Heat 4 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.31 Distances: 2L, 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold

Y/N

20 2 Game Destiny 3.46 | Qaway,Ald 600 No

22 Kewells Wish 3.50 | Ep,Stydon €400 | Yes

23 6 Maglass Kewell 3.59 | Bumprunup,Ranon €300 | Yes
Heat 5 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.06 Distances: 3L,3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 2 Aghaburren Joker 3.53 | Slaw,Styd €750 | Yes

25 4 Patricks Day 340 | Ep, Ald €1,200 | Yes SOB
26 6 Gowlane Light 3.50 | Evaw,Ranon 100 NO
Heat 6 Result: 6-2-4 Time : 29.14 Distances : 11L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
27 2 Lazy Mary Kate 3.40 | Qaway,Fd €850 Yes

28 4 Unknown Loopy 3.53 | Slaw,Ranon €300 | Yes

30 6 Bower Shelly 3.44 | Evaw,Finwdl €800 | Yes
Heat 7 Result: 4-2-6 Time 29.77 Distances: 4L,5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
31 2 Galley Duff 3.61 | Evaw,Ranon €400 | Yes

32 4 Streamline 3.58 | Blk,Styd 1,500 700 No

33 6 All Yap 3.59 | Evaw,Ranon €200

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 8 Result: 6-2-4  Time: 29.36 Distances: 4L,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
34 2 Royal Kate 3.39 | Qaway,Ranon €600 | Yes

36 4 Unknown Moment 3.52 | Evaw,Ranon €300 | Yes

35 6 Butterbridge Zee (M) | 3.41 | Mid, P 800 No
Heat 9 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.29 Distances: 2L,10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
37 2 Mary Next Door 3.44 | Qaway,ALd €600 | Yes

39 4 Tidy Up Roo 3.45 | Evaw,Fd €200 | Yes

40 6 Umera Droopy 3.51 | Evaw,Stydon 600 No
Heat 10 Result: 6-4-2 Time : 29.13 Distances: 3L,10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
42 2 Boher Robin 3.54 | Evaw,Fd €300 | Yes

45 4 Ardineer Hero (M) 3.50 | Evaw,Stydon €600 | Yes

46 6 Butterbridge Pet (W) | 3.44 | Ep, Ald * No

Heat 11 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.60 Distances: 1L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
47 2 Muskerry Ruler 3.55 | Slaw,Styhdon €600 | Yes

49 4 Scotia Diego 3.53 | Evan,Ranon €850 | Yes

51 6 Miss Vat 3.42 | Qaway,Hdnline €350 | Yes
Heat 12 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.35 Distances: 2L,3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
52 2 Flying Forge 3.46 | Qaway,Ranon €500 | Yes

54 4 Muskerry Diego 3.50 | Evaw,Clrun €550 | Yes

53 6 Ardineer Rebel (M) | 3.41 | Qaway,Styd 2,500 1,800 | No

Heat 13 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.44 Distances: 2L,3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
55 2 Paddys Power 3.44 | Evaw,Ranon €400 | Yes

56 4 Persubicate 3.32 | Faway,Ald 1,500 800 No

57 6 Southwind Hugo 3.51 | Blka,Styd 1,000 €800 | Yes SOB
Heat 14 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.24 Distances: 1L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
58 2 Upton Kewell 3.47 | Evaw,Styd €1,350 | Yes

60 4 Knockrour Tapped 3.49 | Mid, P 750 NO

61 6 Coole Dodge 3.62 | Slaw,Ranon €450 | Yes

Not Presented for Sale




Heat 15 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.65 Distances: 9L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
62 2 January Jane 3.51 | Bump,Styd €450 | Yes

63 4 Born High 3.52 | Evaw,Bmp €350 Yes

67 6 Calling Shirl 3.58 | Slaw,Blk 3 €200 | Yes
Heat 16 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.43 Distances : 4L ,2LL

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
64 2 Pretty Miss Maya 3.45 | Evaw,Styd €500 | Yes

68 6 Icy Babe 3.41 | Qaway,Fdranin No Bid | No

69 4 Adrift 3.55 | Slow,Ranon €200 | Yes
Heat 17 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.23 Distances: 5L,8L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
66 2 Small Mans Boy 3.50 | Slaway, Rl €250 | Yes
71 4 Lads Lucan 3.44 | Evaw,Ranon €250 Yes
70 6 January Peach (W) 3.40 | Ep,Stydwell €800 | Yes
Heat 18 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.01 Distances : 21,10

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
72 2 Knockeen Daisy 3.50 | Evaw,Ranon 150 No

73 4 County Officer 3.40 | Ep, Ldl €800 | Yes

74 6 Icy Sizzler 3.43 | Evaw,Finwell €1,000 | Yes
Heat 19 Result: 4-2-6 Time :29.10 Distances : 5L, 14LL

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
75 2 Splendid Rodge 3.46 | Evaw,Ranon 300 No

77 4 January Polly 3.48 | Evaw,Styd €650 | Yes

79 6 Knockeen Gale 3.68 | Slaw,nvshowed No Bid | No
Heat 20 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 28.91 Distances: 9L,5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
80 6 Bayside Mick 3.36 | Faway,Ald €1,000 | Yes SOB
84 2 Ottawa Lady 3.49 | Evaw,Ranon €300 | Yes

82 4 Witches Fred (M) 3.46 | Evaw,Fd * NO
Heat 21 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.11 Distances: 10L,0.5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
8 |2 Brandy Puff 3.55 | Slaw,Ranon €300 | Yes

87 4 Cannot Catch Me 3.43 | Qaway,Ald €1,600 | Yes

88 6 Valentine Dash 3.49 | Evaw,Ranon €300 | Yes SOB
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Heat 22 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.20 Distances: 3L,12L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
89 2 Bunch Of Cherrys 3.48 | Evaw,Styd €950 | Yes
90 4 Splendid County 3.45 | Evaw,Ranon No Bid | No
92 6 Lady Flaming 3.54 | Evaw,Fd No Bid | No
Heat 23 Result: 4-2 Time: 29.34 Distances: 6L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
93 6 Lahana Woods 3.51 | Evaw,Ranon €100 Yes
94 2 Valentine Honcho 3.54 | Evaw,Styd No Bid | No
4
Heat 24 (300) Result: 2-4 Time: 18.39 Distances: HD
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
38 6 Reagrove Razel Ep,Finwl €650 Yes
91 2 White Alice Faw,Rnon No Bid | No
4




