Heat 1 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.55 Distances : .05L,5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 2 Leaders Princess 3.72 | Slaw,Rnon €600 Yes

2 6 Lethal Lass 3.67 | Slaw,Finwl €150 Yes

3 4 Trumpers Patty 3.60 | Ep Ldnrl €450 | Yes
Heat 2 Result: 4-2-6 Time : 29.74 Distances : 3L,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 2 Effernogue Beg 3.69 | Evaw,Finw €400 | Yes

4 Kingdom Patsy 3.40 | Faw,Ald €600 | Yes

7 6 Dower Spark 3.70 | Evaw,Rnon €100 | Yes
Heat 3 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.60 Distances: 2.5L, 4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
8 2 Cavies Pin 3.55 | Evaw,Crd 1 €700 Yes

10 4 Jamaican Jade 3.51 | Ep,Finwl €700 | Yes

9 6 Cyclers Ash (W) 3.57 | Evaw,Crd 1 * NO
Heat 4 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.24 Distances: Dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 2 Effernogue Marie 3.55 | Evaw,Blkd 1 €150 | Yes

13 4 Kingdom Clichy 3.54 | Evaw, Finwl 2,200 | No

15 6 Beanos Shakira 3.55 | Evaw ,Blkd 1 * NO
Heat 5 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.20 Distances: 5L,6L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
16 2 Satin Comet 344 | Wru,Finwl €3,300 | Yes

17 4 Makin Memories 3.59 | CrdRu, * NO

Nvshw

18 6 Effernogue Demi 3.47 | Evaw,Rnon 900 Yes SOB
Heat 6 Result: 6-2-4 Time : 29.81 Distances : 3L, HD

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
19 2 Clear The Air 3.41 | Faw,Evch €200 Yes

21 4 Cyclers Court 3.45 | Evaw,Chl 3 €450 | Yes

20 6 Elegant Princess (W) | 3.49 | Ld4 Finwl €500 | Yes
Heat 7 Result: 4-2-6 Time 29.80 Distances: 3L, HD

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
22 2 Westside Ruby 3.63 | Slaw, Finwl €500 | Yes

23 4 Coolclough Ned 3.55 | Ld 2 Rnon €800 | Yes

24 6 Butts Kate 3.48 | Ep Evch €100 | Yes
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Heat 8 Result: 4-6-2  Time: 29.82 Distances: 4L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
26 2 Dawstown Show 3.50 | Evaw, Crd4 * NO

27 4 Volatile 344 | Faw,Ald €300 Yes

25 6 Oisin Star (W) 3.58 | Evaw W4 * NO
Heat 9 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.47 Distances: 2L,8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
29 2 Pacey Customer 3.60 | Slaw,Rnon 200 No

30 4 Calling Dan 345 | Ep, Ald 500 No

28 6 Beautiful Diamond | 3.49 | Evaw,Nvshw * NO

W)

Heat 10 Result: 4-6-2 Time : 29.60 Distances: 1.5L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
31 2 Sleek Alanna 3.57 | Slaw,Rnon * No

32 4 Bower Peggy 3.44 | Faw,Ald €900 | Yes

33 6 Coolclough Honey 3.44 | Faw,Evch 1,000 450 No

Heat 11 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.58 Distances: 3L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
34 2 Society Charlie 3.53 | Faw * No

37 4 Oakfront Dame 3.52 | Faw,Ald €500 | Yes

36 6 Oisins Favourite (M) | 3.69 | Slaw,Rnon €100 | Yes
Heat 12 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.33 Distances: 1L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
40 2 Graces Joy 3.50 | Evaw,Finwl €400 | Yes

39 4 Sleek Lizzie (w) 3.51 | Evaw,Evch €250 | Yes

38 6 Tourig Magic (w) 3.49 | Ep, Evch €600 | Yes
Heat 13 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.24 Distances: 6L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
44 2 Native Elite 3.50 | Faw,Outpac €100 | Yes

45 4 Malden Picture 3.58 | Ld2 Finwl €1,450 | Yes

47 6 Oilean Hawk 3.55 | Evaw, Rnon 200 No

Heat 14 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.18 Distances: 3L,8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
48 2 Drompark Brodea 3.48 | Wru,Finwl €1,300 | Yes SOB
49 |4 Curryhills Palo 3.60 | Evaw,Nvshw No Bid | No

50 6 Noels Bran 3.51 | Evaw,Rnon No Bid | No
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Heat 15 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 30.22 Distances: 1.5L,2L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
52 2 Lahana Premier 3.56 | Evaw,Rnon No Bid | No
53 4 Kiel Setanta 349 | Faw,Crd 1 No Bid | No
51 6 Cooly Flame (W) 3.55 | Ep,Crd 1 €200 | Yes
Heat 16 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.52 Distances : 7L ,10L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
54 2 Garfiney Dasher 3.51 | Blkd1,Nvshw €1,100 | Yes
56 4 Down Town 3.53 | Evaw,Finwl €1,350 | Yes
55 6 Hi Ruby (M) 3.55 | Blkd1,Nvshw €500 | Yes
Heat 17 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.08 Distances: 7L,10L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 2 Woodbrook Fancy 3.80 | Stbtp,Nvshw No Bid | No
59 4 Rockforest Ace 3.44 | Faw,Ald €1,550 | Yes
60 6 Bridepark Abbey(W) |3.54 | Evaw,Rnon €250 | Yes
Heat 18 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.85 Distances : 1.5L,6LL
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
62 2 Curryhills Shado 3.55 | Evaw,Fd €100 | Yes
63 4 El Paso 3.52 | Faw,Rnon No Bid | No
61 6 Pex Machine (W) 3.51 | Ep,Finwl €200 | Yes
Heat 19 Result: 4-6-2 Time :30.15 Distances : .SL, 1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
65 2 Avalon Quinnie 3.63 | Evaw,Rnon * NO
66 4 Micheals Girl 3.60 | Evaw,Ldnrl €350 Yes SOB
64 6 Sensible Spice (W) 3.46 | Faw,Hdnrl * NO
Heat 20 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 28.92 Distances: 10L,7L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
67 2 Kilgrogan Brett 3.48 | Faw, Ald 2,000 | No
68 4 Rockforest Matt 3.55 | Evaw, Blkd 1 €400 Yes
69 6 Unknown Turbo 3.53 | Evaw,BIkd 1 * NO
Heat 21 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.22 Distances: 2.5L.4L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
71 2 Bridepark Gregg 3.44 | Faw,Evch €300 | Yes
73 4 Star Partners 3.42 | Faw,Evch % NO
75 6 Rockforest Milo 3.52 | Evaw,Finwl €1,000 | Yes
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Heat 22

Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.44 Distances: 2L,2.5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
77 2 Castledun Kaiser 3.46 | Faw, Outpac No Bid | No
78 4 Unknown Biffo 3.51 | Evaw,Evch No Bid | No
79 6 Spent Savings (M) 3.50 | Ep Wbnds * NO
Heat 23 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.62 Distances: Hd, 4L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
83 2 Rockforest Toby 3.55 | Faw,Ldnrl €600 Yes
84 4 Come On Will 3.70 | Evaw, Evch No Bid | No
86 6 Bridepark Bolt (M) 3.60 | Faw,Hdnrl €350 | Yes
Heat 24 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.37 Distances: 3L,7L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
89 2 Roseville Peadar 3.48 | Faw,Fiwl 800 No
90 4 Rebeccas Diego 3.58 | Evaw,Nvshw * NO
88 6 Westcountry Lord 3.48 | Faw,Evch 500 NO
(W)
Heat 25 Result:4-2-6 Time:29.12 Distances : 9L,Nk
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
93 2 Brave Pilot 3.60 | Evaw,Rnon €150 | Yes
94 4 Vieri Grange 3.53 | Faw,Finwl €950 | Yes
95 6 Close Farm 3.63 | Evaw.Rnon No Bid | No
Heat 26 Results :6-4-2 Time: 29.33 Distances: 1L, 4L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
96 2 San Jameos 3.60 | Evaw,Evch % NO
97 4 Tucks Lady 3.48 | Faw,Hdnrl €450 | Yes
99 6 Cathals Mystery 3.58 | Evaw,Finwl 800 NO
Heat 27 Result:4-6-2 Time: 29.22 Distances: 5L ,0.5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
100 |2 Yankie Robin 3.58 | Evaw,Rnon * NO
102 |4 Radio Nowhere 3.52 | Faw,Ald €400 | Yes
101 |6 Parkgate Flyer (W) 3.60 | Ep Rnon * NO
Heat 28 Result: 4-2 Time: 29.15 Distances: SL
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
105 |2 Inch Rocket 3.54 | Evaw,Evch * NO
106 |4 Another Silkey 3.55 | Evaw,Finwl €500 | Yes
6
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Heat 29 Result: 2-4 Time:29.74 Distances: 0.5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
107 |2 Coolclough Jo 3.43 | Faw,HIldon €200 | Yes
108 |4 Woodbrook Tip 3.62 | Evaw,Finwl €250 | Yes
6
Heat 30(330) Result: 2 Time: 18.33 Distances:  Solo
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N

74 2 Carran Hare Solo €700 Yes




