
Result: 3-5-1 Time: 30.60 Distances: 2 - 14 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

1 1 Elegant Master  Sl aw, ko 1st 1000 300 No 

2 3 Kaseys Vieri  Sl aw, ran on   No bid 

3 5 Mooncoin Express  Slaw Ran on   No bid 

Heat 2 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.97 Distances: 1 - 3 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

5 2 Hypnotic Hendrix  Sl aw, nv sh  200 Yes 

6 4 Susie Be Slick  Ev aw, ran on  400 Yes 

7 6 Graces Joy  Ev aw, ran on  300 Yes 

Heat 3 Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.88 Distances: 0.5 - 4 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

8 1 Mooncoin Montos  Evaw Evch   No bid 

9 3 Angels Lass  Faw Ald 1000 300 No 

10 5 Minor Fifteen  Slaw Out 800 200 No 

Heat 4 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.91 Distances: 11 - 10 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

12 2 Choice Pick 3.16 Sl aw, nv sh   No bid 

13 4 Milly Be Slick 3.16 Sl aw, ran on  500 yes 

14 6 Black Monto 3.08 Sl aw, nv sh   No bid 

Heat 5 Result:3-1-5 Time: 29.29 Distances: 12 – 3.5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

15 1 Hypnotic Hero 3.01 Evaw, ev ch  200 Yes 

16 3 Paradise Nevada 2.93 F aw, al led  3000 Yes 

17 5 Minor Tango 3.08 Sl aw, nv sh   No bid 

Heat 6 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.84 Distances: 4 - 5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 



19 2 Monard Lad 2.96 EP fd  200 yes 

21 4 Avaheen Maggie 2.98 EP fd   No bid 

23 6 Athassel Rogue 3.20 Sl aw Ran on  900 yes 

Heat 7 Result:1-5-3 Time: 29.91 Distances: 1 - 5  

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

24 1 Pinewood Fred 3.16 Sl aw, ran on  300 yes 

25 3 Vinnies Dasher 3.11 Sl aw, ev ch   No bid 

26 5 Blastoff Leah 3.11 Sl aw, ev ch   No bid 

Heat 8 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 30.10 Distances: 2.5 - 2 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

27 2 Dulwich Lady 3.16 Sl aw, ran on   No bid 

29 4 Gerpats Penny 3.12 Sl aw, Ev ch   No bid 

30 6 Lisnakill Fay 3.10 Sl aw, Ev ch   No bid 

Heat 9 Result: 5 – 3 - 1 Time: 29.97 Distances: 0.5 – 2.5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

32 1 Ice Doll 3.00 Evaw ev ch  100 yes 

33 3 Dulwich Pet 3.00 Evaw, ev ch   No bid 

34 5 Kranky William 2.93 F aw, al led  400 yes 

Heat 10 Result: 2 – 4 - 6 Time: 29.57 Distances: 5 - 8 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

35 2 Offthejar 3.08 Sl aw, Fin well  3000 yes 

38 4 Raceful Black 2.93 F aw, ev ch  600 yes 

39 6 Airmount Alert 2.97 E P, ev ch   No bid 

Heat 11 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.43 Distances: 9 - 2 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

41 1 Southlodge Sunny 3.07 Sl aw, nv sh Not put  Up for sale 

42 3 Kranky Alice 3.06 Sl aw, ev ch   No bid 



43 5 Business Fortune 2.92 F aw, al led  1100 Yes 

Heat 12 Result: 6 – 2 - 4 Time: 29.21 Distances: 9.5 - 10 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

45 2 Effernogue Amber 3.04 Sl aw, ev ch 1000 600 No 

50 4 Lisnakill Gabby 3.17 Sl aw, nv sh   No bid 

52 6 Ballinabola Vic 2.92 F aw, al led   No bid 

Heat 13 Result: 1 – 3 - 5 Time: 29.67 Distances: 3 - 5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

54 5 Ardboy Peaches 3.01 Faw Evch  500 yes 

55 3 Premaluna 2.93 F aw, ran on  300 yes 

56 1 Jethart Legend 2.88 Q aw, al led 500 200 no 

Heat 14 Result:6 – 4 - 2 Time: 29.60 Distances: 13 - 3 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

57 2 Kahara Desert 3.10 Sl aw, nv sh Not put Up for sale 

59 4 Blazeaway Tina 3.04 Sl aw, ev ch  400 Yes 

62 6 Dairyland Hare 2.95 F aw, al led   No 

Heat 15 Result: 5 – 1 - 3 Time:29.54 Distances: 2.5 – 2.5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

63 1 Spartacharlie 3.04 Sl aw, ev ch  650 Yes 

65 3 Percentile 3.04 Sl aw, nv sh Not put Up for sale 

67 5 Ronans Revenge 2.98 E P, al led   No 

Heat 16 Result: 6 – 4 – 2 Time: 29.26 Distances: 6 - 7 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

68 2 Lisnakill Xpress 2.99 E P, fd   No bid 

69 4 Frisky Lady 3.05 Sl aw, ev ch   No bid 

70 6 Spartanero 2.98 E P, al led 3000 1800 No 

Heat 17 Result:3 – 5 – 1 Time: 29.89 Distances: 14 - 13 



Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

71 1 Buddys Gold 3.07 Blkd 1st  Not put Up for sale 

74 3 Bellfield Vieri 3.01 Ev aw, al led  450 Yes 

75 5 Sunshine Mike 3.04 Blkd 1st  Not put  Up for sale 

Heat 18 Result: 4 – 2 – 6  Time: 29.37 Distances: 1 – 3.5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

76 2  Roisins Prince 2.96 E P, ev ch  550 Yes 

77 6 Blue Disguise 3.01 Ev aw, fd   No bid 

78 4 Spartaroo 3.04 Sl aw, ran on  800 Yes 

Heat 19 Result: 3 – 5 – 1 Time: 29.64 Distances: 2.5 - nk 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

79 5 Slim Chance 2.94 F aw, fd 500 300 No 

83 3 Gaytime Mac 2.99 E P, ran on 600 300 No 

84 1 Sparta Zip 3.13 Sl aw, ran on   No bid 

Heat 20 Result: 6 – 4 – 2 Time: 29.90 Distances: 3 - 10 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

87 2 Daithis Pet 3.10 Sl aw, nv sh   No Bid 

89 4 Avalon Atcha 2.96 E.P., fd   No 

92 6 Cathals Ace 3.07 Sl aw, ran on  250 Yes 

Heat 21 Result: 1 – 3 – 5 Time: 29.60 Distances: 0.5 - 2 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

93 1 In The Nile 3.12 Sl aw, ran on   No 

97 3 Elbony Cool Blond 2.99 E. P., ev ch   No 

98 5 Flying Rocklands 3.00 Ev aw, fd   No 

Heat 22 Result: 2 – 4 Time: 29.61 Distances: 0.5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

99 2 Dirty Socks 2.98 E.P, held on  650 Yes 



103 4 Micks Smasher 2.97 E.P. ran on   No bid 

        

Heat 23 Result: 2 – 4 Time: 29.41 Distances: 3 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

106 4 Perfect Star 2.89 Q aw, fd   No bid 

107 2 Sublime Lady 3.14 Sl. Aw, ran on   No bid 

        

Heat 24 Result: 3 – 5 – 1 Time: 16.62 Distances: 4 – 3.5 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

22 1 Productivity  Blkd   No bid 

46 3 Chaotic Royal  E.P, ran on   No 

48 5 Bookies Profit  Ev aw, ev ch   No 

Heat 25 Result: 4 – 6 – 2 Time: 16.57 Distances: 3 - 8 

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

53 6 Valais Gypsy  Ev aw, ev ch   No bid 

101 2 Lacken Girl  Ev aw, nv sh   No bid 

102 4 Blue Tungsten  E. P., al led  300 Yes 

Heat 26 Result: Solo Time: 16.71 Distances:  

Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

109 2 Geneva Gent     No bid 

        

        

 


