
Thurles Greyhound Stadium SALES 13TH SEPTEMBER 2008 
TRIAL1             Result: 1  5  3                     Time:29.73                Distances: 2   2.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

1 1 PUMPKIN LIGHT  1.93 Ld1 Styd   1650 Y 

2 3 STATION MANOR  1.87 Smb3 Rnon    550 Y 

4 5 DANCE NOKEE  1.89 Evaw Rnon  2000 950 N 

 
TRIAL 2           Result: 6  4  2         Time: 29.75                 Distances: 1    3  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

5 2 TRACYS SAVINGS  1.82 Qaw outp   500 Y 

6 4 DART ALONG  1.94 Slaw Finwl  1500 600 N 

7 6 CLOHEENA SPIKE  1.81 Faw Styd   2900 Y 

 
TRIAL 3            Result: 1  5  3          Time: 29.61                     Distances:  4    8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
9 1 BOHERNA CRASH  1.90 Evaw Ald   2000 Y 
10 3 SPORTING FLOWER  1.91 Evaw Fd   200 Y 
11 5 MOVING AROUND  2.03 Slaw Rnon  1500 Y 

 
TRIAL 4        Result: 6  2  4               Time: 29.71                           Distances: 6    1.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
12 2 DRAKESHEAD BUZZ 1.93 Slaw Blk1   650 Y 

13 4 BERS ROSE  1.93 Slaw Blk1   200 Y 

14 6 DEBIDEE PONY  1.93 Slaw Finwl 2500 1000 Y 
 

TRIAL 5           Result: 3  5  1              Time:29.93         Distances: 2.5    9 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
15 1 APRIL ROSE  2.06 Slaw Nvsh   750 Y 

16 3 DRAKESHEAD JEWEL  1.88 Faw Ald  1000 500 N 
17 5 UNKNOWN BECKY  2.02 Slaw Finwl   400 Y 

 
TRIAL 6     Result: 6  2  4                  Time:  30.04             Distances: 2.5    0.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
3 6 DRAKESHEAD ACE  1.87 Qaw Finwl   600 Y 

18 2 DRUMBANE DIVA  1.99 Ld3 Blk4  750 Y 

19 4 CORPORATE INDEX  1.90 Slaw Blk4  0 N 
 
TRIAL 7        Result:  3  1  5                  Time:  29.67                     Distances:  7     2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
20 1 CINNAMON LASS  1.88 Ld1 Outp   375 Y 

21 3 TIA MIA  1.94 Slaw Finwl   1500 Y 

8 5 DRAKESHEAD TOTTI 1.95 Slaw Rnon  1000 450 N 



TRIAL  8            Result: 2  6  4             Time: 29.75               Distances:  4      0.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

22 2 CHARMED MILLIE  1.95 Slaw Finwll  1500 Y 

23 4 CA WILL SE  1.91 Qaw Outp   900 Y 

25 6 FIELD SON  2.02 Slaw Rnon   900 Y 

 
TRIAL  9            Result: 3  5  1         Time:29.94           Distances: 5     14 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
26 1 ADORATION  1.90 Evaw Fd   250 Y 

27 3 WHITEGATE CLASS  2.14 StydTp Finwl   650 Y 

28 5 CLONEEN ROXY  1.98 Slaw Rnon   250 Y 
 

TRIAL  10           Result: 6  2  4            Time: 29.90           Distances:  1     12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
29 2 ELDEABLO  1.90 Ld3 Evch   450 Y 

30 4 GLENBRIEN DEUCE  2.17 Slaw Nvsh   200 Y 

32 6 DANCE VINTO  2.00 Slaw Finwl   1350 Y 

 
TRIAL  11           Result: 5  1  3               Time: 29.82                        Distances: 2    10.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
34 1 NINE LETTER WORD  1.99 Ld4 Evch   800 Y 

35 3 GLENBRIEN QUEEN  2.11 Slaw Nvsh   150.00 Y 

36 5 FERDIA MONARCH  2.15 Slaw Finwll  2100 Y 

 
TRIAL  12           Result: 4  2  6           Time: 29.97             Distances:  1    12  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 2 HONDO LAD  1.97 Blk1 Rnon   1300 Y 

38 4 CLONARK BRETT  1.85 Faw Ald  0 500 Y 

39 6 LARKINS WAY  1.97 Slaw Blk1   150 Y 

 
TRIAL  13           Result: 1  5  3          Time:  29.27                    Distances:  6    3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
42 1 VOLCANIC STONE  1.86 Qaw Finwl   0 N 

43 3 GOOD TURN  1.97 Slaw Rnon  1500 1100 N 

45 5 DOYLEMORR GILLY  1.77 Faw Outp   1050 Y 
 

TRIAL  14           Result: 2  6  4                 Time: 29.68          Distances: sh     10.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
46 2 ROCKVIEW MICK  1.84 Ld2 Finwl   1100 Y 

47 4 JOSIES DANCER  1.89 Evaw Fd  1000 300 N 
48 6 VOLCANIC ROCK  1.85 Qaw Finwl   0 N 
 



TRIAL  15            Result: 1  5  3                    Time: 28.99              Distances: 11     11 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

49 1 MALZIEU  1.82 Faw Ald   9500 Y 

50 3 EMLY FINAL  1.87 Qaw Outp   0 N 

51 5 BOND OF MAGIC  1.95 Slaw Rnon   0 N 

 
TRIAL  16            Result: 4  6  2                    Time:  29.91              Distances :  12     nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
52 2 EMLY PARK  1.93 Slaw Nvsh   350 N 

55 4 CORBALLY BOND  1.81 Qaw Ald   1350 Y 

56 6 PAKIES PRAYER  1.93 Slaw Nvsh   400 Y 
 

TRIAL 17           Result: 5  1  3                       Time:  29.86                      Distances:  1.5    0.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
57 1 KEWELL CROO  1.93 Slaw Rnon  1500 800 N 

58 3 MARK FENIAN  1.89 Crd1 Rnon  1000 650 N 

59 5 CORCASS SPARK  1.93 Slaw Finwll  600 Y 

 
TRIAL 18           Result: 4  6  2     Time:  30.14                        Distances:  2    2.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
60 2 SHIFTING GEARS  1.87 Faw Outp   0 N 

61 4 DAVY DARK NIGHT  1.84 Qaw Finwl  1500 950 N 
63 6 RATHCABIN MIKEY  1.94 Slaw Rnon   200 Y 

 
TRIAL 19           Result:  3  1  5                 Time :29.82                   Distances : 1.5     1.5  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
54 5 ONLYFOOLSRUSHIN  1.96 Slaw Rnon   600 Y 

64 1 BALLYPHILIP LADY  1.81 Faw Evch   0 N 

65 3  BLACK BAR  1.87 Faw Ald   700 Y 
 

TRIAL 20           Result: 2  6  4           Time: 29.34                    Distances: 8    nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
67 2 FAST APPROACH  1.97 Evaw Ald   2200 Y 

68 4 BALLYPHILIP SON  1.91 Qaw Outp   0 N 

69 6 BLACK BLOB  1.94 Evaw Finwl   300 Y 
 

TRIAL  21           Result: 5  3  1     Time:  29.33                 Distances: 1.5      10.5  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

71 1 BLACK BOTTLE  1.85 Faw Outp   400 Y 

72 3 BALLYPHILIP BUD  1.88 Qaw Finwl   900 Y 

78 5 RELIVER  1.87 Ld1 Styd   1900 Y 

 



TRIAL  22            Result: 2  6  4           Time:  29.34                 Distances: 11.5     4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

77 2 BALLYPHILIP BALL  1.81 Faw Ald   2550 Y 

79 4 ANTOM MUSIC  1.89 Evaw Nvsh   0 N 

80 6 MS HONEYBLISS  1.86 Qaw Outp   250 Y 

      
TRIAL  23           Result:   5  3  1                     Time :    29.58               Distances :  5     8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
81 1 KILLANNY HEIGHTS  1.89 Evaw Nvsh   No Bid N 

83 3 DONS PEARL  2.05 Slaw Rnon   200 Y 

84 5 GLENBANE CHIEF  1.82 Qaw Ald  3000 1700 N 

 
TRIAL  24           Result:   2  6  4                    Time:  29.83                    Distances : 5     5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
85 6 BEANOS SUPREME  1.85 Qaw Outp   350 Y 

86 2 BOG CROSS SPIKEY  1.91 Faw Ald   1800 Y 

88 4 CLONOULTY MAC  2.10 Slaw Nvsh   1000 Y 

 
TRIAL  25           Result:   5  1  3                  Time :   30.31                    Distances : 3    1  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
97 1 ANOTHER TOM  1.89 Evaw Blk1   No Bid N 

98 3 LADY SUMMERHILL  1.88 Qaw Blk1   No Bid N 
100 5 MOATVIEW CHIEF  1.95 Crd 1  Rnon   1200 Y 

 
TRIAL  26           Result:    6  2  4               Time:  29.56                       Distances :  2     4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
102 2 MARDOCS NANI 1.92 Slaw Rnon    N 

105 4 EASY EIGHT  1.85 Qaw Outp   600 Y 

106 6 NEXT TO YOU  1.82 Faw Ald   1700 Y 

 
TRIAL  27           Result:  5  1  3                   Time:   29.80                      Distances : nk     3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
110 1 LILCHIEFDINGDONG  1.86 Evaw Evch    N 

114 3 COLLAGE EXPRESS  1.74 Faw Outp   600 Y 
115 5 LEAHS BLUE  1.94 Slaw Finwl   900 Y 
 
TRIAL  28           Result:  6  4  2           Time :  29.92                Distances: sh       3.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
119 2 TOMS MIX UP  1.82 Qaw Outp   No Bid N 

121 4 BLACK WEST  1.88 Evaw Evch   200 Y 
125 6 CLOMANTAGH HAZEL  2.04 Slaw Finwl   600 Y 

 
    



TRIAL  29            Result: 4   6                     Time: 29.27               Distances: 2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
128 6 SPARROWS MARK  1.89 Faw Finwl   600 Y 

129 4 MARDOCS CARRICK  1.77 Faw Ald   0 N 
        

 
   TRIAL  30  600yds      Result:   5  2            Time:   33.78                   Distances: sh 

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
124 5 THE OTHER POST  6.10 Faw Styd    N 

130 2 BEANOS ROONEY  6.23 Slaw Finwl   350 Y 

        
 

   TRIAL  31  570yds          Result: 3  6               Time:  31.61                Distances:  8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
108 3 MINNIES BOND  4.36 Faw Ald   1800 Y 

111 6 ARD LARK  4.41 Evaw Outp    N 

        

 
   TRIAL  32   330yds         Result:  3  5  1         Time: 18.33         Distances: 0.5    7 

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 1 STOUKE HAWK   Slaw Rnon   200 Y 

70 3 FROSTY FOGGY   Faw Ald   250 Y 

74 5 MAGICAL BRAD   Qaw Finwl    N 

        
 

     TRIAL  33  330yds          Result: 3  6            Time: 18.49                Distances  10  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
118 6 SHINGAUN TEDDY   CkRu Rnon    N 

126 3 TYFORD LADY   ClrRn Rnon    N 

        

 
   TRIAL  34  750yds   Result:  5   1          Time: 44.06           Distances:   1.5 

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
87 1 SMOOTH FANTASY  14.45 Slaw Rnon    N 

104 5 CROHANE CHORUS  14.08 Faw Styd   200 Y 

        

 


