Thurles Greyhound Stadium Sales : Saturday 67 December 2008

TRIAL 1 RESULT:3 1 5 TIME: 30.12 DISTANCES 7.5 5.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

2 1 Smiddy Hill 1.99 Evaw Rnon 450 Y

4 3 Lissaroon Omer| 2.04 Slaw Finwll 950 Y

5 5 Stouke Miller | 1.94 |Ld 2 Outp 200 Y

TRIAL 2 RESULT :2 4 6 TIME: 30.64 DISTANCES: 6.5 1.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

6 2 Gilti Boozer 194 |Ld1 Styd 500 Y

7 4 Kilkilahara Lady 1.92 Evaw Rnon No Bid | N

8 6 Effernogue Box¢ 2.01 Slaw Rnon 200 Y

TRIAL 3 RESULT:3 1 § TIME : 29.76 DISTANCES: 6 11.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

9 1 Lissaroon Rosa| 2.04 Slaw Rnon 750 Y

10 |3 Dalcash Hanora| 1.98 Faw Ald 3800 |Y

1 |5 Gilti Dreamer | 2.11 Slaw Nvsh 200 Y

TRIAL 4 RESULT: 2 4 6 TIME: 30.95 DISTANCES: 3 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

12 |2 Backonthebeat | 1.95 Slaw Finwll 200 Y

14 |4 Emotional Char¢ 1.98 Ld 4 Fdrin 1000 |Y

15 |6 Lissaroon Ennvi 2.08 Slaw Rnon No Bid | N

TRIAL RESULT:3 1 5 TIME: 30.18 DISTANCES: 5 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

16 |1 Gift Card 2.03 | Slaw Blkd 1 N

18 |3 Dame Lee 1.90 Faw Ald 900 Y

20 |5 Close it Out 1.94 | Blkd 1 Nvsh N

TRIAL 6 RESULT: 6 2 4 TIME: 30.15 DISTANCES: 6 3.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

21 |2 Effernogue Roy| 1.98 | Evaw Rnon 350 Y

22 |4 Going Buddist | 2.02 | Slaw Nvsh No Bid | N




123 |6 | Boozed Bidder |2.05 | Slaw Ald | 1800 |Y |
TRIAL 7 RESULT:S 3 1 TIME:30.00 DISTANCES: 6.5 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

24 |1 Valleymount Pal 2.10 | Strl 1 Nvsh 300 Y

26 |3 Classy Quest | 1.81 Faw Outp 450 Y

28 |5 Boozed Royal |1.96 | Slaw Finwll 2000 |Y

TRIAL 8 RESULT:4 2 6 TIME:30.42 DISTANCES : 0.5 0.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

29 |2 Dance Glenda | 1.90 Ld 4 Evch 1000 | 450 N

31 |4 Airmount Aussie 1.89 | Ld 1 Styd 700 Y

32 |6 Respectable Lag 2.15 | Slaw Finwll 700 Y

TRIAL 9 RESULT: 3 5 1 TIME: 30.14 DISTANCES: 2 9
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

33 |1 Graiguenoe Phil 1.95 Ld 2 Outp 250 Y

35 |3 Airmount Dad | 2.02 | Slaw Finwll 800 Y

36 |5 Minnies Dora | 1.96 Evaw Rnon 900 Y

TRIAL 10 RESULT: 4 2 6 TIME :30.14 DISTANCES: 1.5 3.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

38 |2 Classy Heights | 1.96 | Evaw Evch 1100 |Y

40 |4 Movealong Con| 1.94 Evaw Finwll 2500 | 1700 |N

41 |6 Garryglass Gue{ 1.91 Blkd 1 Rnon 500 Y

TRIAL 11 RESULT:3 1 5§ TIME : 30.08 DISTANCES :8 3.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

42 |1 Marlfield Inn 2.06 | Slaw Rnon 350 Y

43 |3 Rapid Rescue |1.95 | Evaw Ald 1300 |Y

4 |5 Garryglass Bud| 2.26 | Slaw Nvsh 300. Y

TRIAL 12 RESULT :4 2 6 TIME :30.45 DISTANCES Sh 2



3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

45 |2 Movealong Sun | 1.97 | Crd 1 Finwll 500 Y

46 |4 Broad World 1.84 |Ld1 Styd 1500 | 1250 |N

47 |6 Dance Mer 1.97 | Slaw Finwll 900 500 N

TRIAL 13 RESULT:3 1 5 TIME : 30.81 DISTANCES : 3 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

43 |1 Fandango Bob |2.10 | Slaw Rnon N

49 |3 Memories Prize| 2.06 Slaw Finwll 350 Y

50 |5 Marlfield Anne | 1.88 Faw Fd No Bid | N

TRIAL 14 RESULT : 4 6 2 TIME: 30.30 DISTANCES : 3.5 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

51 |2 Splash Spot 1.99 | Slaw Rnon 200 Y

52 |4 Movealong Coin 2.03 |Ld 2 Styd 1300 |Y

53 |6 Memories Revie 1.94 Evaw Rnon 1500 | 500 N

TRIAL 15 RESULT : 5 3 1 TIME :29.91 DISTANCES : 6.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

54 |1 Isnt it Cruel 1.99 | Slaw Rnon 200 Y

55 |3 Living Plan 1.97 | Slaw Rnon 1050 |Y

56 |5 Patterdale Rafa] 1.93 | Qaw Ald 2900 |Y

TRIAL 16 RESULT : 4 6 2 TIME : 29.90 DISTANCES 13 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

59 |2 Dahlgren Ted | 1.92 Ld 2 Outp No Bid | N

60 |1 Automatic 1.91 Evaw Finwll 2100 |Y

61 |6 On Call Again | 1.87 | Faw Outp 800 200 N

TRIAL 17 RESULT:1 § 3 TIME:30.24 DISTANCES : 9.5 §
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

62 |1 Blastoff Charlie| 1.92 Faw Ald 800 350 N

63 |3 Daring Impact | 2.02 | Slaw Nvsh N

65 |5 Effernogue Bail¢ 1.96 | Slaw Nvsh N

TRIAL 18 RESULT:2 4 6 TIME : 30.07 DISTANCES :7 5



Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

66 |2 Angry Planet | 2.15 | Slaw Finwll 2000 |Y

67 |4 Airmount Keano| 2.04 Ld 2 Outp No Bid | N

68 |6 Daring Roy 1.97 Evaw Nvsh N

TRIAL 19 RESULT:1 5 3 TIME : 30.17 DISTANCES : 4 14
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

69 |1 Mandeville Abby 2.00 |Ld 1 Styd 750 Y

70 |3 Rodandgo 1.93 | Evaw Nvsh N

71 |5 Kennmc Daisy | 2.02 | Slaw Rnon N

TRIAL 20 RESULT: 4 2 6 TIME : 30.20 DISTANCES : 3 12
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

72 |2 Melting lce 1.92 | Ld 1 Outp 600 Y

73 |4 Mardocs Mary |2.04 | Slaw Finwll N

74 |6 Neidins Dream | 1.95 Evaw Nvsh 500 400 N

TRIAL 21 RESULT :1 § 3 TIME : 29.97 DISTANCES :15 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

7% |1 Cloneen Bertie | 1.90 Evaw Ald 2000 |Y

76 |5 Route Sixty 1.91 Evaw Nvsh 600 Y

77 |3 Ballylahy Lady | 2.01 Slaw Nvsh No Bid | N

TRIAL 22 RESULT: 2 6 4 TIME : 29.34 DISTANCES 11.5 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

78 |2 Micks Brett 2.00 |Ld4 Evch 1000 | 300 N

79 |4 Hi Buckaroo 1.92 Evaw Rnon N

80 |6 Mardocs Jackie| 1.89 | Faw Finwll N

TRIAL 23" RESULT:5 3 1 TIME: 29.77 DISTANCES: 8 5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

81 |1 Effernogue Cod| 2.04 | Crd 1 Nvsh 350 Y

82 |3 Schofield Kenny 2.02 | Crd 1 Rnon 600 Y

83 |5 Power Spray 1.79 | Faw Ald 1700 |Y




DISTANCES : 5.5 1

2

TRIAL 24 RESULT:6 4 2 TIME: 30.46

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

85 |2 Mardocs Anna | 2.09 Blkd 1 Rnon N

87 |4 Mileheight Lass| 2.19 | Slaw Blkd 300 Y

88 |6 Dromana Becky| 2.16 Blkd 1 Finwll 1450 |Y

TRIAL 25 RESULT:1 3 5 TIME: 30.25 DISTANCES: 2 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

90 |1 Schofield Lilly | 1.87 | Blkd 1 Rnon 1000 |Y

91 |3 Mardocs Ava 1.95 Blkd 1 Rnon N

92 |5 Ballyhane Cross 2.00 | Slaw Finwll 500 Y

TRIAL 26 RESULT :4 2 6 TIME: 30.10 DISTANCES 1.5 10
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

94 |2 All About Power 1.87 | Ld 4 Evch 1500 | 1000 |N

97 |4 Mardocs Busby | 1.87 | Qaw Finwll N

99 |6 Shyan Scaler |2.08 | Slaw Nvsh No Bid | N

TRIAL 27 RESULT: 5 3 1 TIME : 30.14 DISTANCES 2.5 11
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

100 | 1 Doree Lucy 1.82 | Qaw Crd 1 No Bid | N

103 |3 Famous Legend| 1.87 Evaw Crd 1 450 Y

104 | 5 Cappa Key 1.74 | Faw Ald 600 Y

TRIAL 28 RESULT : 4 6 2 TIME: 30.10 DISTANCES: 3 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

105 | 2 River Dazzle 2.16 | Slaw Rnon 500 400 N

107 |4 Kewell Croo 1.84 | Qaw Finwll 700 Y

108 |6 Flamingo Flight| 1.80 |Ld 4 Evch 600 Y

TRIAL 29 RESULT:3 1 § TIME: 31.50 DISTANCES : 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

109 | 1 Ballylarkin lvy | 1.95 | Slaw Rnon N

110 |3 Whistler Bound | 1.85 | Blkd 1 Blkd 4 | 1000 | 600 N

13 |5 Dylan Flight 1.84 | Blkd 1 Blkd 4 |800 300 N




DISTANCES: 14 0.5

DISTANCES: 0.5 12

DISTANCES: 0.5 2

5

TRIAL 30 RESULT:2 6 4 TIME: 29.74 DISTANCES: 5 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
114 |2 Millies Crash | 1.92 | Evaw Finwll 1400 | 400 N
115 | 4 Francescomeho| 1.93 Evaw Nvsh No Bid | N
116 | 6 River Razzle 2.00 | Slaw Rnon 1000 | 700 N
TRIAL 31 RESULT: 3 5 1 TIME : 29.76

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
17 |1 Snowmoy 1.97 | Evaw Nvsh N
118 |3 Mileheight Leon| 1.87 | Faw Ald 1100 |Y
119 |5 Campfire Lady | 2.04 | Slaw Nvsh No Bid | N
TRIAL 32 RESULT: 6 2 4 TIME: 30.46

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
122 | 6 Kango Tommy |1.85 | Qaw Finwll No Bid | N
124 | 2 Grandad Tom | 1.82 Ld 4 Evch 500 Y
125 | 4 Great Job 2.05 | Slaw Nvsh No Bid | N
TRIAL 33 RESULT:5 1 3 TIME: 30.36

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
127 |1 Normandy Lodg( 1.91 Faw Evch No Bid | N
130 | 5 Chilly Queen 1.93 | Qaw Ald No Bid | N
131 |3 Realt Geal 1.96 Slaw Rnon 110 Y
TRIAL 34 RESULT:4 2 6 TIME: 29.56 DISTANCES: 1 15
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
132 |2 Old Mill Wish | 1.94 | Slaw Finwll 3000 [2600 |N
133 | 4 Kevinsfort Majoy 1.78 | Faw Ald 2000 (1750 |N
134 |6 Chilly Lady 1.89 | Evaw Nvsh N
TRIAL 35 RESULT: § 3 1 TIME: 18.71 DISTANCES: 1
330 yds

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold
136 |1 Masonbrook Bid Slaw Rnon N
138 |3 Galtee Rover Faw Outp N
106 | 5 Smooth Wine Evaw Finwll 275 Y




TRIAL 36 RESULT : 4 TIME: 29.73 DISTANCES :
Solo

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserv| Bid Sold

13 |4 Galloping Hogar 1.88 | Faw Styd 1500 |Y




