
Thurles Greyhound Stadium SALES 2ND AUGUST 2008 
TRIAL1             Result: 1  5  3                     Time:29.60                Distances: 10  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
1 1 LADY WATERLOO 2.03 Evaw Finwll  2000.00 Y 

2 3 Fence me In 1.95 Qaw Outp  500.00 Y 
3 5 Dance Hazel 1.99 Slaw Rnon  500.00 Y 

 
TRIAL 2           Result:2  4  6         Time: 30.14                  Distances: 3  7 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
5 2 Malta Lad 1.97 Ld 1 Styd  800.00 Y 

6 4 Kennmc Lily 1.95 Slaw Rnon  600.00 Y 
7 6 Class Eagle 2.05 Slaw Nvsh  200.00 Y 

 
TRIAL 3            Result:3  5  1          Time:29.88                     Distances:  7  4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
8 1 Rodandgo 2.11 Slaw Nvsh  350.00 Y 
9 3 Annasuma 2.02 Faw Ald  1550.00 Y 
10 5 Dance Torres 2.01 Slaw Rnon  800.00 Y 
 
TRIAL 4        Result:6  4  2               Time: 29.83                           Distances: 6  9 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 2 Kennmc Daisy 1.98 Slaw Nvsh  No Bid N 
12 4 Solid Rascal 1.93 Qaw Outp  450.00 Y 
13 6 Matching Amy 2.14 Slaw Finwl  2000.00 Y 

 
TRIAL 5           Result:1  5  3              Time:29.84        Distances: 3  Sh 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 1 Eastbound 2.03 Slaw Finwll  2600.00 Y 
15 3 By the Best 1.98 Slaw Rnon  1300.00 Y 
16 5 Rumble Sunrise 1.81 Faw Outp 2000.00 950.00 N 

 
TRIAL 6     Result: 2  6  4                Time:  29.92             Distances: 7  4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
17 2 Manic Chanel 1.91 Ld 1 Styd  1800.00 Y 
18 4 Burnt Ebony 1.96 Slaw Nvsh  150.00 Y 
19 6 Headland 2.03 Slaw Rnon  1700.00 Y 
 
TRIAL 7        Result:  5  3  1                Time:  29.58                     Distances:  9  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
20 1 Tawny Owl 2.22 Slaw Nvsh  200.00 Y 
21 3 Go Snakey Dooley 1.95 Ld 2 Outp  700.00 Y 
22 5 Amber Bound 2.06 Slaw Finwll  1550.00 Y 



TRIAL  8            Result: 2  6  4                 Time: 30.38                Distances:3.5  6.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
23 2 Calling Light 2.09 Slaw Finwll  300.00 Y 

24 4 Ballylarkin Ivy 2.06 Slaw Nvsh  No Bid N 
26 6 Sorbonne 1.94 Qaw  Outp  550.00 Y 

 
TRIAL  9            Result:3  5  1              Time:29.77           Distances: 0.5  6  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
27 1 The Other Sarah 2.09 Slaw Nvsh  450.00 Y 
28 3 Faithful Bill 1.94 Ld 1 Styd  1100.00 Y 
29 5 Handy Option 1.90 Evaw Finwll  900.00 Y 

 
TRIAL  10           Result: 4  2  6          Time: 30.13           Distances:  3  3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
30 2 The Other Nikki 2.10 Slaw Rnon  350.00 Y 
31 4 Rocobilly Rumble 1.84 Ld 1 Styd  1500.00 Y 
32 6 Leaha Jewel 1.94 Evaw Outp  No Bid N 

 
TRIAL  11           Result: 5  1  3               Time: 29.51                        Distances: 12  8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
35 1 The Other Holly 1.86 Qaw Outp  350.00 Y 
36 3 Fancy Fantasy 1.94 Slaw Nvsh  150.00 Y 
38 5 Clondoty Susie 1.87 Faw Finwll  2000.00 Y 

 
TRIAL  12           Result: 6  4  2          Time: 30.10             Distances:  2  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
39 2 Kendys Crash 2.01 Slaw Rnon  No Bid N 
40 4 The  Other Bobby 2.11 Slaw Finwll 2000.00 1000.00 N 
41 6 Roisins Queen 1.88 Qaw Ald  350.00 Y 
 
TRIAL  13           Result: 1  3  5          Time:  29.54                    Distances:  5.5  5   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
42 1 Maeves Fantasy 1.87 Faw Ald  900.00 Y 
43 3 Pecular 1.86 Qaw Outp  700.00 Y 
44 5 Minimarket Queen 1.94 Slaw Nvsh   N 

 
TRIAL  14           Result: 6  2  4                Time:29.69           Distances: 2  14 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
46 2 Butch Fantasy 1.90 Qaw Outp  800.00 Y 
47 4 Goth the Beauty 2.05 Slaw Nvsh  150.00 Y 
48 6 Nametab Zorro 2.02 Slaw Finwll  1800.00 Y 
 



TRIAL  15            Result:1  3  5                    Time: 30.14              Distances:2  8  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
49 1 Sharon Sister 1.97 Slaw Finwll  300.00 Y 

52 3 Calling Snapper 2.01 Slaw Rnon  300.00 Y 
53 5 Action Man 1.86 Faw Outp  200.00 Y 

 
TRIAL  16            Result: 6  4  2                       Time:  29.95                     Distances :  1  4.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
54 2 Portico Amy 1.89 Qaw Outp  300.00 Y 
55 4 Home Wendy 1.82 Ld 4 Evch  450.00 Y 
56 6 Break the Cycle 1.88 Faw Finwll  950.00 Y 

 
TRIAL 17           Result: 5  3  1                           Time:  29.48                      Distances:  6.5  6.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
51 1 Beckys Mentor 1.89 Slaw Nvsh  No Bid N 
57 3 Smooth Grip 1.82 Qaw Outp  350.00 Y 
26 5 Clear The Water 1.85 Faw Finwll  1700.00 Y 

 
TRIAL 18           Result:5  1  3           Time:  30.35                        Distances:  1.5   3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
59 1 Shiloh Express 1.95 Slaw Blkd 4  1800.00 Y 
60 3 Dylon Flight 1.86 W 4  Evch   N 
61 5 Wok the Dancer 1.87 Qaw Finwll  550.00 Y 

 
TRIAL 19           Result:  4  6  2                 Time : 29.29                   Distances : 7  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
63 2 Come on Sam 1.91 Qaw Outp 800.00 550.00 N 
64 4 Moatview Storm 1.89 Ld 1 Finwll  2400.00 Y 
65 6  Queen Merykara 1.86 Qaw Outp  450.00 Y 

 
TRIAL 20           Result: 5  1  3        Time:29.94             Distances: 1.5     8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
66 1 Brocklamont 2.04 Evaw Rnon 800.00 400.00 N 
70 3 Private Tequila 2.34 Msdbk Rnon  300.00 Y 
71 5 Greyfriars Susie 1.93 Qaw Ald  600.00 Y 

 
TRIAL  21           Result:6  4  2    Time:  29.61                 Distances: 9  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
73 2 Kirstys Delight 1.88 Faw Fdrin  350.00 Y 

75 4 Kingoftherun 2.04 Slaw Rnon  150.00 Y 
76 6 Competitive 1.87 Qaw Ald 1500.00 800.00 N 

 



TRIAL  22            Result: 1  5  3             Time: 29.84                     Distances: 8  6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
77 1 Derg Honcho 1.98 Ld 1 Styd  400.00 Y 

78 3 Lasna Flyer 2.03 Slaw Nvsh   N 
79 5 Sooty Scholes 1.99 Slaw Rnon   N 

      
TRIAL  23           Result:   6  4  2                       Time :    29.71               Distances :  0.5  5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
80 2 White String 1.89 Blkd 1 Rnon  No Bid N 
82 4 Applegreen Flyer 1.90 Blkd 1 Rnon  800.00 Y 
84 6 Face The Facts 1.89 Faw Finwll  No Bid N 

 
TRIAL  24           Result:   1  3  5                      Time:  29.32                     Distances : 7.5  5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
85 5 Bowlerstown Lass 1.91 Slaw Nvsh  No Bid N 
88 3 Home Asha 2.06 Slaw Rnon   N 
92 1 The Other Desert 1.91 Ld 1  Styd  2800.00 Y 

 
TRIAL  25           Result:   1  5  3                     Time :   30.06                    Distances : 1  3.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
81 1 Clew Bay 1.92 Evaw Ald  No Bid N 
86 3 Hey Lintola 2.02 Slaw Rnon  No Bid N 
37 5 Lost Honcho 1.99 Crd 1  Finwll 1500.00 400.00 N 

 
TRIAL  26           Result:    4  2  6                  Time:  29.57                        Distances :  3  4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
95 2 Loyal Express 2.06 Slaw Finwll   N 
96 4 Rosie and Jim 1.95 Evaw Finwll  500.00 Y 
99 6 Eureka Express 1.90 Ld 1  Outp   N 

Solo 600 yds 
TRIAL  27           Result:                         Time:   34.00                      Distances :  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
94 3 Home Eddie 5.86 Solo   N 
        
        

330 yds 
TRIAL  28           Result:  5  3  1          Time :  18.50                Distances: 6  3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
4 1 Acton Wisdom  Blkd 1 Rnon  No Bid N 
62 3 London Lady  Evas Rnon  No Bid N 
67 5 Moatview Mint  Faw Ald  550.00 Y 

 
    



TRIAL  29            Result: 2  5                        Time: 17.95               Distances: 2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
69 2 Ignored  Faw Ald 2000.00 1200.00 N 
98 5 Mellison Ranger  Qaw Evch  500.00 Y 
        

 
 


