
Heat 1            Result:3-5-1        Time: 29.44  Distances:  7 -3  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks  Bid Sold Y/N 
1 1 Zulu Zoom  Slaw nvsh 200 200 yes 

2 3 Fionntra Susie  Faw Ald 1000 1000 yes 
3 5 Sydney Rose  Evaw Evch 475 475 yes 

 
Heat 2            Result:   5-1-3   Time:  29.76   Distances:      8 - 1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
4 1 Keyano River  Evaw Ran on   No bid 

5 3 Kermit Returns  Evaw Evch 200 200 yes 
6 5 Bua Georgia  Faw Ald 350 350 yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:3-5-1      Time: 29.27             Distances:   4  -  10    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
7 1 Brave Revival  Evaw Outp 200 200 yes 
8 3 Rith Marangaoth  Evaw Finwl 1400 1400 yes 
9 5 Tiermana Ace  Faw Evch 700 700 yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:3-1-5              Time:     29.53         Distances:     1.5  -  8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 1 Zulu Sue  Evaw Finwl 750 750 yes 
13 3 Bronogue State  Faw Ald 550 550 Yes 
14 5 Kyle Survivor  Evaw Evch   No bid 

 
Heat 5            Result:  1-3-5           Time:29.23         Distances:     5  -  shd  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
15 1 Blue turmoil  Faw Ald 2800 2800 yes 
16 3 Bucks Daz  Evaw ran on 600 600 yes 
17 5 Fionntra betty  Evaw ran on 1500 1000 no 

 
Heat 6            Result:    5-1-3        Time: 29.48                 Distances:      0.50  -  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
18 1 Bua Oregon  Faw Evch 700 700 yes 
19 3 Gouig friend  Evaw Ran on 300 300 yes 
20 5 Oyster Music  Evaw Finwl 950 950 yes 

 
Heat 7            Result:  3-1-5          Time29.41:               Distances: 4  -  4      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
21 1 Seashore breeze  Evaw Ranon 700 700 yes 
22 3 Kyle Premier  Evaw Finwl 1000 1000 yes 
23 5 Tiermana Diamond  Slaw Outp 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 8            Result:  3-1-5     Time:  29.88        Distances:  1-6 



Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
24 1 Mythical Vera  Evaw Evch   No bid 

25 3 Vermont Fancy  Evaw Finwl 750 750 yes 
26 5 Habawna  Slaw Ran on Not put Up for  sale 

 
Heat 9            Result:  1-5-3      Time29.77:              Distances:  3—1.5    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
27 1 Clonbony Saoirse  Faw Cmag 300 300 yes 
29 3 Lickadoon Yeelen  Evaw Faded 500 250 yes 
30 5 Steeple Rd Liam  Evaw ran on 550 550 yes 

 
Heat 10           Result:    1-5-3    Time: 29.77             Distances:       0.50  -  0.50 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
31 1 Kyle Fantasy  Evaw Ran on 600 600 yes 
32 3 Bronogue Elite  Faw Evch 700 700 yes 
33 5 Oyster Moon  Evaw Finwl 700 700 yes 

 
Heat 11           Result:     3=1=5      Time:   29.35           Distances:     5  -  10 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
34 1 Ballyhorgan Best  Evaw Ranon 1200 500 no 
35 3 Dark Slaney  Faw ran on 1300 1300 yes 
36 5 Up the congo  Slaw Nvsh   No bid 

 
Heat 12           Result:     5=1=3      Time29.35:            Distances:    6  =  3    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 1 A right Druid  Evaw Evch 550 550 yes 
38 3 Glengar Imperial  Evaw Evch 250 250 yes 
39 5 Clonbony Jane  Evaw Finwl 550 550 yes 

 
Heat 13           Result:    3-5-1      Time:  29.47       Distances:     5 -  0.50   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
42 1 Fastaway Bull  Evaw Evch Not put Up for  sale 
43 3 Slaney Man  Evaw Finwl Not put Up for  sale 
47 5 Glengar Joe  Slaw Ran on 900 900 yes 

 
Heat 14           Result:  3-5-1         Time: 29.40        Distances:       2  -  6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
50 1 Cooleys Champ  Slaw Nvsh   No bid 
52 3 Bunoke Bridge  Faw Ald 800 800 yes 
53 5 Desmond Savings  Evaw Finwl 400 400 yes 
 
Heat 15            Result:  5=3=1         Time:29.54      Distances: 4  =  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 



54 1 Kilfinny Extra  Evaw Finwl   No bid 

55 3 Granada Rose  Evaw Ran on 200 200 yes 
56 5 Inislosky Plover  Faw Ald 550 550 yes 

 
Heat 16            Result: 1-3-5         Time: 29.07           Distances: 8  =  5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
57 1 Granada Prince  Evaw Finwl 3000 1000 no 
58 3 Heavens Walk  Evaw Ran on 500 500 yes 
59 5 Bright Spark  Evaw Outp   No bid 

 
Heat 17           Result: 3-5-1         Time:29.46        Distances: 2  =  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
60 1 Gortboy Katie  Evaw ran on   NO BID 
61 3 Corrough Express  Evaw Finwl 700 700 YES 
64 5 Bulgaden Castle  Faw Evch   NO BID 

 
Heat 18           Result:  3-1-5         Time: 29.05         Distances: 13  -  0.50 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
65 1 Fionntra Celt  Evaw Outp   NO BID 
67 3 Inislosky Rock  Faw Ald 2500 1100 NO 
69 5 Woodlawn Bill  Evaw Nvsh   NO BID 

 
Heat 19           Result: 3-1-5    Time: 29.14         Distances:10  -  dist 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
70 1 Kilhoran Classic  Slaw Outp   NO BID 
72 3 Silk Treasure  Faw Ald 1500 900 NO 
73 5 Broadmill Drive  Evaw Nvsh   NO BID 

 
Heat 20           Result: 3-5-1         Time:29.08          Distances:  1.5  -  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
74 1 Quarrymount Spot  Evaw Finwl 500 500 YES 
75 3 Knightscourt Boy  Faw ran on 1000 450 NO 
77 5 Earls ransom  Evaw Ran on 1200 600 NO 

 
Heat 21           Result: 2=4         Time:    29.26               Distances: 8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
78 2 Star Lleyton  Faw Ald 350 350 YES 
80 4 Ollys boots  Evaw Finwl   NO BID 
        

 
Heat 22            Result:      SOLO   550YDS      Time: 30.95          Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        



66 3 STARLIGHT ROSE      
        

 
Heat 23            Result: 2 - 4         Time: 16.84          Distances: 1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 2 HIGH MAIDEN      
48 4 Silverwood Pearl      
        

 
Heat 24           Result: 2-4         Time:   16.89                  Distances: 0.50 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
63 2 Silly Jim      
79 4 Broadmill Drive      
        

 
 
 


