
Heat 1            Result:1-5-3        Time: 29.68  Distances:  3-12  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
1 1 Lubagh Fly  Faw Ald  850 yes 

2 3 Wiz to Oz  Evaw Faded   No bid 
3 5 Dalcash State  Evaw Finwl 1500 750 no 

 
Heat 2            Result:   1-5-3   Time: 29.52    Distances: 7  -  3      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
4 1 Athlacca Lucy  Evaw Ran on  700 yes 

5 3 Hi Kewell  Evaw Outpd   No bid 
7 5 Loughbeag Lady  Slaw Evch 400 400 yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:  1-5-3   Time:   29.17           Distances:  1  -  2     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
9 1 Rathcuala Crash  Evaw Finwl 1550 1550 yes 
11 3 Blue Look  Evaw ran on 650 650 yes 
13 5 Brains to Burn  Faw Evch 1000 1000 yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:   3-5-1           Time:29.36              Distances:     10  -  8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 1 Traps Girl  Evaw Faded   No bid 
15 3 North Road Pet  Faw Ald 1150 1150 yes 
16 5 Ryans Light  Evaw Ran on Not put Up for sale 

 
Heat 5            Result: 1-3-5            Time: 29.14        Distances:  6  -  0.50    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
17 1 Whipidewhip  Evaw Finwl 1900 1900 yes 
18 3 Ballyduane  Faw Evch 700 700 yes 
20 5 Ballygibba mick  Evaw ran on 1000 450 no 

 
Heat 6            Result:   1-3-5         Time:       29.60           Distances:   5  -  1    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
22 1 Shikana  Evaw Finwl 750 750 yes 
23 3 Ballynanty Lad  Faw blk Not put  Up for sale 
25 5 Moveen is Back  Evaw ran on 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 7            Result: 3-5-1           Time: 29.70              Distances: 8  -  hd      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
27 1 Stride on Billy  Evaw ran on 250 250 yes 
28 3 Leamaneigh Geal  Faw Ald 500 500 yes 
29 5 Sox Rox  Evaw Blk   No bid 

 



Heat 8            Result:  5-1-3     Time:   29.98       Distances:  0.50  -  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
30 1 Stoneraker  Faw Evch 200 200 yes 

31 3 Ardant Alex  Evaw ran on 200 200 yes 
32 5 Enthuastic Sky  Evaw Finwl 450 450 yes 

 
Heat 9            Result: 1-3-5       Time:  29.23            Distances:     3  -  4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
33 1 Trip Adviser  Faw Ran on 2400 2400 yes 
34 3 Bettyville Flyer  Evaw Ran on 1000 300 no 
36 5 Bills Boy  Slaw ran on 500 250 no 

 
Heat 10           Result: 3-1-5      Time:   29.65          Distances:  14   -   1      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 1 Stormy Sarah  Slaw Ran on   No bid 
38 3 Bunoke King  Faw ald 850 850 yes 
39 5 Moveen Den  Slaw Outp   No bid 

 
Heat 11           Result: 3-1-5          Time: 29.41             Distances:    4  -  10  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 1 Speckylecky  Faw Evch 700 350 no 
41 3 Ardant Owen  Evaw Finwl 650 650 yes 
42 5 Glenville  Slaw Nvsh 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 12           Result:  1-3-5         Time:  29.41          Distances:     4  -  2.5   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
43 1 Comogue Knave  Slaw Finwl 850 850 yes 
47 3 Lassana Vieri  Faw Evch 250 250 yes 
48 5 Sophies Flyer  Evaw ran on   No bid 

 
Heat 13           Result: 1-5-3         Time:  29.56        Distances:       1  -   hd 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
50 1 Starlight Dreams  Faw Evch 1000 400 no 
51 3 Whitehart Rolo  Evaw Finwl 350 350 yes 
52 5 More Biscuits  Faw Blk 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 14           Result: 5-1-3          Time: 29.02        Distances:       7  -   1.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
53 1 Corporate Boost  Slaw Finwl 750 750 yes 
54 3 Manroe Blue  Faw Evch 1000 400 yes 
55 5 Jolly Recruit  Faw Ald 4000 2000 yes 
 



Heat 15            Result:  1-5-3         Time:29.25      Distances:12  -  4  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
58 1 Princess Betsy  Faw Ald 500 500 yes 

59 3 Larkins Way  Evaw Blk 250 250 yes 
60 5 Gold Miranda  Evaw Blk 800 500 no 

 
Heat 16            Result: 3-1-5         Time: 29.43           Distances: 5  -  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
61 1 Iains Story  Evaw Evch 200 200 yes 
62 3 Sunnyside Kewell  Evaw finwl 600 600 yes 
64 5 Corporate Aspect  Evaw ran on 500 500 yes 

 
Heat 17           Result: 3-1-5         Time:29.25        Distances: 12  -  5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
65 1 Manroe Molly  Evaw Evch 550 550 yes 
67 3 Turn Card  Evaw finwl 1000 1000 yes 
68 5 Byme Twink  Evaw Outp Not put Up for sale 

 
Heat 18           Result:  3-5-1         Time: 29.43         Distances: 2  -  6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
69 1 Roisins buddy  Evaw Outp 100 100 yes 
70 3 Clipper Union  Evaw finwl 650 650 yes 
72 5 Shaughs  Evaw Ran on 300 300 yes 

 
Heat 19           Result: 3-5-1    Time: 29.11         Distances:3  -  4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
73 1 Corporate Index  Slaw Ran on 250 250 yes 
74 3 Kirrawee  Faw Ald 1350 1350 yes 
75 5 Battling Mike  Evaw ran on 600 600 yes 

 
Heat 20           Result: 1-5-3         Time: 29.32         Distances:  8 -  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
78 1 Mohane Hero  Faw Ald 2500 1000 yes 
79 3 Islandea Bridge  Evaw Evch 200 200 yes 
82 5 Loughbeag Teddy  Evaw Ran on 400 400 yes 

 
Heat 21           Result: 5-3-1         Time:29.44                  Distances: 8   -   5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
84 1 Miriams Last  Evaw Outp   No bid 

87 3 Bealtra  Evaw Evch 350 350 yes 
90 5 Mohane Magic  Faw Ald   No bid 

 



Heat 22            Result:  5-1-3             Time: 29.47          Distances:  12  -  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
89 1 Easter In Garry  Evaw Ran on 200 200 yes 

95 3 Indiana Flyer  Faw Faded Not put Up for sale 
98 5 Poor Heart  Evaw Finwl 300 300 yes 

 
Heat 23            Result: 3-5-1         Time: 28.72          Distances:4  -  9  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
99 1 Thornley Zoie  Slaw Outp Not put Up for sale 
101 3 Bunnow ISEQ  Faw Finwl 1100 1100 yes 
100 5 Oyster Rodge  Evaw Finwl 700 700 yes 

 
Heat 24           Result: 3-1-5         Time:  29.72                  Distances: 2  -  1.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
104 1 Mustard Twist  Evaw Evch 750 750 yes 
108 3 Oyster Savings  Evaw Finwl 600 600 yes 
109 5 I Know Best  Faw Evch   No bid 

 
Heat 25           Result:    4  -  2                  Time:  29.40                 Distances:  dist 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
110 2 Spices Pop  Evaw Outp Not put Up for sale 
111 4 La Roi  Faw Finwl Not put  Up for sale 
        

 
Heat 26           Result:   2  -  4                  Time: 39.80                   Distances: 10 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
83 2 Snowball Fantasy  Faw Ald 900 900 yes 
105 4 Sandy Cheeks  Slaw Ran on 100 100 yes 
        

 
Heat 27           Result: 1-5-3                    Time:   17.00                 Distances:    nk  -  6     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
12 1 So Why Not  Slaw Finwl   No bid 
24 3 Kamakazee Paddy  Slaw Outp   No bid 
45 5 Katies Fantasy  Faw Ran on   No bid 

 
Heat 28           Result:3-1-5                  Time:  16.57                 Distances:     nk  -  7   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
56 1 Gurrankeagh Girl  Faw Evch 500 250 no 
77 3 Tucks Snow  Faw Finwl 200 200 yes 
85 5 Vale Mein  Slaw Blk   No bid 

 
 



Heat 29            Result: 2  -  4             Time: 16.35          Distances: 4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
94 2 Rapid Reward  Faw Ald   No bid 
96 4 Vale Tucks  Evaw Evch 300 300 yes 
        

 
Heat 30           Result:   2  -  4            Time: 16.51              Distances:    3     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
106 2 Bettsies Glory  Faw Ald 1500 200 no 
112 4 Sycamore Deal  Evaw Evch   No bid 
        

 
Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
35  Tip top Touch  Ran Monday 1900 1900 yes 
44  Bettyville Peril  Ran Monday 1850 1850 yes 
        

 
 


