
Heat 1            Result:1-3-5        Time:29.66   Distances:   1.5  -  7 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
1 1 Tio Coco  Faw Ald 3000 800 no 

2 3 Go Aine  Evaw Finwl 750 750 yes 
3 5 Fairyhill Mandy  Slaw ran on 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 2            Result:    5-1-3  Time:   29.42  Distances:    8  -  3   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
4 1 Lady Steppes  Evaw Evch 600 600 yes 

5 3 Larkfield Miss  Slaw Ran on 150 150 yes 
6 5 Dalcash Droopy  Faw finwl 2500 2500 yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:  1-3-5    Time:   30.96           Distances:      0.50  -  1.50 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
7 1 Plums Security  Evaw Blk 500 500 yes 
8 3 Steeple Rd Maeve  Faw Blk 800 800 yes 
10 5 Cragaknock Wave  Evaw Not put Up for sale 

 
Heat 4            Result: 1-5-3             Time:    29.67          Distances:    2  -  2  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 1 Knocktoosh Swift  Evaw Finwl 1300 1300 yes 
12 3 Whitehart Madam  Evaw Evch   No bid 
13 5 Tell Him Now  Evaw Ran on 1050 1050 yes 

 
Heat 5            Result:5-1-3             Time: 30.15        Distances:      1  --  12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 1 Fairyhill Tina  Evaw Evch 300 300 yes 
15 3 Loughgur Jet  Evaw Faded   No bid 
16 5 Pretty Trixie  Evaw Finwl 550 550 yes 

 
Heat 6            Result:  1-3-5          Time:  29.26                Distances:    8  --  4   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
17 1 Modest Jamie  Ld 1 Finwl 2100 2100 yes 
18 3 Larkstown  W 1 Ran on 800 350 no 
20 5 Granada Misty  Slaw Outp   No bid 

 
Heat 7            Result:3-5-1            Time: 29.57              Distances:      4  -  10 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
21 1  Myth or Legend  Evaw   No bid 
22 3 Gurrankeagh Rose  Faw 650 650 yes 
24 5 Tango Lad  Evaw 350 350 yes 

 



Heat 8            Result:  3-1-5     Time:  29.57        Distances:  3  -  8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
25 1 Ms Buttons  Evaw Evch 600 600 yes 

26 3 Knocktoosh Dan  Evaw ran on 2050 2050 yes 
27 5 Skule Droopy  Evaw Faded 150 150 yes 

 
Heat 9            Result:     3 -1 -5   Time:   29.69           Distances:    6  -  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
28 1 Teachers Choice  Evaw Ran on   No bid 
30 3 Handset  Faw Finwl 900 900 yes 
32 5 Fast Break  Evaw ran on 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 10           Result:    1-5-3    Time:     29.40         Distances:       3-5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
33 1 Mobile Legend  Faw Finwl 1400 1400 yes 
34 3 Katie Dear  Evaw Evch 2000 900 no 
35 5 Go Abbey  Evaw ran on 700 700 yes 

 
Heat 11           Result: 3-1-5          Time: 29.23             Distances:     14  -  1.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
36 1 Skule Woods  Slaw Finwl   No bid 
38 3 Tromora Gold  Faw Finwl 1600 1600 yes 
39 5 Coolygorman Fitz  Evaw Faded 150 150 yes 

 
Heat 12           Result:    3-5-1       Time:    29.19        Distances:   7  -  4     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 1 Knocksouna Belle  Evaw Outp 300 300 yes 
41 3 Steeple Rd Kewell  Faw Finwl 1500 1500 yes 
44 5 Carraward Lord  Faw Evch 900 900 yes 

 
Heat 13           Result:  3-1-5        Time:  29.73        Distances:   1  -  12     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
45 1 Corcass Celt  Faw Evch 650 650 yes 
46 3 Cherrygrove Mars  Evaw Finwl 900 900 yes 
47 5 Lively Action  Blk Outp 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 14           Result:   5-3-1        Time:  29.25       Distances:       4  -  7 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
48 1 Jacuzzi West  Slaw ran on   No bid 
49 3 Tromora Promise  Evaw Evch 350 350 yes 
50 5 Blanket Blue  Evaw Finwl 1100 1100 yes 
 



Heat 15            Result:1-3-5           Time:29.42      Distances: 4  -  4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
51 1 Groovy Molly  Faw Finwl 800 800 yes 

52 3 Comeontheblack  Evaw Ran on 550 550 yes 
53 5 Carraward Lady  Evaw Faded 550 550 yes 

 
Heat 16            Result: 3-5-1         Time:   29.81         Distances: shd  -  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
55 1 Kilgrogan Kath  Evaw Ranon 450 450 yes 
56 3 Joe Silkey  Faw Hldon 1900 1900 YES 
58 5 Danielles Nikita  Evaw Finwl Not put Up for sale 

 
Heat 17           Result: 1-5-3         Time:29.93        Distances: 3  -  hd 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
59 1 Tullagower Blue  Evaw ran on 300 300 yes 
60 3 Fortune Mary  Evaw Evch 500 500 yes 
63 5 Cable Kiowa  Evaw Evch   No bid 

 
Heat 18           Result:  4  -  2         Time: 29.07         Distances: 8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
64 2 Awfulcarryon  Faw Evch 200 200 yes 
65 4 Razldazl O Leary  Evaw Finwl Not put  Up for sale 
        

 
Heat 19           Result: solo    Time: 40.18         Distances: 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
37 3 Cable Bluebelle   3000 1400 no 
        

 
Heat 20           Result: 2 - 4         Time: 16.26         Distances:  5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
42 2 Kilmessan Jewel     No bid 
54 4 Sunrise Buck   200 200 yes 
        

 
Heat 21           Result:          Time:                   Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 



Heat 22            Result:               Time:           Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 
Heat 23            Result:          Time:           Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 24           Result:          Time:                     Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 25           Result:                      Time:                    Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 26           Result:                     Time:                    Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 27           Result:                     Time:                    Distances:         
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 28           Result:                   Time:                   Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
 



Heat 29            Result:              Time:           Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 30           Result:               Time:                Distances:         

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

 
Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        
        
        

* No presented for sale 


