+LIMERICK SALES RESULTS 15/01/08

Heat 1 Result:5-1-3 Time: 29.39 Distances:  2-8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 1 Tio Porto Faw Evch 1000 800 no
2 3 Ballinulty Zone Slaw ran on 200 200 yes
3 5 Tulleroby Crash Evaw Finwl 1700 1700 yes
Heat 2 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.72 Distances:  6-2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 1 Move on Spitfire Evaw Finwl 450 450 yes
3 Gilti Maldini Evaw Evch 300 300 yes
5 Ballygibba man Slaw Ran on 1500 No bid no
Heat 3 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.61 Distances: hd - 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
9 1 Black Wisp Evaw Finwl 700 700 yes
10 3 Adare Magic Evaw ranon | 600 100 no
11 5 Upland Cross Evaw Evch 800 300 yes
Heat 4 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.05 Distances: 14 - 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
13 1 Dilton Vieri Faw Finwl 2400 2400 yes
14 3 Tio Senco Evaw Evch 250 250 yes
15 5 Ballinulty code Evaw Ranon | 200 200 yes
Heat 5 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.88 Distances: 5 - 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
16 1 Move On Turbo Slaw Ranon | 250 250 yes
17 3 Lady Avenger Faw blk 450 450 yes
18 5 Merciful ruby Evaw finwl 500 500 yes
Heat 6 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.91 Distances: 4 - 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
19 1 Inislosky tern Evaw Finwl | 550 550 yes
20 3 Ballygibba Mac Faw Evch 700 400 no
21 5 Stormy Lauren Slaw Finwl 1000 400 no
Heat 7 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.81 Distances: nk - 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
23 1 Talavara Bud Evaw finwl No bid
24 |3 Ballinulty Law Evaw Ran on | 300 300 yes




‘ 26 ‘ 5 ‘ Blackboy Poppy ‘ ‘ Ldlranon | 300 150 No
Heat 8 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.16 Distances: 4 - 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
27 1 Move on Girlie Evaw Faded No bid
28 3 Dilton Fairy Slawranon | 850 850 yes
29 5 Inislosky Linnet Faw Ald 1100 1100 yes
Heat 9 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.05 Distances: 12 - 2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
30 1 Steeple Rd Tara Faw ran on 1600 1600 yes
31 3 Clipper boy Evaw Outp 500 500 yes
32 5 Corcass Mindy Slaw Outp No bid
Heat 10 Result: 1-3-5  Time: 29.53 Distances: 10 - 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
33 1 Memphis Sky Faw ran on 750 750 yes
37 3 Comogue Minnie Blk 1 Ranon | 1500 900 no
41 5 Sunrise Buck Blk 1ranon | Not put Up for | sale
Heat 11 Result: 1-5-3 Time:29.71 Distances: 2 - 9
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
42 1 Steeple Rd jay Faw Ald 1200 650 no
43 3 Lady Paloha Blk 1 ran on No bid
44 5 Bling bling Mia Evaw Finwl | 250 250 yes
Heat 12 Result: 5-1-3  Time: 29.23 Distances: 1-14
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
45 1 Joe Silkey Faw Evch 2000 950 no
48 3 Cabriol Pippa Slaw Nvsh No bid
49 5 Sell More Lifts Evaw finwl 800 800 yes
Heat 13 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.43 Distances: 9 -1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
50 1 Clonleigh Pakie Evaw blk 600 600 yes
51 3 Skehanagh Angel Slaw Nvsh No bid
52 5 Comogue Wolf Faw Ald 500 500 Yes
Heat 14 Result: 4 ---2 Time: 28.95 Distances: 12
| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold YN |




5, |2 Redhot Honcho Evaw Evch No bid

57 |4 Killeagh Froggy Faw Ald 600 600 yes

Heat 15 Result: solo Time:32.51 550yds Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
46 2 Plums Flyer Not put Up for sale
Heat 16 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 16.65 Distances: 1.5 - 4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
12 1 Ballynanty Lady 600 600 YES

34 3 KNOCKEEN Prima 200 200 yes

35 5 Bargain shop No bid
Heat 17 Result: 1-5-3 Time:16.52 Distances: 3 - 5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 1 Up Mohane 2000 900 no

38 3 Sarges Savings No bid
39 5 Tally Ho Jed No bid
Heat 18 Result: 4-2 Time: 16.29 Distances: 7

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
40 2 Steragel Rose 400 350 no

54 4 Knockeen Gypsy No bid




