Heat 1 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.38 Distances : 6L, SL.

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 2 Fleetwood Dan 3.59 | Slaw, Styon €350 | Yes

2 4 Seems Like Magic 3.38 | Faw, Ald €900 | Yes

3 6 Brave Podge 3.54 | Slaw, Fd No Bid | No

Heat 2 Result: 2-4-6 Time : 29.22 Distances : 2L 2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 2 Valentine Lily 3.40 | Bmptps,Ald €1,000 | Yes

4 Samba Katie 3.48 | Bmptps, Styon €850 | Yes

6 6 Leaha Bertie 3.57 | Slaw, Rnon €200 Yes
Heat 3 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.08 Distances: 8L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 2 Slight Detail 346 | Faw, Ald €1,150 | Yes

11 4 Miss Hawaii 3.57 | Rlru, fd €750 Yes

14 6 Leaha Joe 3.50 | Evaw,Nvshw €700 Yes
Heat 4 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.36 Distances: 3L, Nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
15 2 Slim Test 3.36 | Faw,Ald €1,200 | Yes

17 4 Hi Buckaroo 3.50 | Evaw, Rnon €650 Yes

18 6 Knockrour Deejay 3.50 | Evaw, Rnon €650 | Yes SOB
Heat 5 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 28.93 Distances: 8L,10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
19 2 Close Farm 3.74 | Slaw,Nvshw No Bid | No

21 4 Glenbowen Doll 351 | Faw, A 2nd €500 Yes

23 6 Black Froggy 343 | Faw, Ald €1,750 | Yes
Heat 6 Result: 4-2-6 Time : 29.01 Distances : 8L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
25 2 Ardcoohig Emma 3.50 | Slaw,Rnon €850 | Yes

26 4 Effernogue Rafa 348 | Ep,Ald €1,600 | Yes

27 6 Sandals Miller 3.51 | Slaw,Fd €550 Yes
Heat 7 Result: 4-6-2 Time 28.95 Distances: 2L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
28 2 Gone Like Dust 3.50 | Evaw, €550 | Yes
Nvshw
29 4 Gortown Millie 3.37 | Qaw,Ald €1,050 | Yes
31 6 Blue Shadow 3.40 | Faw,Rnon €800 | Yes

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 8 Result: 4-2-6  Time: 29.51 Distances: S5L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
32 2 Geraldines Style 3.60 | Slaw, Rnon €500 | Yes

33 4 Mountleader Riu 3.51 | Ep, Ald €850 | Yes

34 6 Ardcoohig Mark 3.52 | Evaw,Mid €200 | Yes
Heat 9 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.84 Distances: 3L,Dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
35 6 Ever Absent (W) 3.48 | Faw,KO 1 €650 | Yes SOB
36 2 Sandals Wicked 3.45 | Evaw, Rnon €700 | Yes

37 4 Dower Princess 340 | Faw,Blk 1 €850 | Yes
Heat 10 Result: 6-2-4 Time : 29.62 Distances: 4L,Dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
38 6 Glenbowen Ace (W) 3.53 | Blkl Styon €400 | Yes

39 2 PaulasmightyHawk 3.54 | Blkl, Rnon €500 | Yes

40 4 Malmo Diva 351 | Evaw, Kol €450 | Yes

Heat 11 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.21 Distances: 4L, 7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
41 2 Pat The Baker 3.58 | Slaw, Finwl 1,000 | No

42 6 Chadwell Cian (W) 3.40 | Faw, Blk 3 €1,550 | Yes

44 4 Lochbo Heather 342 | Faw, Blk 3 €700 | No

Heat 12 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.25 Distances: 3L, SL.

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
45 2 Glenbowen King 341 | Ep, ALd €850 | Yes

46 6 Millview Same (W) | 3.50 | Slaw, Rnon 550 | No

48 4 Blue Cruiser 3.66 | Slaw, Nvshw No Bid | NO
Heat 13 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.44 Distances: 4L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
49 2 Hazelbank Dior 346 | Evaw,Blk 1 €300 Yes

51 4 Smooth Henry 336 | Faw, Fd €500 Yes

52 6 Calling Pearl 349 | Finwl, Blk 1 €700 | Yes

Heat 14 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.03 Distances: 8L SL

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
55 2 Mountleader Ralf 3.54 | Blk,Rnon €750 | Yes

57 |4 Ballyhooleen 3.56 | Blk fd €200 | Yes

58 6 Nirphania 3.51 | Slaw,Finwl €1,700 | Yes

* Not Presented for Sale
Heat 15 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 28.81 Distances: 8L, 2L




Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
59 2 Captain Lobo 3.46 | Faw,Rnon €1,800 | Yes

60 4 Beta Figure 3.39 | Qaw, Ald 3,000 | No

61 6 Mountleader Aled 3.50 | Evaw,Rnon €500 Yes
Heat 16 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 28.89 Distances : 5L, 3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
62 2 Up Close 3.45 | Dspld,Finwl €2,600 | Yes
63 4 Your Some Boyo 3.42 | Dspld, Rnon €1,500 | Yes SOB
64 6 Early Rambler 3.53 | Slaw, Mid €500 | Yes
Heat 17 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.06 Distances: 1L, 7L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
65 2 Dooneen Maldini 3.55 | Evaw,Styon 300 No
68 4 Dripsey Five 3.41 | Faw, Ald 1,000 | No
69 6 Free Sky 3.51 | Slaw, Nvshw * No
Heat 18 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.07 Distances: 5L, 2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
70 2 Satin Star 3.38 | Qaw, Fd €600 | Yes

71 4 Connor Pass Joe 3.44 | Faw,Finwl €1,250 | Yes

72 6 Dooneen Blueboy 3.56 | Slaw, Mid 200 NO
Heat 19 Result: 4-6-2 Time : 29.10 Distances : Nk, 4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
73 2 Malden State 348 | Evaw, Blk 3 €1,300 | Yes

75 6 Fleetwood Snowie 3.48 | Evaw, Finwl €1,000 | Yes

(W)

76 4 Loughteen Moon 341 | Faw,Hldon 1,000 | NO
Heat 20 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.24 Distances: 5L, 6L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
77 2 Kilmoney Ruby 3.34 | Qaw, Ald €550 | Yes

78 4 Redeemed 3.46 | Faw,Alnd €300 Yes SOB
79 6 Satin Pilot 3.50 | Faw,Rnon * No

Heat 21 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.23 Distances: 4L 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
81 2 Barstool Talk 3.37 | Faw,Blk €800 | Yes

82 |4 Malden Tilly 3.52 €600 | Yes

83 6 Knockrour Toast 3.42 600 NO

* Not Presented for Sale
Heat 22 Result: 2-4 Time: 29.38 Distances: 10L




Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
85 2 Avaline 3.45 | Faw,Ald €600 | Yes
86 4 Kilmoney Rambler 3.46 | Faw, Fd No Bid | No
6
Heat 2 Result: 2-4 Time: 29.48 Distances: 1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
88 2 Ballinahina Meg 3.56 | Evaw,finwl €350 | Yes
89 4 Dogged Bert (W) 3.36 | Faw,Fd €600 | Yes
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