
Clonmel Greyhound Stadium Sales - Thursday 7th February

HEAT 1 Result: 2 - 4 - 6 Time: 29.86 Dist: 2l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

2 2 Piercestown Lass 2.98 EP,Ld1 450 Y
4 4 Hug Me Hazel 2.94 Faw,A2nd 900 Y
5 6 Speedy Maldini 3.10 Slaw,A3rd 400 Y

HEAT 2 Result: 1 -5 - 3 Time: 29.38 Dist: 10l & 4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

8 1 Schofield Guest 2.98 Blk1,Finwl 8000 4200 N
10 3 Piercestown Diva 3.01 E,Outp 400 Y
11 5 Kingtone Diamond 2.94 Qaw,Blk1 450 Y

HEAT 3 Result: 2- 6 -4 Time: 29.61 Dist: 9l & 9l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

13 2 Schofield Betty 3.14 Ld1,Finwl 6000 3000 N
15 4 Fill The Bottle 3.12 Slaw,A3rd 500 NO BID
17 6 Elite Jess 3.04 EP,A2nd 500 NO BID

HEAT 4 Result: 3- 5- 1 Time: 29.35 Dist: 1/2l & 10l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

18 1 Loyal Madam 2.94 Faw,A3rd 1000 200 N
20 3 Move On Scholes 2.85 Qaw,Hldon 3000 Y
21 5 Effernogue Clare 2.93 Faw,Finwl 1750 Y

HEAT 5 Result: 2 - 4 -6 Time: 30.64 Dist: 1/2l & 1/2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

22 2 Kingtone Flash 3.13 Slaw,SUS NOT PRESENTED
23 4 Granada Minx 2.98 EP,ImpRi 500 NO BID
24 6 Move On Girlie 3.02 Ld1,Impri 200 Y

HEAT 6 Result: 5- 1- 3 Time: 29.89 Dist: 3/4l & 6l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

25 1 Elite Jordan 2.95 Faw,RlRi 200 Y
26 3 Mandeville Jess 3.02 Ep,Outp 250 Y
27 5 Effernogue Kenna 3.17 Slaw,Finwl 800 Y

HEAT 7 Result: 4 - 6 -2 Time: 29.56 Dist: 8l & 1/2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

28 2 Wise Treat 2.98 EP,Blk1 300 Y
29 4 Clune Digital 2.88 Qaw,Ald 2600 Y
31 6 Bradford Bobby 3.01 E,Blk1 1050 Y



Clonmel Greyhound Stadium Sales - Thursday 7th February

HEAT 8 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.45 Dist: 12l & 6l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

33 1 Pure Folly 2.98 Ep.Bmp1 100 Y
36 3 Honey Giselle 2.91 Faw,Ald 1800 Y
37 5 Quick Dar 2.98 Ep,Bmp1 100 Y

HEAT 9 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.67 Dist: 8l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

38 2 Upalongway 2.95 Ep,ald 1175 Y
39 4 Dundrum Champ 3.11 Slaw,Fd 1000 No Bid
40 6 Ballinclare Viva 3.04 E,A2nd 500 No Bid

HEAT 10 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.70 Dist: 3l & 12l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

41 1 Cavecourt United 2.96 Rl,Bmp1 600 Y
42 3 Classy Deposit 2.89 Qaw,Fd 500 No Bid
43 5 Pure River 3.00 Ep,Bmp1 600 Y

HEAT 11 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.70 Dist: 7.5l & 8l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

45 2 Apple Jetro 3.00 Ep,A2nd 100 Y
46 4 Quick Fancy 3.00 Ep,A3rd 100 Y
44 6 Honey Stunner 2.90 Qaw,Ald 1100 Y

HEAT 12 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.46 Dist: 10l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

48 1 Ballinclare Inca 3.06 Slaw,Bmpru 500 No Bid
50 3 Shalom View 2.97 Bmpru,Ld1 1000 Y
49 5 Quinnie 2.92 Faw,Fd 500 No Bid

HEAT 13 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.60 Dist: 6l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

51 2 Best Survivor 2.96 Ep,A2nd NOT PRESENTED
52 4 Maughera Walk 2.98 Ep,A3rd 500 No Bid
54 6 Brookhill Boy 2.95 Ep,Ld1 1700 Y

HEAT 14 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.31 Dist: 10l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

55 1 Lickfinn Seanie 2.95 Faw,Ald 1900 Y
56 3 Westgate Rocky 2.97 Ep,A2nd 600 Y
58 5 Kovso Lass 3.08 Stb1,outp Not Presented



Clonmel Greyhound Stadium Sales - Thursday 7th February

HEAT 15 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.85 Dist: 7l & 6l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

61 2 Minor Sonic 3.04 Rl1,Ld2 1500 900 N
63 4 Maughera Breeze 3.00 Ep,Rnon Not Presented
64 6 Rabras Flame 2.89 Qaw,Fd Not Presented

HEAT 16 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.52 Dist: 6l & 5l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

65 1 Classy Touch 3.03 Slaw,Rnon 500 Y
66 3 Irremore Tuck 2.96 Ep,Ld1 800 Y
67 5 Jackies View 2.93 Faw,Fd 800 No Bid

HEAT 17 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.89 Dist: .5l & 10l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

70 2 Rabras Joke 3.00 Ep,Out 500 No Bid
71 4 Rebel Treasure 2.92 Qaw,Hldon 450 Y
72 6 Mandeville Blue 3.05 Slaw,Finwl 200 Y

HEAT 18 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 30.29 Dist: .5l & 7l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

75 1 Strutter 2.97 Ep,Ld1 Not Presented
76 3 Minor Baby 3.00 E,Finwl 1000 No Bid
77 5 Rabras Beauty 2.96 Ep,Fd 500 No Bid

HEAT 19 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.62 Dist: .5l & 3l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

86 2 County View 2.98 Ep,Finwl Not Presented
81 4 Olivias Jet 2.99 Ep,A3rd 500 No Bid
83 6 Babby Joe 2.89 Qaw,Wbnds 550 Y

HEAT 20 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.89 Dist: 3/4l & 5l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

87 1 Lyons Fortune 2.97 Ld1,Fdri 750 Y
89 3 Movealong Sue 2.97 Ep,Finwl 1200 Y
90 5 Ballydurn Ivy 3.00 E,A3rd 800 300 N

HEAT 21 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.67 Dist: Hd & .5l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

92 2 Refined Plan 3.06 Slaw,Finwl Not Presented
95 4 Shaws Gift 2.93 Qaw,Finwl 500 Y
96 6 Gilded Power 3.04 Slaw,Finwl Not Presented
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HEAT 22 Result:  5-1-3 Time: 29.78 Dist: 1l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

98 1 Watch Out 2.87 Qaw,Fdri 600 Y
99 3 Jumbos Cool 2.99 Rl,Finwl 275 Y

100 5 Fitness Club 2.97 Ep,A3rd 600 Y

HEAT 23 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.33 Dist: 3l & 1l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

103 2 Wise Joe 3.05 Slaw,Rnon Not Presented
105 4 Minglers Vieri 2.88 Qaw,Rnon 1000 650 N
106 6 Ashfiled Romeo 2.91 Qaw,Finwl 1100 Y

HEAT 24 (550) Result: 4-2-6 Time: 30.63 Dist: 5l & 4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

108 2 Rebel Brave 4.41 Slaw,Finwl 500 Y
93 4 Lisnakill Franny 4.27 Qaw,Ald 1900 Y
79 6 Caseys Ragatag 4.31 Faw,Outp 250 Y

HEAT 25 Result: 4-2 Time: 30.78 Dist: Dist
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

1 2 Marys Pet 3.12 Blkrup,KO4 500 No Bid
59 4 Glenske Blue 3.12 Blkrup,Rnon Not Presented

HEAT 26 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.12 Dist: 9l & 4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

69 1 Glenske Rebel 3.03 Blk1,Fd Not Presented
104 3 Quanns Blackbird 2.96 Faw,Ald 3000 1500 N
110 5 Wise Scene 3.03 Blk1,Rnon Not Presented

HEAT 27 Result: Solo Time: 16.69 Dist:
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

34 4 Cavecourt Dug 1100 Y


