
Heat 1            Result: 2-6-4              Time: 29.41                 Distances : 5L, 2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
1 2 Aldworth Slipper 3.56 Qaw, Finwl  €1,400 Yes 

2 4 Robstown Fairy 3.92 Qaw, Nvshw  No Bid No 
3 6 Lilac Moon 3.45 Evaw,Finwl  €900 Yes 

 
Heat 2            Result: 4-2-6             Time :  29.47                   Distances :  2L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
6 2 Inishkeny Apple 3.59 Evaw,Styon  €700 Yes 

7 4 Dower Woods 3.51 Qaw, Ald  €800 Yes 
8 6 Samoka 3.59 Slaw  €600 Yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:   4-2-6      Time: 29.59                     Distances:    4L, 5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
9 2 Robstown Lass 3.69 Faw, Hldon  €450 Yes 
10 4 Allow Lama 3.63 Evaw,Finwl  €1,1150 Yes 
11 6 Black Manderin W 3.59 Evaw,Rnon  €150 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 4            Result:  6-4-2          Time:   29.69      Distances:    5L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
15 2 Elliy Tiger 3.57 Faw,Fd  €1,250 Yes 
16 4 Out You Go 3.51 Evaw, Fd  €200 Yes 
17 6 Kilcanway 3.50 Evaw,Finwl  €650 Yes 

 
Heat 5            Result: 6-2-4       Time:  29.30  Distances:    5L, 8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
18 2 Coy Sheila 3.60 Slaw,Rnon 1,200 600 No 
19 4 Tell Me Keano 3.64 Slaw, Finwl  No Bid No 
20 6 Bayside Bird 3.43 Faw,Finwl 2,000 800 No 

 
Heat 6            Result: 2-4    Time:    30.30       Distances:     0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
21 2 Honey Ruby 3.59 Evaw,Finwl  No Bid No 
23 4 Boola Charm 3.47 Qaw,Rnon  €300 Yes 
24 6 Leemount Farloe 3.69 Slaw,DNF  €200 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 7            Result:  6-2-4     Time:    29.87    Distances:     3L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
25 2 Come On Ava 3.66 Evaw,Rnon  €400 Yes 
26 4 Tell Me Skinner 3.65 Qaw, Nvshw  €300 Yes 
27 6 Dark Days 3.66 Evaw,Bmp 1  €300 Yes 

•  * Not Presented for Sale 
•  

 



Heat 8            Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.35    Distances:  7L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
28 2 Bayside Blue 3.65 Evaw,Fd  * No 

29 4 Jet Jamella 3.48 Qaw,Finwl  €800 Yes 
30 6 Leemount Gull 3.66 Slaw, Rnon  €250 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 9            Result:  6-4-2       Time:  29.93      Distances:     4L,Nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
31 2 Boola Valley 3.63 Qaw,Fd  €500 Yes 
32 4 Diamond Patch 3.69 Evaw,Blk 1  €500 Yes 
33 6 Ard Spirit 3.62 Evaw, Rnon  €400 Yes 

 
Heat 10           Result: 6-4-2 Time:  29.85       Distances:    2L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
34 2 Sycamore Moth 3.67 Qaw, Fd  No Bid No 
35 4 Den Marys Touch 3.70 Evaw,Finwl  600 No 
36 6 Allcredittodogs 3.52 Qaw,Finwl  €350 Yes 

 
Heat 11           Result: 4-2-6                  Time:  29.49      Distances: 3L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 2 Inside only 3.61 Qaw,Finwl  €500 Yes 
38 4 Tell Me Denjoe 3.51 Qaw,Ald  €2,200 Yes 
39 6 Bayside Hound 3.57 Evaw,Fd  €100 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 12           Result:  4-2-6              Time:    29.10               Distances:  3L,8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
41 2 Barnagrane Ber 3.59 Evaw, Finwl  €1,500 Yes 
42 4 Crash Officer 3.48 Qaw,Ald  €4,000 Yes 
43 6 Gilti Classic 3.55 Slaw, Nvshw  €400 Yes 

 
Heat 13           Result: 6-2-4             Time:  29.47           Distances:    6L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
46 2 Baby Grad 3.56 Evaw, Finwl  €200 Yes 
47 4 Bushy Lass 3.53 Qaw,Rnon  * No 
50 6 Canadian Helen 3.61 Slaw, Finwl  €700 Yes 

 
Heat 14           Result: 4-2-6                    Time:  29.38            Distances:  7L, 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
51 2 Dromupper Snow 3.61 Qaw,Finwl  €200 Yes 
52 4 October Cash 3.48 Qaw,Ald  800 No 
54 6 Arriving 3.66 Slaw,Nvshw  €300 Yes 

* Not Presented for Sale 
 



Heat 15            Result: 2-6-4       Time: 29.46  Distances : 3L,4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
55 2 Rosden Joe 3.64 Qaw,Finwl  €1,000 Yes 

56 4 Bearhaven Emma 3.71 Blkru,Rnon  €200 Yes SOB 
58 6 Calling Tern 3.64 Qaw,Styon  * No 

 
Heat 16            Result: 2-6-4       Time: 29.96     Distances: 1L,4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
59 2 Dromupper Beauty 3.65 Qaw,Finwl  * No 
62 4 Talavara Place 3.60 Blkru, Styon  * No 
63 6 Jethart Classic 3.66 Blkru,Finwl  * No 

 
Heat 17           Result: 2-4-6        Time: 29.02             Distances:  8L,8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
64 2 Early Spider 3.48 Qaw,Ald  €4,000 Yes 
65 4 Apple Divo 3.58 Evaw,Finwl  * No 
66 6 Black Widower 3.64 Slaw,Fd  * No 

 
Heat 18           Result: 6-2-4     Time: 29.16                Distances:  1L,4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
67 2 October Brent 3.60 Qaw,Finwl  €1,750 Yes 
68 4 Bearhaven Nikita 3.63 Slaw,Nvshw  €400 Yes 
69 6 Shaneboy Verdi 3.48 Qaw,Finwl 2,000 1,000 No 

 
Heat 19         Result: 6-2-4    Time : 29.46          Distances : 10L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
70 2 Knockeen Lucky 3.75 Slaw,Finwl  No Bid No 
71 4 Airside Express 3.66 Qaw,Styon  No Bid No 
72 6 Nkrumah 3.65 Qaw,Finwl  300 No 

 
Heat 20            Result: 6-2-4     Time: 29.24    Distances:  5L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
73 2 Talavara Stent 3.47 Qaw, Fd  €950 Yes 
77 4 Pyramid 3.54 Qaw, Fd  €600 Yes 
78 6 Kranky Couple 3.63 Evaw, Finwl  800 No 

 
Heat 21            Result: 4-6-2                Time: 29.59     Distances:  7L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
79 2 Ruperts Lad 3.60 Qaw,Styon  No Bid No 

80 4 Coolready County 3.60 Qaw,Finwl  No Bid No 
82 6 Bayside Gack 3.67 Slaw, Nvshw  * No 

* Not Presented for Sale 
 



Heat 22            Result: 4-6-2    Time: 29.62   Distances:  0.5L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
83 2 Kiel Teddy 3.56 Evaw,Fd  * No 

86 4 Unparalleled 3.44 Qaw,Finwl  €900 Yes 
87 6 Ferndale Honcho 3.53 Qaw,Finwl  €500 Yes 

 
Heat 23         Result: 4-2    Time: 29.30       Distances:  12 L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
89 2 Witches Prince 3.67 Evaw,Rnon  €700 Yes 
90 4 Laidback Jack 3.57 Qaw,Ald 2,000 No Bid No 
 6       

 
Heat 24           Result: 2-4              Time: 29.88   Distances:  Nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
91 2 Kiel Rebel 3.49 Qaw, Ald  €300 Yes SOB 
92 4 Cuban Penny 3.51 Evaw,Finwl  €400 Yes 
        

 
Heat 25 (550)            Result: Solo                      Time: 31.29  Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
76 2 Cronody Rambler 4.90 Solo  No Bid No 
        
        

 
* No presented for sale 


