
Heat 1            Result: 4-6-2              Time: 28.99                 Distances : 2L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
3 2 Sandals Bud 3.50 Evaw,RnOn  €500 Yes 

4 4 Digital Kipper 3.47 EvAw, FinWl  €2,200 Yes 
1 6 Watchoutlad(W) 3.46 Qaw,Styr  €1,500 Yes 

 
Heat 2            Result: 6-4-2        Time :  29.10                 Distances :  4L 8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
5 2 Star Cash Amy 3.45 Faw,Fd  No Bid No 

7 4 Ottawa Lady 3.56 EvAw,Styd  300 No 
8 6 Chadwell Cathy 3.57 Mid, P  €1,000 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 3            Result:  2-4-6    Time: 29.12                  Distances:   6L, 5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
9 2 Effernogue Rose 3.43 Ld, Finwl  €1,500 Yes 
10 4 Murdaniel Style 3.58 EvAw, W4  €850 Yes 
13 6 Tell Me Rocco 3.59 EvAw,RnOn  €300 Yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:  2-4-6      Time:   29.36    Distances:    5L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 2 Oakfront Cherry 3.43 Ld 1, Styd  €1,100 Yes 
15 4 Cyclers Maggie 3.46 Blk 1, Stydon  €400 Yes 
17 6 Arcade Maldini 3.55 Bmpru,RnOn  No Bid No 

 
Heat 5            Result: 4-6-2  Time:  29.32 Distances:   10L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
18 2 Baurnahulla Tuck 3.52 EvAw, Fd  No Bid No 
21 4 Mountleader Kika 3.46 Qaw, FinWl  €1,050 Yes 
22 6 Mileheight Lady 3.70 SlAw,RnOn  150 No 

 
Heat 6            Result: 4-6-2   Time : 28.71 Distances : 0.5L,8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
23 2 No Joke Megrew 3.64 EvAw,Fd  €300 Yes 
24 4 Willaby Creek 3.44 QAwHldon 4,000 2,000 No 
26 6 Pull Rank 3.57 FinWl Chlri  €2,600 Yes 

 
Heat 7            Result:  2-4-6  Time   29.12   Distances:    2L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
27 2 Gurrane View 3.46 Evaw, Ld3  €1,550 Yes 
28 4 Mountleader Kya 3.31 Faw,Evch  €1,100 Yes 
30 6 Alex The Great 3.48 Evaw,Styd  €1,000 Yes 

•  * Not Presented for Sale 
•  

 



Heat 8            Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.32    Distances:  4L,2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 2 Standard Charm 3.45 Ld2, evch  No Bid No 

39 4 Bayside Hound 3.45 Evaw,Blk 1  No Bid No 
36 6 Shedfield Joker (w) 3.52 Evaw,Finwl  €400 Yes 

 
Heat 9            Result:  6-4-2      Time:  29.26    Distances:    .05L,1.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 2 Next To You 3.41 Qaw,Crd 3  * NO 
41 4 Evons Yogohuggi 3.45 Evaw, Crd 3  €1,300 Yes 
42 6 Free Savings 3.34 Faw,Hldon  €1,200 Yes 

 
Heat 10           Result: 2-6-4   Time : 29.11  Distances:    3L,8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
43 2 Mileheight Gone 3.59 EvAw, FinWl  1,400 No 
49 4 Kilmoney Fred 3.57 SlAw,Rnon  No Bid No 
45 6 Ard Lark (W) 3.42 Qaw,Evch  €550 Yes 

 
Heat 11           Result: 2-4-6             Time:  29.16    Distances: 5L, 0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
51 2 Kingston Gold 3.63 Ld, Styd Well  €1,050 Yes 
53 4 Mayor Ansar 3.69 Eveaw,stydon 2,000 800 NO 
54 6 Malden Soppano 3.72 Slaw, Ranon  €300 Yes 

 
Heat 12           Result:  2-4-6          Time:    29.89              Distances:  1L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
56 2 Georges Hot Drop 3.59 Blk 1 Stydwell  600 No 
57 4 Fivejack Joker 3.55 Ep, Blk 1  300 No 
55 6 Witches Twinkle 

(W) 
3.76 Slaw,Ranon  * NO 

 
Heat 13           Result: 4-2-6        Time:  29.20          Distances:    1L,5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
60 2 Bookies Bandit 3.63 Evaw,Styd  1,750 No 
61 4 Knockrour Paddy 3.57 Rl1, Ld2  €2,600 Yes SOB 
59 6 Roseville Beauty (w) 3.44 Ep, Fd  €200 Yes 

 
Heat 14           Result: 2-4-6                 Time:  29.15           Distances:  8L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
64 2 Fast As 3.62 Ld1,Stydwell  €850 Yes 
63 4 Aghamarta Lad (W) 3.59 Evaw Fd  * No 
62 6 Nobodys Darling (W) 3.69 Slaw,Ranon  * No 

* Not Presented for Sale 



 
Heat 15            Result: 2-4    Time: 30.10     Distances 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
65 2 Great Lad 3.55 W4 Hldon  €250 Yes 

67 4 Witches Duke (W) 3.51 Styd,Chlrunin  €200 Yes 
 6       

 
Heat 16 (300)      Result: 4-2       Time: 18.41 Distances : 10L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
39 2 Nifty Twin  Slaw, Ranon  * No 
41 4 Next To You  Faw, Ald  * No 
 6       

 
 
 


