Heat 1 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.43 Distances : 8L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2 2 Shedfield Jewel 3.64 | Slaw,Finwl €950 Yes

4 4 Starcash Pops 3.55 | Faw, Fd * No

5 6 Pocket Picker 3.74 | Evaw,Rnon €300 Yes
Heat 2 Result: 6-4-2 Time : 29.32 Distances : 1L, 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
6 2 Mountkeeffe Ash 3.69 | Slaw, Rnon €400 Yes

7 4 Lady Calido 3.60 | Evaw,Finwl 1,000 500 No

6 Blueridge Lulu 3.52 | Ald, Hidon €1,150 | Yes

Heat 3 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.06 Distances: 5L, 5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 2 Yellow Lady 3.61 | Crdru, Fd €400 | Yes

12 4 Panther Prince 3.49 | Faw, Ald 4,000 €2,800 | SOB Yes
13 6 Malden Knows 3.58 | Slaw, Outp €1,500 | Yes
Heat 4 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.07 Distances: 2L,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 2 Ballyfinn Boy 342 | Faw,Fd €1,250 | Yes

16 4 Chadwell Zola 3.69 | RIFinwl €5,000 €3,500 | SOB Yes
17 6 Newmarket Ruby 3.60 | Evaw,Rnon €600 | Yes
Heat5h Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.36 Distances: 8L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
18 2 Miss Sterling 3.54 | Evaw,Bmp €850 | Yes

19 4 Rockforest Luke 3.53 | Evaw,Bmp No Bid | No

20 6 Mountruby Magic 345 | Faw, Ald 2,000 1,200 | No

Heat 6 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.39 Distances: 2L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
21 2 Sarahs Light 3.53 | Evaw,Styon €850 | Yes

22 4 Longvalley Nata 346 | Qaw,Cmag | 1,000 500 No

24 6 Sleek Allow 3.50 | Faw,Fdri * No

Heat 7 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.35 Distances: 4L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
25 |2 Boherash Tapaidh 3.50 | Qaw,Styd €1,000 | Yes

26 |4 Longvalley Tatty 3.59 | Evaw,Fd 1,000 500 Yes

28 6 Finnow Flash 3.77 | Slaw,Finwl 500 300 No

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 8 Result: 2-6-4  Time: 29.05 Distances: 12L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
29 2 Chinook Honey 3.45 | Faw,Ald €2,800 | Yes

30 4 Rockforest Jake 3.51 | Slaw,Blk No Bid | No

31 6 Calling Superzoe 3.47 | Slaw, Blk €600 | Yes
Heat 9 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.63 Distances: 6L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
32 2 Ballyboy Trey 3.65 | Blk,Finwl €300 | Yes

33 4 Talavara Judy 3.62 | Slaw, Nvsh €200 | Yes

35 6 Call Card 354 | Faw, Ald €700 | Yes
Heat 10 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.22 Distances: Hd, 14L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 2 Boherash Ri 3.53 | Blkd,Finwl 4,000 1,600 | No

37 4 Castlelyons Roco 3.57 | Evaw, Blk No Bid | No

38 6 Chinook Baby 3.58 | Ld2, Hdnrl 1,500 700 Yes
Heat 11 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.01 Distances: 6L ,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
40 2 Jolly Customer 3.45 | Frn, Ald €2,600 | Yes

41 4 Senior Moment 3.52 | Slaw,outp €700 | Yes

42 6 Dark Horse 3.59 | RIFinwl €1,000 | Yes
Heat 12 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.76 Distances: 3L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
43 2 Hilight Bertie 3.63 | Blk,Finwl €500 | Yes

44 4 Talavara Bud 3.57 | Faw,Fd €200 | Yes

45 6 Game Gift 3.58 | Qaw, Hldon €600 | Yes
Heat 13 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 28.75 Distances: 8L,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
47 2 Boherash Gaoithe 3.38 | Faw, Ald 8,000 5,000 | No

48 4 Southwind Flash 3.50 | Evaw, Rnon €2,000 | Yes

49 6 Paulas Chancer 3.59 | Slaw,Nvshw €450 | Yes

Heat 14 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.35 Distances: 3L, 2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
50 |2 Betley Bimbo 3.53 | Slaw, Rnon €650 | Yes

53 |4 Game Display (W) 3.51 | Evaw,Fd 700 €400 | Yes SOB
52 |6 Townsfield Lad (W) 3.45 | Faw,Ald €2,700 | Yes

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 15 Result: 6-2-4  Time: 29.48 Distances : 0.5L,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
54 2 Johnstown Louise 346 | Faw,Fdri €400 | Yes

55 4 Talavara Tower 3.64 | Msdbk Rnon €300 | Yes

56 6 Pack Of Lies 3.63 | Slaw,Finwl €750 | Yes
Heat 16 Result: 2-6-4  Time: 29.31 Distances: 1L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 2 Orient EIm 3.46 | Faw,Ald 1,000 600 No
58 4 Gowlane Stardust 3.87 | Slaw,Nvsh €500 | Yes
59 6 Johnstown Nan 3.50 | Evaw,Finwl €500 | Yes
Heat 17 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.41 Distances: 3L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
60 2 Game Molly 3.64 | Slaw,Outp No Bid | No
62 4 Ringmahon Cross 348 | Faw,Fd €750 | Yes
61 6 Whistling Tail (M) 349 | Qaw,Styon €1,700 | Yes
Heat 18 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.33 Distances: 3L,0.5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
63 2 Noras Boy 355 | Ldbs, Blk €700 | Yes

65 4 Orient Olive 3.66 | Slaw,Nvshw * No

66 6 Feohanagh Paddy 346 | Qaw,Cmag 2,000 €1,600 | No

Heat 19 Result: 4-6-2 Time : 29.38 Distances : 8L, 5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
68 2 Gortown Dana 3.65 | Slaw,Nvsh No Bid | No

69 4 Game Express 3,51 | Evaw, Ld2 €850 Yes

67 6 Witches Duke (W) 344 | Faw,Fd No Bid | No

Heat 20 Result: 4-2-6  Time: 29.01 Distances: 5L, 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
71 2 Fast Request 3.65 | Slaw,Rnon * No

74 4 Graysland Oscar 345 | Faw,Ald €3,000 | Yes

75 6 Witches Prince 3.64 | Slaw, Outp 700 No Bid | No

Heat 21 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.31 Distances: Nk,5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
77 |2 Ugly Rumours 3.39 | Faw, Evch 3,000 600 No

78 |4 Mileheight Quest 3.54 | Crd,Finwl €1,800 | Yes

79 6 Pavilion Gold 3.45 | Evaw,Rnon * No

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 22 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.25 Distances: 0.5L,9L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
81 2 Oakfront Opera 351 | RId,Finwl €750 | Yes
82 4 Scart Bill 343 | Ald,HIdon €850 | Yes
84 6 Leemount Sisco 3.75 | Msdbk,Nvsh * No
Heat 23 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.56 Distances: 1.5L,8L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
85 2 Longvalley Boss 3.58 | Qaw,Evch * No
86 4 Holiday Fortune 3.71 | Rnon,Outp €300 | Yes
89 6 Your Some Dog 3.60 | Sth,Styon €1,000 | Yes SOB
Heat 24 Result: 2-4 Time: 29.54 Distances: 10L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
90 2 Bunnys Cruiser 3.61 | Faw,Ald €200 | Yes
91 4 Valentine Sonia 3.64 | Qaw,Fd No Bid | No
Heat 25 (330) Result: 4-2 Time: 18.75 Distances: 0.5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
72 2 Aldworth Class Qaw,Evch * No
87 4 Jimmy Joe Wri,Cmag * No
Heat 26 Results : Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 27 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 28 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
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Heat 29 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

2

Heat Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale




