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Heat 1            Result:1-3-5        Time: 29.54  Distances:  4.5L- 6.5L  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

1 1 Polar Force 1.76 Faw Styd  3500 Yes 

2 3 Radio Controlled 1.79 EvAw Styd  1000 Yes 

3 5 Donegal Lyn 1.89 SlAw Nush  300 Yes 

 
Heat 2            Result: 4-2-6     Time: 29.36   Distances: 8.5L-Dist       
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

4 2 Ashwell Zapper 1.95 SLAw Rnon  400 Yes 

6 4 Smooth Byway 1.89 Evaw FinWll  3800 Yes 

8 6 Minnies Monalisa 1.87 EvAw Blkd  900 Yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:  5-1-3    Time:  30.05            Distances: 2L-6.5L      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

Y/N 
9 1 Rip Off 1.79 Faw Outp  700 Yes 

10 3 Raparee Maid 1.87 SlAw Nvsh Sold off bench  Yes 
11 5 Clones Twister  1.85 SlAw FinWll  1000 Yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:  2-4-6            Time: 29.67             Distances:   3L-6.5L   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
12 2 Mantilla 1.89 EvAw Ald  2600 Yes 

13 4 Ballymore Maggie 1.84 EvAw Rnon 1500 500 No 

15 6 Spooks Panther 2.00 EvAw Nush  450 Yes 
 

Heat 5            Result: 3-1-5            Time:  30.04       Distances: 2.5L-6.5L      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
16 1 Sober Rocket 2.04 EvAw Outp  400 Yes  

18 3 Romantic Belinda 1.93 QAw FinWll  500 Yes 
19 5 Wandering Maggie 2.04 EvAw Nush  No bid No 

 
Heat 6            Result:  2-6-4     Time:  30.20           Distances:  0.5L-3.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
20 2 Dance Cormac 1.85 Qaw FinWll  No bid No 

21 4 Riochs Dream 1.94 SlAw Nush Sold off 
bench 

 Yes 

22 6 Raparee Times 1.91 SlAw Blkd  2200 Yes 
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Heat 7            Result: 1-3-5           Time: 29.66              Distances: 7.5L-2.5L      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
23 1 Little Robber 1.91 Fan Ald 2500 1200 No 

24 3 Home Dolly 1.97 SlAwRnon  750 Yes 

25 5 Riochs Girl 1.92 EvAw Outp Sold off 
bench 

 Yes 

 
Heat 8            Result: 4-2-6      Time: 29.82         Distances:  SH-13L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

26 2 Hithene Tagg 1.82 QAW OUTP 1250 700 No 

27 4 Dance Shay 1.91 EvAw Finwll 1000 500 No 

29 6 Part of the System 1.92 EwAw IMP   No 

 
Heat 9            Result: 1-3-5       Time:  29.98            Distances:  1L-.5L    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
28 1 Minnies Dilala 1.92 EvAw Finwll  1500 800 No  

30 3 Little Titan 1.82 Qaw Outp  750 Yes 

32 5 Energise Boy 1.99 SlAw Nvsh  No bid No 

 
Heat 10           Result:6-4-2        Time:   30.08           Distances:  3L-4L  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
33 2 Raparee Concorde 1.88 Faw FD  350 Yes 

34 4 Larkins Pet 1.96 Slaw Rnon  500 Yes 

35 6 Whitefield Helen 1.84 Evaw Finwll  650 Yes 
 

Heat 11           Result: 5-1-3          Time: 30.23             Distances:   SHD   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
36 1 Dance Zenek 2.00 Slaw Finwll  450 Yes 

37 3 Memories Light 1.92 Slaw Nush  350 Yes 

38 5 Whiskey Chic 1.85 Qaw Styd  No bid No 

 
Heat 12           Result: 4-6-2          Time:   29.66         Distances  9L- 0.5L  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
39 2 Macrock Lupa 2.03 EvAw Nush  No bid No 

40 4 Lickfinn Yank 1.93 Faw Ald 3000 1900 No 

41 6 Energise Lad 2.04 Slaw Rnon  300 Yes 
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Heat 13           Result:   5-3-1       Time:     29.91     Distances:    3L -3L    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
43 1 Larkins Pride 1.83 Faw Fd  No bid No 

44 3 Doubtful Cruise 1.92 EvAw Rnon  300 Yes 

45 5 Up The Bridge 1.87 Qaw Finwll  600 Yes 
 

Heat 14           Result:   4-6-2        Time:  30.02       Distances:    7.5L – 1.5L    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
46 2 Hasty Passion 1.94 SlAw Nush  No bid No 

47 4 Altesse Awesome 1.88 EvAw Finwll 2000 1100 No 
48 6 Whitefield May 1.79 Faw OUTP 450 300 No 
 
Heat 15            Result:  1-5-3         Time:30.15      Distances: 3.5L -4.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

49 1 Beach Boy 2.02 EvAw Finwll 1500 850 No 

50 3 Seans My Boy 1.83 Faw Fd  No bid No 

51 5 Jesses Desire 1.91 SlAw Rnon  No bid No 

 
Heat 16            Result:4-6-2          Time:    29.99        Distances: 7 L – 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
53 2 Cloneen Mollie 1.87 EvAw Nush  No bid No 

54 4 Clondoty Ellie 1.91 SlAw Finwll  550 Yes 

55 6 Private Cait 1.93 Faw OUTP  550 Yes 
 

Heat 17           Result: 5-1-3         Time:29.69        Distances: 9L- 9.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
57 1 Piercestown  Mile 1.89 EvAw Styd  450 Yes 

59 3 Dukesland Ivy 2.05 Slaw Nush  No bid No 

60 5 Ascot Charlie 1.75 Faw Ald  1800 Yes 

 
Heat 18           Result: 6-4-2         Time: 29.70         Distances: 1.5L – 1.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
61 2 Ballinabola Buzz 1.97 Slaw Rnon  700 Yes 

62 4 Marlfield Kylie 1.80 Faw Evch  1800 Yes 
63 6 Brooklyn Express 1.81 Qae Styd 3000 1600 No 

 
Heat 19           Result: 5-1-3    Time: 29.84         Distances: .5L – 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
65 1 Sideshow Heather 1.86 Faw Evch  500 Yes 

66 3 Lickfinn Dandy 1.91 Qaw Outp  No bid No 

67 5 Drombane Beauty 1.84 Qaw Finwll  1000 Yes 
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Heat 20           Result:4-2-6         Time: 29.63         Distances:  5L- 12.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
68 2 Lively Turkey 1.78 Qaw Outp 100 400 No 

69 4 Sideshow Rambo 1.82 Faw Finwl 2000 1100 No 

70 6 MemoriesVienna 1.94 EvAw Nush  No bid No 
 

Heat 21           Result:1-5-3          Time:   30.15                Distances:10.5L Dis  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

71 1 Lucky Gypsey 1.94 Evaw Ald  300 Yes 

72 3 Chanters Champ 1.88 Evaw Ko  No bid No  

73 5 Lowesgreen Flyer 1.89 EvAw Blkd  No bid No 

 
Heat 22            Result:  6-4-2             Time: 29.86          Distances:  0.5L- 2.5L-  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

74 2 Photo Marshal 1.82 EvAwStyd Did not go 
on bench 

 No 

77 4 Larkfield Daisy 1.75 FawEvch  1400 Yes 

79 6 Clais Alainn 1.92 SlAw Finwll  1150 Yes 

 
Heat 23            Result: 1-3-5         Time:29.92          Distances: 1.5L – 5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
80 1 Marlfield Reyes 2.01 Qaw Finwll  700 Yes 

81 3 Ballinabola Pet 1.97 Faw Euch  No bid No 

83 5 Born to Rule 1.98 EvAwNush  No bid No 
- 

Heat 24           Result: 6-4-2         Time: 29.37                    Distances: 6L- 7.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
85 2 Blue Moonlight 1.92 Faw Fd  No bid No  

86 4 Paris Lark 1.93 SlAwRnon  450 Yes 

88 6 Granada Rover 1.88 EvAw Finwll  2800 Yes 

 
Heat 25           Result:  3-5-1                    Time: 29.61                  Distances: 2L- 14L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
91 1 Mikes Wood 1.89 EvAw Nush  No bid No 

92 3 Captain Beag 1074 Faw Ald  No bid No 
93 5 Final Recess 1.91 EvAw Std  750 Yes 
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Heat 26           Result: 4-6-2                    Time:    29.76                Distances: 6L – 6.5L  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

Y/N 
94 2 Penang Dream 1.87 Faw Fd  400 Yes 

95 4 Frances Rumble 1.87 Qaw Finwll  1000 Yes 

97 6 Franks Castle 1.98 Slaw Rnon  Not 
presented 
for sale 

No 

 
Heat 27           Result:   5-2                  Time:   29.83                 Distances:         
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 2 Carneys Breeze 1.92 Slaw Finwll  300 Yes 

31 5 Airmount Trish 1.80 Faw Ald  2200 Yes 
        

 
Heat 28           Result:5-2                  Time: 32.28                  Distances:      10.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
7 2 Rockview Katrina 4.62 Faw Outp  not 

presented 
for sale 

No 

99 5 Pleasant Peter 4.68 Faw Finwl  Not 
presented 
for sale 

No 

        
 

 
Heat 29            Result:5-1-3             Time: 18.39          Distances: 3-L SH 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
56 1 Toonreek Lane  Evaw Finwll  No Bid  No 

58 3 Altesse Finesse  Faw Finwll 1000 No Bid No 
89 5 Shoeless Slippy  Faw Ald  350 Yes  

 


