
Heat 1            Result:3-5-1        Time: 29.54  Distances:   1-5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

1 1 FOCAL EILE  Slaw Ran on 500 500 yes 

2 3 Whitehart Lass  Faw Ald 950 950 yes 

3 5 Buster Gift  Evaw Ran on 1300 1300 yes 

 
Heat 2            Result:   3-1-5   Time:   29.46  Distances:      0.50-8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

4 1 Da Rebel Winner  Faw Evch 900 900 yes 

5 3 Denwood Black  Faw Ran on 2300 2300 yes 

7 5 Sarahs Ruby  Slaw Outp.  220 yes 

 
Heat 3            Result: 1-3-5     Time: 29.53             Distances:      4-5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
8 1 Rabbits Penny  Faw Ald 900 900 yes 

9 3 Madam Farloe  Faw Evch 500 500 yes 
10 5 Boolteens Uisce  Slaw Outp. 300 300 yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:  5-1-3            Time:   29.86           Distances:     9-1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 1 Scholes Hillside  Wide Blkd.  300 yes 

12 3 Whitehart Jessie  Blk 1 Outp Not put Up for  sale 

13 5 How Bizarre  Blk 1 Ran on 2600 2600 yes 
 

Heat 5            Result:  3-5-1           Time: 29.26        Distances: 7-2      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 1 Da Rebel Treble  Evaw Evch 700 700 yes 

15 3 Ahanagran Katie  Evaw Finwl 1650 1650 yes 
16 5 No Charge  Faw Evch 800 800 yes 

 
Heat 6            Result: 5-1-3           Time:29.40                  Distances:    5- 1   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
17 1 Taras Gem  Evaw Ranon 600 600 yes 

18 3 Bronogue Scholes  Faw Faded 850 850 yes 

20 5 Oldinn Piper  Evaw Finwl 6000 3500 NO 
 

Heat 7            Result: 1-5-3           Time:   29.62            Distances:   8-4    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
21 1 Posh Fantasy  Faw Ald 1250 1250 yes 

23 3 Corcarina Girl  Blk 1 Faded   No bid 

24 5 Bridge Bar  Blk 1 Ran on 500 500 yes 

 



Heat 8            Result: 3-1-5      Time:   29.83       Distances:  1-5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

25 1 No Fancy  Faw Evch 300 300 yes 

26 3 Magical Okee  Faw Ran on Not put On  sale 

27 5 Nuke Venus  Evaw Blk 3   No Bid 

 
Heat 9            Result: 5-1-3       Time:   29.19           Distances:  6-1    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
28 1 Oldinn Abbey  Faw evch 600 600 yes 

29 3 Ballysheedy Celt  Slaw Finwl 400 400 yes 

30 5 Makeitnowthen  Evaw Finwl 2500 2500 yes 
 

Heat 10           Result:  3-1-5      Time:   29.76           Distances:      4-2  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
31 1 Hail Fantasy  Faw Evch 650 650 yes 

32 3 Undercover Kitty  Evaw Finwl 1000 550 no 

33 5 Kilfinny Gift  Faw Evch   No bid 

 
Heat 11           Result:  1-3-5         Time: 29.45             Distances:  9-4    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
34 1 Clonlusk Savings  Faw Ald 2000 2000 yes 

35 3 Headleys Darkie  Evaw Outp 550 550 yes 

36 5 Nuke Flair  Evaw Outp   No bid 

 
Heat 12           Result:3-1-5           Time:  29.72          Distances:   1-4     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 1 Seafood Star  Evaw Evch 900 350 no 

38 3 Tullig Bridge  Evaw Ranon 2500 1600 no 

39 5 Kilfinny Model  Slaw Ranon 450 450 yes 

 
Heat 13           Result: 5-1-3         Time: 29.32        Distances:  6-2      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 1 Bettyville Betty  Evaw Evch 600 600 yes 

41 3 Selinas Daisy  Slaw Outp   No bid 
42 5 Ballysheedy Ice  Evaw Finwl 3000 3000 yes 

 
Heat 14           Result:1-5-3          Time:29.70        Distances:    3-5    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
43 1 Find the Star  Faw Ran on 450 450 yes 

44 3 Winnies Captain  Slaw Ranon 400 400 yes 
45 5 Spritely Lady  Evaw Ran on 650 650 Yes5 
        



 
Heat 15            Result: 5-3-1          Time:29.45      Distances: 2-1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

46 1 Bane Sarah  Evaw Evch 1500 800 yes 

47 3 Gilti Loco  Faw Evch 450 450 yes 

48 5 Killeavy Prince  Evaw Finwl   No bid 

 
Heat 16            Result:3-1-5          Time:  29.45          Distances: 1.5  -  hd 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
50 1 Commander  Faw Evch 700 700 yes 

51 3 Youvbeentangoed  Evaw Finwl 1200 700 no 

53 5 Youre wonderful  EVaw Finwl 300 300 yes 
 

Heat 17           Result: 3-1-5         Time:29.04        Distances: 8  - 0.50 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
55 1 Undercover Nina  Evaw Outp 800 300 no 

56 3 Banner Droopy  V Faw Ranon 1800 1800 yes 

57 5 Tictac Magic  Evaw Outp 800 500 no 

 
Heat 18           Result: 3-1-5         Time: 29.12         Distances:12-1  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
58 1 Bettyville Spice  Evaw Outp   No bid 

59 3 Laganore Jim  Faw Ran on 3000 3000 yes 
61 5 Grapevine  Evaw Ran on   No bid 

 
Heat 19           Result: 1-5-3    Time: 29.39         Distances:4 - 1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
63 1 Tally Ho Lady  Faw Ranon 750 750 yes 

65 3 Ballyfolion mobhi  Blk 3 Ran on 1500 650 NO 

66 5 Banner Flyer  Blk 3 Finwl 450 450 yes 
 

Heat 20           Result: 5-1-3         Time: 29.19         Distances:  7-1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
67 1 Black Knight  Evaw Ran on 600 600 yes 

68 3 Lurriga Rapid  Slaw Ran on 350 350 yes 

70 5 Vito Paws  Faw Ran on 1500 1500 yes 
 

Heat 21           Result: 3-5-1         Time: 29.09                  Distances: 1-9 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

71 1 Shanbara Tavern  Faw Faded   No bid 

72 3 Honesty  Faw Ald 2000 1000 yes 

73 5 Ballyfolion Top  Evaw Finwl   No bid 



 
Heat 22            Result:   3-1-5           Time: 29.54          Distances:  0.0  -  hd 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

74 1 Goforitlass  Evaw Evch 600 600 yes 

75 3 Lame Duck  Evaw Ranon 1800 900 no 

76 5 Carhumore Joy  Evaw Ranon 650 650 yes 

 
Heat 23            Result: 5-3-1         Time: 29.32          Distances: 0.50 - 6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
77 1 Comogue Owl  Evaw Evch 250 250 yes 

79 3 Cherrokee Joe  Evaw Ran on 500 500 yes 

80 5 Malbay Ranger  Evaw Finwl 3000 1500 no 

 
Heat 24           Result:3-1-5          Time:  29.38                   Distances: 0.75  -  4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
81 1 Christines Champ  Evaw Finwl 1000 500 no 

83 3 Hilight Mourinho  Faw Ran on 1100 1100 yes 

85 5 Comogue Raven  Slaw Ran on 200 200 yes 

 
Heat 25           Result:3-5-1                      Time:  29.26                 Distances:  4-3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
86 1 Rockbarton Mobhi  Evaw Evch   No bid 

90 3 Jasons Flight  Evaw Finwl 1050 1050 yes 
94 5 Ashling Go Home  Evaw Finwl 300 300 yes 

 
Heat 26           Result:1-5-3                     Time:  29.04                  Distances: 6- hd 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
95 1 Dog Ban  Faw Ranon 2000 1050 yes 

96 3 Doonbeg Preview  Evaw Evch 400 400 yes 

97 5 Inagh Hippie  Evaw Evch 600 600 yes 
 

Heat 27           Result: 3-5-1                    Time:    29.02                Distances:   8 - 3      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
100 1 Mail Road KYLIE  Evaw Ran on Not put Up for sale 

101 3 Hey Petunia  Faw Ran on   No bid 
102 5 Three Louders  Evaw Ran on 300 300 yes 

 
Heat 28           Result:  4 - 2                 Time:29.55                   Distances:    5    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
103 2 Sunrise Smasher  Evaw EVch 200 200 yes 

104 4 Sarah Maire  Faw Ran on Not put Up for sale 
        

 



 
Heat 29            Result: 2-4             Time:29.51          Distances: Dist  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
105 2 Selinas Leader  Faw Ran on 350 350 yes 

6 4 Malbay Garfield  Pulled up 450 450 yes 
        

 
Heat 30           Result:solo              Time: 40.19               Distances:         

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
49 3 Headleys Cross  SOLO 900 900 YES 

        

        
 

Heat 31           Result:   5-3-1              Time: 16.71            Distances:    5-3   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
64 1 Fugal Maid  Blk.1 Ran on 150 150 yes 

78 3 Clonreddan Twink  Blk 1 Ran on   No bid 

87 5 China Cherry  Faw ald Not put Up for  sale 

 
Heat 32           Result:  2-4              Time:  16.45           Distances:     5  

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
88 2 Mucha LuCHA  Faw Ran on 2000 2000 yes 

106 4 Onnies Trade  Evaw Evch   No bid 

        

 
Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        



* No presented for sale 


