Heat 1 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.87 Distances: 15 hd

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2 Handsome Fair 523 | Slawranon 300 YES

3 Woodfield trish 5.08 | Faw held on 500 YES

4 5 M akeminagordan 5.11 | Evaw evch NOT PUT | UPFOR | SALE
Heat 2 Result: 1-5-3 Time 29.24 Distances. 6, 6

Lot | Trap | NAME Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
5 1 Kyle Storm 505 | Fawad 2000 YES

6 3 Liquid Romance 5.09 | Evaw Faded NO BID
7 5 Barntick Teri 5.27 | Slaw Finwl 2500 900 NO
Heat 3 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.48 Distances. 5- 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
8 2 Rathkerin Tom 5.18 | Evaw Ranon 1300 YES

9 4 Magical Madge 516 | Evaw Evch 900 450 NO

10 6 Honcho fox 5.14 | Evaw Faded NO BID
Heat 4 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.25 Distances. 4-5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 2 Collanoran Black 514 | Fawranon 1500 YES

12 4 Handsome Babe 5.24 | Evaw Evch 400 YES

13 6 Blue Paws 5.22 | Evaw Evch 900 YES
Heat 5 Result: 5-3-1 Time 2919 Distances. 5-9

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 1 Quick Madam 5.16 | Evaw Faded | NOT PUT | UPFOR | SALE

15 3 Rylands Jack 499 | Faw Faded 900 YES

16 5 Ballysheedy Rock 5.09 | Faw Finwl 2300 YES
Heat 6 Result:2-6-4 Time: 29.61 Distances. 0.50 - 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 2 Barntick lvy 5.14 Evaw Ranon 650 YES

18 4 Malden maor 5.28 Slaw ranon | NOT PUT | UPFOR | SALE

19 6 Mikes Darling 5.19 Evaw Evch 450 YES
Heat 7 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 28.98 Distances. 3-4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
20 |1 FionntraDove 5.07 | Evaw finwl 900 YES

21 |3 Our One Only 492 |V Fast Away 2700 YES

22 |5 Dixies Choice 5.09 | Evaw Ranon | 1000 500 NO




Lot |Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 Broken Bay 5.00 | Faw Ranon 2300 YES

25 Double Impact 5.03 | Faw Faded 450 YES

26 6 Ballysheedy Minx 5.15 | Evaw Outp 300 YES
Heat 9 Result: 1-5-3 Time 29.57 Distances. 3-6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
27 1 Coolscart Popeye 511 |Fawblk 1 1500 500 NO

28 3 Great Day 508 | Fawblk1 500 YES

29 5 Anhid Scholes 520 | Slaw Ranon 1000 YES
Heat 10 Result: 3-1-5 Time 29.60 Distances. 8-1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
30 2 Oracle 543 | Slaw Blk 300 YES

32 4 Paorachs flyer 518 | Fawranon 950 YES

35 6 Kyle Dawn 541 | Slaw Blk Not put Upfor |sde
Heat 11 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.00 Distances. 10-8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 1 Malbay Kovu 5.09 | Faw Faded 550 yes

37 3 Pubonthecorner 5,01 | Faw Finwl 2400 yes

38 5 Matty Oge 510 | Faw faded 900 yes
Heat 12 Result: 5-3-1 Time 29.60 Distances. hd -4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
39 1 Hurry Mule 5.14 | Evaw Faded No bid
41 3 Bunny Face 5.07 | Faw Evch 750 yes

42 5 Cailin Liath 5.22 | Slaw Finwl 500 yes
Heat 13 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.25 Distances. 0.50-5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
43 1 Steeple Rd Jo 511 | Evaw Finwl 500 yes

44 3 Sokewell 498 | Faw Ranon 1400 yes

46 5 Rathea Fortune 511 | Evaw Outp 450 yes

Heat 14 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.47 Distances. Hd -8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
47 |2 Y orktown Pride 5.09 | Faw Faded 300 yes

48 |4 Jolly Gossip 5.09 | Faw Ranon 500 yes

49 |6 Kyle Vision 5.18 | Evaw Finwl 1100 yes




Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
50 Cherrygrove Enya 5.10 | Evaw Blk No bid
51 Glandore hill 501 | Faw Ald 2000 800 no

53 6 Glorious hero 5.17 | Evaw Blk 2500 2000 YES
Heat 16 Result 3-1-5 Time:29.16 Distances. 8 - 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
54 1 Statisticain 520 | Slaw Ranon 600 YES
56 3 Clonregan yankee 5.06 | Faw Ald 1900 YES
57 5 Shes A brick 5.16 | Evaw Evch 300 yes

Heat 17 Result5.-3-1 Time :29.35 Distancesl.5 - hd
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
58 1 Winfield Admiral 529 | Slaw finwl Not put Up for sde
59 3 Ballyabbey Pats 5.16 | Evaw ranon 700 yes
60 5 Great Power 5.17 | Evaw Ranon 800 yes
Heat 18 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.35 Distances: 3L-3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
61 2 Cam Control 5.17 | Evaw Evch No bid
62 4 Shanid Fairy 5.09 | Evaw Finwl Not put Up for sde

63 6 Jims Best Pick 5.02 | Faw Evch 1800 600 no

Heat 19 Result: 2-4 Time: 29.49 Distances 5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
64 2 Undercover Maid 5.21 | Evaw Finwl 400 yes

65 4 Pobals Rose 511 | Evaw Evch 1000 yes

Heat 20 Result: 4-2 Time: 29.41 Distances. 6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
66 2 Silvergrove Jo 511 | Evaw Evch No bid
68 4 Malbay Dash 5.02 | Faw Finwl 2000 1000 no

Heat 21 Result: 3 Time: 16.77 Distances:. solo trial

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
52 |3 Near Quebec 400 yes
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* No presented for sale




