
Heat 1            Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.58  Distances:   1 - 8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

2 1 Ballinveala Zeta  Faw Ran on 850 850 yes 

3 3 Foileann Agassi  Evaw Faded 300 300 yes 

4 5 Kennmc Monica  Evaw Finwl 750 750 yes 

 
Heat 2            Result: 5-3-1   Time: 29.30    Distances:   5 – 1.5   
Lot   Trap NAME Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

5 1 Bypass Jenny  Evaw Faded 600 600 yes 

6 3 Well Disquised  Blk Ran on 750 750 yes 

7 5 Rocking Vieri  Evaw Ld 2 2000 2000 yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:   5-3-1   Time:29.31     Distances: 6 - 12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
8 1 Cloughtany Kiwi  Faw Outpaced 100 100 yes 

9 3 Knocktoosh Madam  Slaw Ran on 1000 1000 yes 
10 5 Thanks John  Faw Ald 1600 1600 yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:3-1-5            Time: 29.84          Distances 1-3:    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 1 Hondo Drift  Faw Wide 1 550 550 yes 

12 3 Danisyourman  Blk 1 Ran on 800 800 yes 

13 5 Gibbonstown Rose     No bid 
 

Heat 5            Result:   5-1-3         Time: 29.32        Distances:    1-3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 1 Soviet Jewel  Evaw Finwl 1350 1350 yes 

15 3 Tuogh Socks  Slaw Finwl 400 1500 no 
16 5 Makemineagordin  Faw Ald 1200 1200 Yes 

 
Heat 6            Result:1-3-5      Time:29.48    Distances:  10-3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
17 1 Knocktoosh Boy  Faw Ald 2000 2000 yes 

19 3 Lemonfield Gypsy  Evaw 
Outpaced 

400 400 yes 

21 5 Miss Kelly  Evaw Outp 300 300 yes 
 

Heat 7            Result:  5-1-3   Time:  29.58   Distances:   0.50 - 2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
22 1 Soviet Shannon  Evaw Ran on 1600 1600 yes 

23 3 Gibbonstown Blue  Evaw Ran on 700 700 yes 

24 5 Coolacalrig Star  Evaw ran on 2000 1000 no 

 



Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

25 1 No Joke Brandy  Evaw Finwl 1500 1300 Yes 

27 3 Airfield Carmel  Faw Ald 1350 1350 yes 

28 5 Giveusashout  Evaw Ranon 2200 2200 yes 

 
Heat 9            Result:  1-3-5    Time29.01      Distances:    6-12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
29 1 Rackethall Ace  Faw Ald 4800 4800 yes 

31 3 Castleview Rose  Evaw Ran on 1200 1200 yes 
32 5 Pery Square  Slaw Outp   No Bid 

 
Heat 10           Result:  1-5-3    Time   29.26      Distances:  1.5 - 6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
34 1 Ensure Control  Faw Ald 2500 1000 no 

35 3 Earls Mentor  Slaw Outp 400 400 yes 

37 5 MaLDEN MAJOR  Evaw Ran on   No Bid 

 
Heat 11           Result:   5-1-3     Time:    29.04      Distances:  12  -  hd 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
38 1 Fortune Joe  Slaw Ran on 400 400 yes 

39 3 Shyan Seanie  Faw Faded   No Bid 

41 5 Latin Verse  Evaw Ld2 4300 4300 yes 

 
Heat 12           Result: 3-5-1        Time 29.22     Distances:   4 -2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
42 1 Supa Night  Slaw Ran on   No bid 

43 3 Fionntra Eagle  FaW Ald 1500 1500 yes 

44 5 Bettyville Bond  Faw ran on 450 450 yes 

 
Heat 13           Result:    5-1-3     Time:  29.09       Distances:   14  -  1     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
46 1 Sierra Boy  Evaw Outp Not put Up for sale 

47 3 No Joke Deano  Evaw Outp 300 300 yes 

48 5 Varra Butterfly  Faw Ald 1800 1800 yes 
 

Heat 14           Result:  3-5-1         Time:  29.21      Distances:   0.50  -8   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
49 1 Ill Sort it  Evaw Outp 950 950 yes 

50 3 Tubber Tiger  Faw Ald 2600 2600 yes 
51 5 Gaovaun  Faw Ran on 1100 1100 yes 
 
 



Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

53 1 Lissaroon Major  Evaw Ran on 700 500 no 

54 3 Brickhill cruz  Evaw Ran on 800 800 yes 

55 5 Get Focused  Evaw Outp 800 650 yes 

        

 
Heat 16            Result 1-5-3      Time:     29.39       Distances: 5 – 0.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
58   1 Browny Points  Evaw Finwl 1250 1250 yes 

59 3 Brownies Model  Evaw Ran on 500 500 yes 

60 5 I’ve no money  Faw Faded 500 500 yes 
 

Heat 17           Result2-4         Time:29.56        Distances: 3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
64 1 Blanemore Direct  Evaw Finwl 700 650 yes 

67 3 Hobbs Cross  Faw Faded 600 400 no 

 5       

 
* No presented for sale 


