Heat 1 Result:3-5-1 Time:29.64 Distances: 12 - 4
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 1 Athlacca Rio 5.15 | Evaw blk Nobid | No
3 Kyle Star 5.19 | Evaw Finwl €1650 Yes
5 Margie Merrydare |5.17 | Evaw Blk €300 Yes
Heat 2 Result:1-5-3  Time: 29.87 Distances: 1 - 6
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 1 Ballysheedy Glen 5.28 | Evaw Ranon €1100 Yes
3 Now Now Sally 5.56 | Slaw Ran on Nobid | No
9 5 AthLacca Arrival 5.19 | Evaw Evch €750 Yes
Heat 3 Result: 3-1-5 Time 29.63 Distances Hd 3
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
10 1 Scala King 5.00 | Faw Faded €5000 €2200 Yes
11 3 Bedford Leader 5.27 | Evaw Finwl €950 Yes
12 5 Spot the Droopy 5.16 | Evaw Evch €600 Yes
Heat 4 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.60 Distances Nk 3
Lot | Trap Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 1 Jo Lark 5.01 | Faw Evch €1950 Yes
15 3 Xpert Diamond 5.03 | Faw Nvsh €2500 €1200 No
16 5 Ballysheedy Cole 5.41 | Slaw Ran on €900 Yes
Heat 5 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.76 Distances: 1.5 - 1.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 1 Malbay Thumper 5.33 | Slaw Ranon €600 Yes
18 3 Killeavy Knight 5.31 | Slaw ran on €900 Yes
19 5 Sweetest Pal 5.37 | Slaw Ran on €300 Yes
Heat 6 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 30.84 Distances Hd - Hd
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
20 1 Black Toffee 5.30 | Slaw Wide O.T.B €300 Yes
21 3 Scala Blond 5.37 | Slaw Blk €2500 €1600 No
22 5 Cabriol Ciara 5.36 | Slaw Ranon | O.T.B €300 Yes
Heat 7 Result:1-3-5 Time: 29.98 Distances: 0.50 - 5§
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
23 1 Ears Jon 5.15 | Faw Ran on €800 Yes
24 3 Wits End 5.24 | Evaw Evch €300 Yes
25 5 Quarrymount Inny 5.18 | Faw Faded €450 Yes




Heat 8 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.11 Distances: 9 1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
26 1 Vito Maud 5.41 | Slaw ranon €800 Yes

27 3 Banner Mackosi 5.15 | Evaw evch €500 Yes

28 5 Gold Susie 499 | Vfaw Ranon €3600 Yes
Heat 9 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.65 Distances: 5 5§

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
29 1 Judes Minnie 5.22 | Evaw evch No Bid | No

30 3 Amandas Magic 5.18 | Evaw FinWl €750 Yes

33 5 Killeavy Colleen 5.22 | Evaw Blk 3 NOBid | No
Heat 10 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.64 Distances: 2 9

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
35 1 Duallys Scholes 5.35 | Slaw ranon €600 Yes

37 3 Cabriol Lillia 5.40 | Vslaw Nobid | No

38 5 Family Marie 5.27 | Evaw FinW1 €850 Yes
Heat 11 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.97 Distances: 6 0.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
39 1 West hill 5.22 | Evaw ranon €500 Yes

40 3 Clonreddan Best 5.19 | Evaw Blk €350 Yes

41 5 Anhid Kristin 5.47 | Vslaw €300 Yes
Heat 12 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.87 Distances: 2 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
42 1 Kyle Mike 5.23 | Evaw evch €750 Yes

43 3 Toems Spiral 5.23 | Evaw evch No Bid | No

44 5 Malbay Lisa 5.47 | Evaw Fin WI €800 Yes
Heat 13 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 30.20 Distances: 2.5 2.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
46 1 Cabriol Sheree 5.24 | Evaw evch No bid No

47 3 Hes No Lemon 5.26 | Evaw evch O.T.B €300 Yes

48 5 Joes Runner 5.27 | Evaw Evch €300 Yes

Heat 14 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.95 Distances: 3 7

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
49 2 Come Home Rapid 5.22 | Evaw Ranon €450 Yes

53 4 Right Rambler 5.20 | Evaw blk €500 Yes

55 6 Busy Body 5.22 | Evaw blk Nobid | No




Heat 15 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.51  Distances: 1 12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
61 1 Tina is Charming 5.15 | Faw ranon €2000 €800 No

62 3 Omega Tag 5.25 | Evaw Outp NoBid | No

63 5 Burnpark Slick 5.12 | Faw ranon €800 Yes
Heat 16 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 30.04 Distances: 8 dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
65 1 Dooey Di Caprio 5.52 | Vslaw Ns No
66 3 Seans Madra 5.21 | Evaw Ranon €600 Yes
69 5 Omega Joy 5.23 | Evaw Evch No Bid | No
Heat 17 Result: 1-3-5 Time:29.88 Distances: 0.5 0.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
72 1 Caretaker 5.12 | Faw ranon €700 Yes
73 3 Burnpark Kay 5.18 | Faw Evch €450 Yes
74 5 Oscar Mate 5.31 | Slaw Ranon €300 Yes
Heat 18 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.39 Distances: 10 0.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
75 1 Stormy Tom 5.16 | Evaw FinWI €1700 Yes

76 3 Cragaknock posh 5.37 | Slaw Outp €800 Yes

80 5 Beaming Wisdom 5.21 | Evaw evch €600 Yes
Heat 19 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.24 Distances: 9 7

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
81 1 Black Intruder 4.99 | Vfaw Ranon €1600 Yes

82 3 Ballydaly Chip 5.11 | Faw ranon €500 Yes

83 5 Stormy Intrepid 5.29 | Slaw ranon No Bid | No
Heat 20 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.24 Distances: 9 7

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
84 1 Granada Blue 4.98 | Vfaw ranon €1200 Yes

85 3 Purple Turtle 5.09 | Faw evch O.T.B €300 Yes

86 5 Polar Miller 5.19 | Evaw Outp NBid No
Heat 21 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.93 Distances: 3 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
87 2 Dinnies Dawn 5.14 | Evaw Evch N Bid No

88 4 Emebriki 5.09 | Faw ranon €600 Yes

89 |6 Ballydaly Bond 5.26 | Evaw Evch | O.T.B €300 Yes




Heat 22 Result: 4-2 Time: 28.92 Distances: Dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
90 2 Shots Dinky 5.33 | Slaw Outp €2000 €1000 No
93 4 Demesne Ace 5.10 | Evaw FinWlI €3400 Yes
Heat 23 Result: 2-4 Time: 29.84 Distances: 0.5
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
94 2 Rafalution F ranon €700 Yes
96 4 Tullagower Dream Faw €600 Yes
Heat 24 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 17.05 Distances: 1 hd
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 1 Xpert Jewel Evaw ranon | €2000 No bid | No
54 3 Mohane Dreamer Faw ranon €450 Yes
56 5 Glenmalure Lad Faw ranon €350 Yes
Heat 25 Result: 3-1 Time: 16.85 Distances: 14
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 1 Glenmalure Hiker NS NBid No
67 3 Oyster Champion Faw €350 Yes
Heat 26 Result: 1-3 Time: 17.68 Distances: HD
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
68 1 Glenlower Dossie NBid No
77 3 Oyster Law Nbid No




