

**Heat 1      Result:1-5-3      Time: 29.28      Distances: 10-5**

| Lot | Trap | Name            | Split | Remarks   | Reserve | Bid  | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|-----------------|-------|-----------|---------|------|----------|
| 1   | 1    | Newbridge Alice |       | Faw Ald   | 2600    | 2600 | yes      |
| 2   | 3    | Dilton Wine     |       | evaw Evch |         |      | No bid   |
| 3   | 5    | Supa Moment     |       | Evaw Evch | 400     | 400  | yes      |

**Heat 2      Result: 1-5-3      Time: 29.47      Distances: 1 -10      =**

| Lot | Trap | Name           | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid  | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|----------------|-------|------------|---------|------|----------|
| 4   | 1    | Rambos Beauty  |       | Faw Ald    | 1100    | 1100 | yes      |
| 6   | 3    | Ardant Hill    |       | Evaw Blk   |         |      | No bid   |
| 7   | 5    | Oldmill Weasel |       | Evaw Finwl | 400     | 400  | yes      |

**Heat 3      Result: 5-3-1      Time: 29.47      Distances: 0.50 - 12**

| Lot | Trap | Name          | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid  | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|---------------|-------|------------|---------|------|----------|
| 8   | 1    | Tee Cee       |       | Evaw Outp  |         |      | No bid   |
| 9   | 3    | Willies Fancy |       | Faw Evch   | 2000    | 550  | no       |
| 10  | 5    | Glad All Over |       | Evaw Finwl | 1100    | 1100 | yes      |

**Heat 4      Result: 1-5-3      Time: 29.75      Distances: 1.5-1.5**

| Lot | Trap | Name         | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|--------------|-------|------------|---------|-----|----------|
| 11  | 1    | Ongoing Feud |       | Faw Ald    | 500     | 500 | yes      |
| 12  | 3    | Bua Weem     |       | Evaw Finwl | 500     | 500 | yes      |
| 13  | 5    | Flying Lark  |       | Evaw Finwl | 500     | 500 | yes      |

**Heat 5      Result: 3-5-1      Time: 29.94      Distances: 2 - 3**

| Lot | Trap | Name          | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|---------------|-------|------------|---------|-----|----------|
| 14  | 1    | Let Slip      |       | Evaw Faded | 300     | 300 | yes      |
| 15  | 3    | Derry Honcho  |       | Faw Ald    | 650     | 650 | yes      |
| 16  | 5    | Mohican Brody |       | Slaw Finwl |         |     | No bid   |

**Heat 6      Result: 3-5-1      Time: 29.44      Distances: 5 - 10**

| Lot | Trap | Name         | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid  | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|--------------|-------|------------|---------|------|----------|
| 17  | 1    | Clipper Blue |       | Evaw Blk   | 300     | 300  | yes      |
| 18  | 3    | Varra rover  |       | Faw Ald    | 2100    | 2100 | yes      |
| 19  | 5    | Silky Pride  |       | Evaw Finwl | 950     | 950  | yes      |

**Heat 7      Result:5-1-3      Time: 29.49      Distances: 8 - 5**

| Lot | Trap | Name           | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid    | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|----------------|-------|------------|---------|--------|----------|
| 20  | 1    | Jumping Queen  |       | Slaw Ranon |         |        | No bid   |
| 23  | 3    | Coshlea Breeze |       | Stumb      | Not put | Up for | sale     |
| 25  | 5    | Pretty Lark    |       | Faw Finwl  | 1500    | 1000   | no       |

**Heat 8      Result: 1-3-5      Time: 29.19      Distances: 10 - 4**

| Lot | Trap | Name           | Split | Remarks   | Reserve | Bid  | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|----------------|-------|-----------|---------|------|----------|
| 26  | 1    | Rough flight   |       | Faw ald   | 1750    | 1750 | yes      |
| 27  | 3    | Hino Harry     |       | Evaw Outp | 2000    | 2000 | yes      |
| 28  | 5    | Clipper Honcho |       | Evaw Outp |         |      | No bid   |

**Heat 9      Result:3-1-5      Time: 29.39      Distances: 6**

| Lot | Trap | Name            | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid    | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|-----------------|-------|------------|---------|--------|----------|
| 31  | 1    | Princess blondy |       | Evaw Ranon |         |        | No bid   |
| 33  | 3    | Glin Scholes    |       | Faw Ranon  | 1500    | 1000   | yes      |
| 35  | 5    | Vieri Blueboy   |       | DNF KO     | NOT PUT | UP FOR | SALE     |

**Heat 10      Result: 5-1-3      Time:29.63      Distances: 0.50 - 1**

| Lot | Trap | Name           | Split | Remarks     | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|----------------|-------|-------------|---------|-----|----------|
| 36  | 1    | Wiggy Lark     |       | Evaw Ran on | 1200    | 800 | no       |
| 37  | 3    | Georid Picture |       | Evaw ranon  | 300     | 300 | yes      |
| 38  | 5    | Toms Noble     |       | Faw evch    | 850     | 850 | yes      |

**Heat 11      Result: 3-5-1      Time: 29.39      Distances: 1 - 7**

| Lot | Trap | Name            | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid  | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|-----------------|-------|------------|---------|------|----------|
| 40  | 1    | Reacashla Cross |       | Evaw Outp  | 300     | 300  | yes      |
| 41  | 3    | Cahirown Slaney |       | Evaw Ranon | 1250    | 1250 | yes      |
| 42  | 5    | Malbay Rumble   |       | Evaw finwl | 1500    | 850  | no       |

**Heat 12      Result: 1-3-5      Time: 29.61      Distances: 1 - 14**

| Lot | Trap | Name         | Split | Remarks     | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|--------------|-------|-------------|---------|-----|----------|
| 43  | 1    | Islandea Lad |       | Evaw finwle | 1500    | 750 | no       |
| 44  | 3    | Krasimir     |       | Faw Evch    | 950     | 950 | yes      |
| 45  | 5    | Vieri View   |       | Evaw Nvsh   |         |     | No bid   |

**Heat 13      Result: 1-3-5      Time: 29.19      Distances: 8 - 8**

| Lot | Trap | Name             | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid  | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------------------|-------|------------|---------|------|----------|
| 46  | 1    | Black Abbey Gill |       | Evaw finwl | 3500    | 1600 | yes      |
| 47  | 3    | Woodville Honcho |       | Faw Evch   | 400     | 400  | yes      |
| 50  | 5    | Docs Girl        |       | Evaw Outp  |         |      | No bid   |

**Heat 14      Result: 5-1-3      Time: 29.59      Distances: 8 - 3**

| Lot | Trap | Name         | Split | Remarks    | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|--------------|-------|------------|---------|-----|----------|
| 48  | 1    | Quick Honcho |       | Evaw Ranon | 400     | 400 | yes      |
| 51  | 3    | Be Careful   |       | Faw Evch   |         |     | No bid   |
| 52  | 5    | Fremen       |       | Evaw Finwl | 900     | 900 | yes      |



**Heat 22      Result:                      Time:                      Distances:**

| <b>Lot</b> | <b>Trap</b> | <b>Name</b> | <b>Split</b> | <b>Remarks</b> | <b>Reserve</b> | <b>Bid</b> | <b>Sold Y/N</b> |
|------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|----------------|------------|-----------------|
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |

**Heat 23      Result:                      Time:                      Distances:**

| <b>Lot</b> | <b>Trap</b> | <b>Name</b> | <b>Split</b> | <b>Remarks</b> | <b>Reserve</b> | <b>Bid</b> | <b>Sold Y/N</b> |
|------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|----------------|------------|-----------------|
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |

**Heat 24      Result:                      Time:                      Distances:**

| <b>Lot</b> | <b>Trap</b> | <b>Name</b> | <b>Split</b> | <b>Remarks</b> | <b>Reserve</b> | <b>Bid</b> | <b>Sold Y/N</b> |
|------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|----------------|------------|-----------------|
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |

**Heat 25      Result:                      Time:                      Distances:**

| <b>Lot</b> | <b>Trap</b> | <b>Name</b> | <b>Split</b> | <b>Remarks</b> | <b>Reserve</b> | <b>Bid</b> | <b>Sold Y/N</b> |
|------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|----------------|------------|-----------------|
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |

**Heat 26      Result:                      Time:                      Distances:**

| <b>Lot</b> | <b>Trap</b> | <b>Name</b> | <b>Split</b> | <b>Remarks</b> | <b>Reserve</b> | <b>Bid</b> | <b>Sold Y/N</b> |
|------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|----------------|------------|-----------------|
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |

**Heat 27      Result:                      Time:                      Distances:**

| <b>Lot</b> | <b>Trap</b> | <b>Name</b> | <b>Split</b> | <b>Remarks</b> | <b>Reserve</b> | <b>Bid</b> | <b>Sold Y/N</b> |
|------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|----------------|------------|-----------------|
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |

**Heat 28      Result:                      Time:                      Distances:**

| <b>Lot</b> | <b>Trap</b> | <b>Name</b> | <b>Split</b> | <b>Remarks</b> | <b>Reserve</b> | <b>Bid</b> | <b>Sold Y/N</b> |
|------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|----------------|------------|-----------------|
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |
|            |             |             |              |                |                |            |                 |

**Heat 29      Result:                  Time:                  Distances:**

| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------|-------|---------|---------|-----|----------|
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |

**Heat 30      Result:                  Time:                  Distances:**

| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------|-------|---------|---------|-----|----------|
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |

**Heat 31      Result:                  Time:                  Distances:**

| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------|-------|---------|---------|-----|----------|
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |

**Heat 32      Result:                  Time:                  Distances:**

| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------|-------|---------|---------|-----|----------|
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |

**Heat 33      Result:                  Time:                  Distances:**

| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------|-------|---------|---------|-----|----------|
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |

**Heat 34      Result:                  Time:                  Distances:**

| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------|-------|---------|---------|-----|----------|
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |

**Heat 35      Result:                  Time:                  Distances:**

| Lot | Trap | Name | Split | Remarks | Reserve | Bid | Sold Y/N |
|-----|------|------|-------|---------|---------|-----|----------|
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |
|     |      |      |       |         |         |     |          |

\* No presented for sale