

Heat 1 Result:1-5-3 Time: 29.45 Distances: 8 - 3

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
1	1	Supa Colour		Faw Ald	1000	1000	yes
2	3	Lemonfield Jesse		Faw Faded	Not put	Up for	sale
3	5	Stormy Mia		Slaw Finwl	500	300	yes

Heat 2 Result:5-3-1 Time: 29.88 Distances: 0.50 - 1

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
4	1	Spark Guard		Faw Evch			No bid-
5	3	Liscahane Peg		Slaw Finwl	500	500	yes
7	5	Clonlusk Spark		Faw Ran on	2000	1100	no

Heat 3 Result: 1-3-5 Time 30.36 Distances 3 - 10

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
9	1	Fawning Miss		Blk 1 Ald	800	450	no
10	3	Seans Princess		Blk 1 Faw			No bid
11	5	Supa Music		Slaw Blk 3		250	yes

Heat 4 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 30.13 Distances nk - 4

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
12	1	Bruis Magid		Faw Finwl	800	300	no
16	2	Burnpark Becky		Evaw	500	500	yes
18	3	Bresheen Pepper		Evaw	350	350	yes

Heat 5 Result:1-5-3 Time: 30.10 Distances: 2 - Dist

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
20	1	Mrs Scholes		Evaw Blk 3	300	300	yes
21	3	Clonlusk Times		Faw ran on	800	800	yes
23	5	Cherio Cherio		Evaw Blk 3	300	300	yes

Heat 6 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.73 Distances 4 - 1

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
-----	------	------	-------	---------	---------	-----	----------

22	1	Dacango Joe		Evaw Ran on	1100	1100	yes
24	3	Malbay Guard		Evaw Evch	500	500	yes
25	5	Cyprus Lolly		Evaw Evch	Not put	Up for	sale

Heat 7 Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.34 Distances: 4 - 0.50

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
26	1	Letter Scholes		Evaw Ran on			No bid
27	3	Clounanna Black		Faw Finwl	1700	1700	yes
28	5	Rockland Impact		Evaw Ran on	800	800	yes

Heat 8 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.54 Distances: 8-8

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
29	1	Fishermans Lu Lu		Evaw Outp	Not put	Up for	sale
30	3	Spooky Tracy		Evaw Finwl	Not put	UP FOR	sale
31	5	Comogue Chucky		Faw Ald	900	900	yes

Heat 9 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.35 Distances: nk - 1

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
32	1	Balreask Girl		Faw Finwl	1000	1000	yes
33	3	Glynnscross Nuv		Slaw Finwl	1500	1500	yes
34	5	Lickadoon Kerry		Faw Hld on	3000	1000	no

Heat 10 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 30.04 Distances: 6 - 4

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
37	1	Cluain Arra		Evaw Ald	400	400	yes
38	3	Cherrygrove Mojo		Blk 1 Outp			No bid
39	5	Mixed Audience		Blk 1 Finwl	300	300	yes

Heat 11 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.58 Distances: 3 - 1

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
41	1	Star of Saleen		Slaw Finwl			No bid
44	3	Glenduff Ash		Faw Ald	2500	800	no

47	5	Shaunas Cry		Slaw Finwl	Not put	Up for	sale
----	---	-------------	--	------------	---------	--------	------

Heat 12 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.25 Distances: 1.5 - 1.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
49	1	Lemonfield Daisy		Evaw Ran on	1500	800	no
51	3	Saleen Lucy		Evaw Finwl			No bid
52	5	Rushaun Dasher		Faw Ran on	5000	3300	no

Heat 13 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.30 Distances: 1.5 - 6

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
53	1	Lady Graldine		Faw Ran on	1500	700	no
54	3	Goldmine Crumlin		Evaw Finwl	3000	2500	no
56	5	Castleview Dawn		Evaw Outp	Not put	Up for	sale

Heat 14 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.62 Distances: 4 - 5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
57	1	Sarges Bambi		Faw Ald	500	500	yes
58	3	Rathanny Rose		Slaw Finwl	1000	600	yes
59	5	Saleen Niki		Slaw Outp	Not put	Up for	sale

Heat 15 Result: 3=1=5 Time:29.66 Distances: hd - nk

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
60	1	Liscahane Vieri		Faw Finwl	1000	350	no
61	3	Barntick Honcho		Evaw Evch	2000	1200	no
62	5	Coolygorman Lark		Evaw Evch	Not put	Up for	sale

Heat 16 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.47 Distances: 5 - 3

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold Y/N
63	1	Samaron		Ld	850	850	yes
64	3	Castleview Kate		Evaw	Not put	Up for	sale
66	5	Megan Ranger		Faw Blk 1	Not put	Up for	sale

Heat 17 Result: 4-2 Time:29.66 Distances: 3

