Heat 1 Result: 4-6-2 Time 29.55 Distances: 2L & 8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 Star Cash Fly 3.63| Slaw, Blk 1 No Bid No

2 Leemount Molly 3.56| Mid, Finwl €1,450 Yes

3 6 Hitchcock 3.47 | Qaw, Ld3 €500 Yes
Heat 2 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 30.04 Distances: 3L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 2 Whitethorn Fancy 3.51] Qaw, Ald €300 Yes
5 4 Barleycove Plan 3.63 Slaw, RnOn * NO

6 6 Not Convinced 3.56| Mid, Imp RIi €600 Yes
Heat 3 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.60 Distances: 5L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 2 An Lon Dubh 3.50| Qaw,Ald €1,200 Yes
8 4 Coomlogane Pearl 3.59 Mid, P 600 300 NO
9 6 Humming N Hawing 3.82| Slaw A 3rd * NO

Heat 4 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.87 Distances. NK, 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
10 2 Knockeen Hippy 3.52| Qaw,Cmag €600 Yes
11 4 Barna Gift 3.57 | Mid, Ld Nrl €600 Yes
12 6 Cavalier King 3.65| Slaw, A3rd €600 Yes
Heat 5 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.22 Distances. 6L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
13 2 Leemount Nik 3.54| Ep, Ald €2,100 Yes
14 4 Shan Rica 3.58/ Bmp, Mid €700 Yes
15 6 Butterbridge Dot 3.62| Slaw, Ri,RU * NO

Heat 6 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.55 Distances. 2L, 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
16 2 Villiers Legend 3.54| StbTp, Finwl €2,800 Yes
22 4 Bonnie Rocky 3.45| Qaw, Ld3 €900 Yes
23 6 Common Vieri 3.62| Evaw, Fd €250 Yes
Heat 7 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.951 Distances: 0.5L, Nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
24 2 Leemount Ita 3.47 Qaw, FdRi €850 Yes
27 | 4 Clongeel Fire 3.60 Slaw, Finw €700 Yes

28 6 Talavara Time 3.51 Qaw, Blk 2 €1,100 Yes




Heat 8 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.67 Distances. 4L, 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

29 2 Blue Fire Lady 3.56| Ep, Fd €300 Yes

30 4 Nohoval Princess 3.53 BmpRu, €1,350 Yes
RnON

32 6 Prospect Vieri 3.60[ Slaw, RnOn €300 Yes

Heat 9 Result: 6-4-2 Time 29.88 Distances. 5L, 1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

33 2 West Cork Train 3.65| CrdRu,Blk 1 * NO

34 Lakenalooha 3.65| CrdRu, Blk(1 €400 Yes

35 6 Paddock Hill 3.62| Clrrn, RnOn €450 Yes

Heat 10 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.38 Distances: 2L 4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

36 2 Mikos Sadie 3.60| Slaw, RnOn €2,400 Yes

38 4 Farnalough Zoe 3.60 Slaw, RnOn 300 600 NO

39 6 Strawberry Days 3.51 Qaw, Styor €1,700 Yes

Heat 11 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.61 Distances: 1L,10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

40 2 Talavara Chief 3.74| Slaw,A 3rd €350 Yes

43 4 Gleaming Emily 3.58| Ep, Cmag €1,050 Yes

44 6 Cooly Hawk 3.63| Slaw, ChIRi €700 Yes

Heat 12 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.14 Distances. 3L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

45 2 Mountleader Ewan| 3.52 Ep, Ld3 €2,500 Yes

47 4 West Cork Clon 3.71| Slaw, A 3rd €200 Yes

48 6 Glasha Daisy 3.61 Mid, Finwl €4,800 Yes

Heat 13 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.52 Distances: 3L, 2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

49 2 Witches Petal 3.71 Slaw, Finw| €1,550 Yes

50 4 Talavara Jack 3.49 Qaw,Ald €2,400 Yes

52 6 Huntsman Blueboy 3.53 Ep, Fdri €400 Yes

Heat 14 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 2941 Distances. 3L, 6L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N

53 | 2 Dillons Lad 3.55 Ep, Ald €2,100 Yes

55 | 4 Midian Tots 3.63 BmpruRnor €1,250 Yes

56 6 Boher Vieri 3.70, Ba Blkru No Bid NO




Heat 15 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.22 Distances: 4L, 5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 Satin Sam 3.68| Slaw, Rnon €4,800 Yes
59 Talavara Breeze 3.59 Evaw, Fd No Bid No
62 6 Silverdale Black 3.44) Qaw,Styon €2,100 Yes
Heat 16 Result: 6-4-2  Time: 29.79 Distances: Nk,3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
63 2 Gouland Ketchup 3.77|  Slaw, Rnon €1,200 Yes
64 4 Leeview Yank 3.44| Qaw,Evch €1,250 Yes
65 6 Gleaming Carly 3.55| Mid, Finwl €600 Yes
Heat 17 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.41  Distances. Nk,3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
67 2 Maglass Magic 3.44| Qaw,Ald €1,300 Yes
68 4 Bridepark Jake 3.52| Mid,Chlri €1,500 Yes
69 6 Dylanbenlara 3.53| Evaw,Rnon 1000 500 NO
Heat 18 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 28.994 Distances. 12L,3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
70 2 Satin Major 3.39| Faw, Styon €9,200 Yes
71 4 Mams Gold 3.57| Evaw, CIrRn No Bid NO
72 6 Mountkeeffe Tom 3.57| Evaw, CIrn €1,400 Yes
Heat 19 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.26 Distances: Nk & 4L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
74 2 Goulane Dubha 3.48 Qaw,Fdri 3000 1800 NO
75 4 Nusadua Princess 3.60  Crdru,Finwl €2,200 Yes
76 6 Bearhaven Zoro 3.48 Qaw,Evch €1,000 Yes
Heat 20 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.13 Distances. 8L & 8L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
77 2 Ballintore Ash 3.53| Evaw,Fd 600 300 NO
78 4 Hawaii Helper 3.59| StbTp,Rnorn €600 Yes
79 6 OAkfront Bombero 3.46| Qaw,Styon €4,100 Yes
Heat 21 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.48 Distances. 7L & 1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
83 2 Arcade Fire 3.66 Slaw,Rnon €500 Yes
86 4 His Dream 3.42 Qaw,Ald €1,400 Yes
87 |6 Ashville Smokey 3.57 Ep,Fd €700 Yes




Heat 22 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.56 Distances. Hd,2L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
88 2 Punch Bowl Drink 3.62| Slaw,Rnon €850 Yes
92 4 Coolowen Rommell| 3.43 Ep,Blk2 €900 Yes
93 6 Hi Bruce 3.64 | Mid, Finwl €400 Yes
Heat 23 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 30.95 Distances: 111, 3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
94 2 Cos Cleite 3.59 Evaw,Susp * NO
96 4 Sailing Spirit 3.56 Evaw, Imp 1 €300 Yes
97 6 Prospect Mo 3.97 Stbtp, Blk 1 * NO
Heat 24 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.64 Distances. 2L & 4L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
99 2 Stop In Milltown 3.54| Ep,Chl €550 Yes
100 | 4 Coolmakee Hawk 3.60 Evaw,Fd No Bid No
101 | 6 Paddock Dancer 3.67  Mid,Finwl 1,500 600 No
Heat 25 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.36 Distances. 0.5L & Dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
102 | 2 Blakefield Rapid 3.54| Evaw,ChIRi 2,000 800 No
103 | 4 Black Rowder 3.55| Evaw,Finwl 1,000 300 No
104 | 6 Witches Jack 3.700 Slaw No Bid No
Heat 26 Results: 6-4-2 Time: 29.46 Distances. 3L & 8L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
105 | 2 Jamas Pearl 3.60 Mid, Fd No Bid  No
109 | 4 Huntsman Patch 3.70  Slaw, Rnon 2,000 950 No
110 | 6 Goulane Control 3.48 Ep, Ald €550 Yes
Heat 27 (330) Result: 6-4-2 Time: 18.10 Distances. 6L & 3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
41 2 Radisson Switch - Evaw,CIrRr] No Bid No
54 4 Gleaming Felix - Evaw CIrRn * No
90 6 Derryclough Jo - Qaw,Finwl €500 Yes
Heat 28 (750) Result: 2-4 Time: 43.32 Distances. 0.5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
19 2 Nohoval Prince - Hldon 2,000 1,200 No
26 | 4 Reagrove Gent - Chlri €750 Yes

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 29 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 30 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N




* No presented for sale



