Heat 1 Result: 2-6-4  Time:29.68 Distances: Nk, 5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 Nohoval Rose 3.52] Mid, Finwl €1,000 Yes
2 Dooneen Hazel 3.65 Slaw, A 3rd €300 Yes

3 6 Fins Hero 3.51| Qaw, LdRu €300 Yes O/B
Heat 2 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.23  Distances: 2L, 8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 2 Diageo Maria 3.57| Crd, Fd No Bid No

5 4 Victory Blonde 3.64 | Slaw, Rnon €1,30C Yes O/B
6 6 Robstown Shadow 3.45 Qaw, Ald 3,000 €1,500 Yes
Heat 3 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.75 Distances: 4L, NK

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
9 2 Elegant Air 3.51| Ep,BIk3 €500 Yes
10 4 Leaha Nikita 3.59| Bmp 3,Rnon 1,500 900 NO
11 6 Gilti Lark 3.46 | Qaw, Ald 2,000 700 NO
Heat 4 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.35 Distances: 4L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
12 2 Nohoval Charm 3.65| Slaw Rnon €300 Yes
13 4 Brave Betsy 3.52| Ep, Ald €1,400 Yes
14 6 Victory Returns 3.66| Slaw, RnOn €1,300  Yes
Heat 5 Result: 2-6-4 Time 29.10 Distances. 2L,5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
15 2 Manners Slaney 3.54 Mid, Finwl €1,00( Yes
16 4 Tell Me Inca 3.51| Ld,Fd €700 Yes
18 6 Mountkeeffe Lark 3.63| Slaw,RnOn €1,100 Yes
Heat 6 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.60 Distances. 5L, 10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 2 Jadadyam 3.58 Slaw,CIrRn No Bid NO
24 4 Kiel Valley 3.51 | Mid,Finwl €1,200 Yes

31 6 Tuckeys Chance 3.48 Qaw,VW * NO
Heat 7 Result: 4-6-2 Time 29.87 Distances. 1L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
32 2 Wardlease Prince 3.56 Clrn, A 3rd No Bid NO
36 4 Berehaven Aoife 3.48 Qaw, Hldon No Bid | NO
38 6 Donal The Yank 3.51 Blk1, Chlrii 2,000 €1,200Yes




Heat 8 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 28.90 Distances. 3L, 4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
39 Bayside Barney 3.52 Ld,Crd No Bid NO
40 Nancys Warrior 3.45| Qaw,Bmp|[L €600 Yes
41 6 Conna Bullet 3.54| Mid,Finwl 4,000 €1,400 NO
Heat 9 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.13 Distances. 3L, Dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
42 2 Absolutely Mad 3.59 * NO

43 4 Good Shot 3.48| Ep,Ld1 €1,55( Yes
46 6 Barna Basher 3.54 Mid, Finwl €2,00( Yes
Heat 10 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.26 Distances. 5L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
48 2 Ryecourt County 3.65| Slaw, RnOn No Bid NO
49 4 Go Sugar Go 3.58 Mid, P No Bid NO
51 6 Homestead Road 3.52 Ep, Ald 2,500 1,100 NO
Heat 11 Result: 4-2-6 Time 2891 Distances. 5L, 8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
53 2 Dash In Front 3.64| Slaw, BIk 3] 2,500 1,000 NO
54 4 Forgetmenot 3.48| Mid, Finwl 4,500 €2,800 Yes
55 6 Market James 3.44 Ep,Ld * NO
Heat 12 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.34 Distances. 10L, 6L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
56 2 Walking Street 3.60| Ld,Fd No Bid NO
57 4 Understandable 3.68 Slaw, Bmp €300 Yes

58 6 Gagas Glory 3.62| Mid, Finwl €1,000 | Yes
Heat 13 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.65 Distances. Nk, 3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
62 2 Newline Luck 3.48 | Crd, RnOn 1,000 500 NO
63 4 Bauravilla Shep 3.49  Wri, Chlri €1,000 Yes
64 6 Chada 3.38| Faw, Hidon 800 300 NO
Heat 14 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.25 Distances. 9L ,Nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
69 2 Milko 3.70| Bmp,RnON 700 450 Yes O/B
70 | 4 Pluckanes Sue 3.54 Bmp, Finwl €1,600 Yes
72 | 6 Commendable 3.68 Bmp, Rnon €700 Yes




Heat 15 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.39 Distances: 3L, Nk
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
74 Clashduff Forest 3.56 Ep,Crd1 €500 Yes
75 Broadacres Ivan 3.52 W4, Styon €600 Yes
86 6 Kilmoney Ground 3.61| Slaw, Finwl NoBid NO
Heat 16 Result: 4-6-2  Time: 29.09 Distances: 7L, 6L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
87 2 Schully Run 3.61| Slaw, Nvshw €100 Yes O/E
91 4 Thonogue Bridge 3.47| Mid, Finwl 2,000 €1,000 esYO/B
92 6 Witches Spratt 3.39] Faw, Ld?2 €500 Yes
Heat 17 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 28.93 Distances. 4L, Dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
93 2 Shanaknock Ash 3.68 Slaw, RnOn No Bid NO
94 4 Southwind Tango 3.520 Ep, Finwl 3,000 €2,500 es©O/B
95 6 Alright Faith 359 | Blk1 No Bid NO
Heat 18 (330) Result: 2-4 Time: 18.22 Distances: 2L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
20 2 Leaha Gamble Evaw, Finwl €400 Yes
34 4 Black Tuxedo Evaw, Chl No Bid] No
6
Heat 19 (330) Result: 4-2 Time: 18.27 Distances: 3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
73 2 Witches Elliot Evaw, Chl 800 400 NO
81 4 Shanaknock Range Wri,Finwl 1,000 400 NO
Heat 20 Result: Time Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 21 Result: Time Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6




Heat 22 Result: Time Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 23 Result: Time: Distances.
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 24 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 25 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 26 Results: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 27 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
Heat 28 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 29 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 30 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N




* No presented for sale



