
-Heat 1            Result: 6-4-2      Time:28.79              Distances : 7L & 2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

1 2 Coomlogane Ronan 3.54 Ep, Fd  €700 Yes 

2 4 Ballybrack Tango 3.60 Slaw, RnOn  €1,200 Yes 

3 6 Mountleader Helm 3.51 Qaw, Styon  €7,300 Yes  

 
Heat 2            Result: 6-2-4                Time :  29.07     Distances : 7L, 10L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

5 2 Victory Honcho 3.64 Ld, Mid 1,500 €850 Yes O/B 

7 4 Genuine Active 3.70 Slaw, Bmp 1  €300 Yes  

8 6 Canadian Willie 3.67 Mid, Finwl  €6,300 Yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:   4-2-6  Time: 29.28    Distances:    5L, 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
9 2 Clohur Cross 3.50 Ep, Blk 1  €500 Yes  

11 4 Lauragh Alonso 3.47 Qaw,Clrrn  €2,700 Yes 
13 6 Effernogue Carol 3.47 Qaw, Blk 1  €450 Yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:  2-6-4          Time:   29.31      Distances:     3L,8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 2 Tell Me Jack 3.62 Slaw, Rnon  €1,450 Yes  

16 4 Shift Jamella 3.49 Qaw,VW  N/B No 

17 6 Bearhaven Inca 3.56 Mid, P  €1,000 Yes 
 

Heat 5            Result: 6-2-4       Time:  29.00  Distances:    10L, 2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
18 2 Blooming Kewell 3.54 Mid, P  €550 Yes 

19 4 Inchydoney Ciara 3.64 Slaw, A 3rd  €300 Yes 
20 6 Leamlara Fox 3.50 Qaw, Ald   €3,100 Yes 

 
Heat 6            Result: 2-6-4     Time:    29.31       Distances:     4L, 12L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
22 2 Final Day 3.53 Ld 1, Styon  €800 Yes 

23 4 Clohur Star 3.61 Slaw, Nvshw 1,000 500 NO 

24 6 Effernogue Susan 3.50 Ep, Ld  €450 Yes 
 

Heat 7            Result:  6-2-4     Time:    29.29      Distances:     1L,2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
25 2 Murphys Kewell 3.52 Mid, Chlri  €600 Yes 

27 4 Unknown Comet 3.51 Mid, Fdri 2,500 €2,200 Yes O/B 

28 6 Jackys Dance  3.46 Qaw, Cmag  €1,100 Yes 

 



Heat 8            Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.52    Distances:  2L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

29 2 Sams King 3.57 Mid, P 1,000 €800 Yes O/B 

30 4 Lazy Kewell 3.53 Mid, Finwl  €700 Yes 

35 6 Effernogue Tracy 3.45 Qaw, Ld  €450 Yes 

 
Heat 9            Result:  2-6-4     Time:  29.23      Distances:     0.5L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
36 2 Easttobawnleigh 3.66 Slaw, Finwl  €1,400 Yes 

37 4 Abbey Court 3.41 Qaw, Ld3  €950 Yes 

38 6 Unknown Again 3.57 Mid, Chlri  €1,900 Yes 
 

Heat 10           Result:  6-4-2 Time:  29.17       Distances:    5L,12L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
39 2 Sweeping Change 3.59 ClrRn, Fd  €300 Yes 

40 4 Civil Head 3.60 Slaw,Rnon  €1,350 Yes 

41 6 Prince Turbo 3.48 Qaw,Ald  €1,500 Yes 

 
Heat 11           Result: 6-2-4    Time:  29.31       Distances:  6L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
42 2 Mor Mo Ghlor 3.57 Blk 1, RnOn  €1,100 Yes 

45 4 Paddock Cruiser 3.61 Slaw, Blk 1  No Bid No 

47 6 Lochbo Woods 3.54 Mid, Finwl  €1,050 Yes 

 
Heat 12           Result:  2-6-4               Time:    28.92                Distances:     Nk, 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
48 2 Blue Calador 3.48 Mid, Finwl  €3,600 Yes 

49 4 Ballinclare Haze 3.49 Mid, P 3,000 1,000 No 

50 6 Dow Jones 3.41 Qaw, Ld  €1,200 Yes 
 

Heat 13           Result: 2-6-4             Time:  29.47           Distances:    6L, Nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
51 2 Galdar Rebel 3.43 Qaw, Ald  €900 Yes 

52 4 Me Daza 3.67 Slaw, RlRu  €300 Yes 

53 6 Travara Katie 3.52 Mid, P   €500 Yes 
 

Heat 14           Result: 6-4-2                    Time:  29.13            Distances:  0.5L,9L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
54 2 Lady Helita 3.52 Crd1, Fd  €500 Yes 

55 4 Paddock Flyer 3.50 Mid, Chlri  €1,200 Yes 
56 6 Glandore Jack 3.45 Qaw,Hldon  €850 Yes 
 



Heat 15            Result:  4-6-2           Time: 29.39  Distances : 3L, Nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

57 2 Broadmill Track 3.57 ClrRn, A 3rd  €350 Yes 

58 4 Pluckanes Mike 3.53 Mid, Chlri 1,500 €1,200 Yes O/B 

59 6 Murdaniel Rebel 3.44 Qaw, Ald  €600 Yes 

 
Heat 16            Result: 6-2-4    Time: 29.21     Distances: 6L, 5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
62 2 Corranstone Cash 3.62 Slaw, Rnon  €300 Yes 

63 4 Saoirses Fancy 3.61 Slaw, Fd  N/B No 

64 6 Brothers Unite 3.54 Ep, Ald 2,500 1,800 No 
 

Heat 17           Result: 2-4-6              Time: 30.01         Distances: Nk, Dist 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
67 2 Shebeen Beag 3.59 Mid, HldOn  * No 

68 4 Fornaught Lark 3.56 Mid, Chlri  No Bid No 

69 6 Broadmill Dec 3.52 Qaw  No Bid NO 

 
Heat 18           Result: 6- 2-4                    Time: 29.28    Distances:  3L,1L  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
70 2 Sunvalley Billy 3.63 Slaw, RnOn 1,000 €450 Yes SOB 

71 4 Troublesome Chic 3.58 Ep, Fd  €650 Yes 
73 6 Mild Hurricane 3.47 Qaw, Ald  €1,650 Yes 

 
Heat 19             Result: 4-2     Time :  28.99        Distances : 6L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
75 2 Seans Byway 3.58 Slaw,RnOn  €300 Yes 

76 4 Four Twos 3.37 Faw,Styon  €1,600 Yes 

        
 

Heat 20 (550)          Result:   Solo                       Time: 30.74    Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
26 2 Kittys Kewell 4.83 Qaw, Sty  €600 Yes 

 4       

 6       
 

Heat 21 (330)         Result: 6-4-2    Time: 17.97                                    Distances: 5L , 6L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

10 2 Valentine Sonia  Evaw, ClrRn  No Bid No 

33 4 Anns Champ  Evaw,ClrRn  €900 Yes 

43 6 Glandore Kev  W,Hldon 1,000 €300 No 

 



Heat 22            Result:         Time:     Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

 2       

 4       

 6       

 
Heat 23         Result:    Time:     Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       

 6       

 
Heat 24           Result:              Time:                            Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       

 6       

 
Heat 25           Result:                          Time:                              Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       
 6       

 
Heat 26             Results :                       Time:                            Distances:     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        
 

Heat 27            Result:                           Time:                             Distances:       
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       
        

 
Heat 28           Result:                   Time:                   Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

* Not Presented for Sale 
 



Heat 29            Result:              Time:           Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 
Heat 30           Result:               Time:                Distances:         

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        
 

Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

* No presented for sale 


