
-Heat 1            Result: 4-2-6      Time:29.50              Distances : Nk & 0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

3 2 Knockeen Jazz 3.80 Slaw, Chlri  €1,200 Yes 

4 4 Leemount Captain 3.61 Ep, Hldon  €1,100 Yes 

5 6 Homestead Sunset 3.74 Slaw, Rnon  €1,350 Yes  

 
Heat 2            Result: 2-4-6                Time :  29.43     Distances : 7L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

7 2 Danielles Peer 3.51 Qaw,Styon  €1,800 Yes 

8 4 Oilean Rebel 3.58 Mid, P  €400 Yes  

9 6 Take No Chance 3.64 Slaw, Clrn  €300 Yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:   2-6-4  Time: 28.70    Distances:    10L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 2 Kefcar Guest 3.53 Qaw,Ald  €9,000 Yes 

12 4 Malden Breeze 3.67 BmpRu, A3rd  €500 Yes 
13 6 Boola Susie 3.57 Ep, A2nd  €450 Yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:  4-2-6          Time:   29.24      Distances:     3L,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 2 Knockeen Wasp 3.56 Mid, P  €1,000 Yes  

15 4 Belindas Floss 3.46 Faw,StyOn  €3,000 Yes 

19 6 Homestead Dusk 3.49 Faw,Crd 1  €600 Yes 
 

Heat 5            Result: 6-2-4       Time:  29.04  Distances:    8L, 7L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
20 2 Looking Great 3.55 Ep, A 2nd 1,600 €1,250 Yes 

22 4 Victory Top 3.61 Slaw, A 3rd  N/B NO 
23 6 Early Night 3.46 Faw, Ald   €7,000 Yes 

 
Heat 6            Result: 6-2-4     Time:    29.18       Distances:     3L, 5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
24 2 Kefcar Owen 3.58 Ep, Bmp 1  €800 Yes 

25 4 Cavies Cool 3.65 Slaw, Crd  €300 Yes 

26 6 Scartlea College 3.63 Mid, Finwl  €2,050 Yes 
 

Heat 7            Result:  6-2-4     Time:    29.95     Distances:     1L,Dist 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
27 2 Caring Customer 3.65 Bmpru,Chlri  €1,300 Yes 

29 4 Leeview Yank 3.69 Slaw,KO2 1,000 600 NO 

30 6 Toposh Toshare 3.51 Qaw, Ald  €500 Yes 

 



Heat 8            Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.21     Distances:  6L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

32 2 Scala Smokey 3.49 Faw,Styon  €1,750 Yes  

34 4 Betchers Boni 3.49 Faw,DspRu  €1,000 Yes 

36 6 Fire Height Peg 3.56 Mid, Finwl  €650 Yes 

 
Heat 9            Result:  2-6-4     Time:  29.56      Distances:     1L, 0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 2 Gormos Sandal 3.57 Mid, Hldon  €600 Yes 

38 4 Sandals Nora 3.51 Qaw,Crd 2,000 800 NO 

39 6 Leeview Magic 3.53 Qaw,Chl  €1,200 Yes 
 

Heat 10           Result: 4-6-2 Time:  29.76       Distances:    3L,5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
41 2 Trumpers Nosey 3.92 Stbtp,Rnon  No Bid No 

42 4 Scala Blond 3.70 Mid, Finwl  €850 Yes 

43 6 Limestone Hare 3.64 Ep,Ld  €300 Yes 

 
Heat 11           Result: 2-6-4    Time:  29.67      Distances: 10, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
44 2 Faisy Daisy 3.62 RL2,Rnon  €1,500 Yes 

46 4 Dripsey Cross 3.54 Qaw,Blk 2 N.P.U INJ. No 

47 6 Fire Height Ann 3.48 Faw,Blk 2  2,000 €2,000 Yes O/B 

 
Heat 12           Result:  4-6-2               Time:    29.62                Distances:     2L,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
49 2 Topstar Lad 3.59 Qaw, BmpRu  No Bid No 

50 4 Kiel Grove 3.65 Slaw, Rnon 1,000 500 No 

51 6 Charlo 3.59 Ep, Chl N.P.U INJ No 
 

Heat 13           Result: 6-4-2             Time:  29.74           Distances:    6L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
52 2 Citizen Allstar 3.53 Ep, W 1 *  NO 

55 4 Suspect Paddy 3.45 Faw, Imp 1  €450 Yes 

56 6 Dickmac Trey 3.56 ClrRn, RnOn   €450 Yes 
 

Heat 14           Result: 2-4-6                    Time:  29.22            Distances:  3L, 5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
60 2 Kefcar Ruby 3.63 Wru,Styon  €1,000 Yes 

61 4 Kiel Aras 3.51 Mid, P 1,000 700 NO 
62 6 Baldara Gemma 3.45 Faw, Crd 3  No Bid NO 
 



Heat 15            Result:  6-4-2           Time: 29.52  Distances : 5L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

63 2 Met Your Match 3.69 Blk 2,RnOn  €600 Yes 

65 4 Emphatic Style 3.71 Blk 1, RnOn  €750 Yes 

66 6 Newline Luck 3.49 Faw,Ald  €1,000 Yes 

 
Heat 16            Result: 4-6-2    Time: 29.48     Distances: 3L, 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
67 2 Carraig Stars 3.69 Slaw, A 3rd No Bid €100 Yes SOB 

68 4 Talavara Grace 3.50 Qaw, Ald  €1,000 Yes 

70 6 Cobh Lark 3.53 Ep, Chl  €400 Yes 
 

Heat 17           Result: 2-4-6              Time: 29.04       Distances: 10L,6L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
71 2 Lemon Quest 3.55 Mid, Finwl  €1,550 Yes 

72 4 Kefcar Rocket 3.44 Faw,Ld  €400 Yes 

73 6 Nowshesarebel 3.51 Ep,Fd No Bid €100 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 18           Result: 6- 2-4                    Time: 28.94    Distances:  12L,5L  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
74 2 Steady Molly 3.54 Mid,P  €400 Yes  

75 4 Try A Flutter 3.51 Ep,Fd *  NO 
76 6 Schofield Star 3.44 Faw,Styon  €2,050 Yes 

 
Heat 19             Result: 6-2-4     Time :  29.16        Distances : 2L & 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
77 2 Movealong Shay 3.38 Faw,Crmp  €1,700 Yes 

79 4 Ferryforth Hate 3.56 Evaw, A 3rd 1,000 €500 Yes 

80 6 Knockeen Story 3.53 Mid, Finwl  €1,150 Yes 
 

Heat 20            Result:   2-4                   Time: 29.97    Distances:  2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
81 2 Lydia Droopy 3.52 Qaw, ClrRn  No Bid No 

84 4 Rogaire Dubh 3.62 Slaw,RnOn  No Bid No 

 6       
 

Heat 21            Result: 4-2                Time: 29.20                  Distances: 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

85 2 Gingers Band 3.51 Ep,ClrRn No Bid €300 Yes SOB 

83 4 Kingdom Impact 3.46 Qaw,Ald  €1,200 Yes 

 6       

 



Heat 22 (330)           Result:2-4         Time: 17.98          Distances:  5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

57 2 Beanos Spike  Qaw,Ald  €1,050 Yes 

82 4 Ramble Back  Evaw,ClrRn  €300 Yes 

 6       

 
Heat 23         Result:    Time:     Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       

 6       

 
Heat 24           Result:              Time:                            Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       

 6       

 
Heat 25           Result:                          Time:                              Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       
 6       

 
Heat 26             Results :                       Time:                            Distances:     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        
 

Heat 27            Result:                           Time:                             Distances:       
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
 2       

 4       
        

 
Heat 28           Result:                   Time:                   Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

* Not Presented for Sale 
 



Heat 29            Result:              Time:           Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 
Heat 30           Result:               Time:                Distances:         

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        
 

Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

* No presented for sale 


